MINUTES OF THE
REGULAR MEETING OF THE

an ‘ BARTLESVILLE CITY COUNCIL
G B CITy Of . Monday, July 6, 2020
bO rﬂ eSVI l Ie Immediately following the
N CONNECTED/ 4 Bartlesville Municipal Authority
City Hall, Council Chambers beginning at 7 p.m.
401 S. Johnstone Avenue
Bartlesville, OK 74003 Mayor Dale Copeland

918-338-4282

MINUTES
(The Notice of Meeting was posted December 13, 2019 and the Agenda was posted July 2, 2020 at 5:00 p.m.)

City Council members present were Mayor Dale Copeland, Vice Mayor Alan Gentges, Mr. Jim
Curd, Jr., Mr. Trevor Dorsey and Mr. Paul Stuart.

City staff present were Mike Bailey, City Manager; Jess Kane, City Attorney; Jason Muninger,
City Clerk/CFO; Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water Utilities; Micah Siemers, Director of
Engineering; Shellie McGill, Director of the Public Library; Nancy Warring, Assistant City
Planner/Grants Administrator; and Elaine Banes, Executive Assistant.

1. Mayor Copeland called the Business Meeting of the City Council to order immediately
following the Bartlesville Municipal Authority meeting at 7:13 p.m.

2. Roll call was conducted and a quorum established.
3. Citizens to be heard.

Speaking in favor of mandating the wearing of face masks were Karen Wollman and
Madelyn Stuart.

Speaking in favor of not mandating the wearing of face masks was Dianna Molinari. She
stated that she was also speaking on behalf of DSR and owner John Bond.

4. City Council Announcements and Proclamations.

The Mayor recognized Luke Gallery, a Scout who was in attendance to earn his Citizenship
in Community Badge.

5. Authorities, Boards, Commissions and Committee Openings
e One opening on the Construction and Fire Code Appeals Board

Mayor Copeland read the opening and encouraged citizens to volunteer on City Committees.
Applications can be found at www.cityofbartlesville.org or at City Hall in the City Manager's
Office.

6. Consent Docket
a. Approval of Minutes
i.  The Regular Meeting Minutes of June 1, 2020.



b. Approval of Appointments and Reappointments to Authorities, Boards,

Committees and Commissions

i.  Appointment of Mr. Rick Loyd and Mr. Trevor Sutterfield for three-year terms on the
Bartlesville Library Trust Authority at the recommendation of Councilman Stuart.

ii. Appointment of Mr. Jay Webster to fill an unexpired term, and Ms. Stacey
Forseman for a three-year term on the Community Center Trust Authority at the
recommendation of Mayor Copeland.

iii. Reappointment of Ms. Cassie Haffner and Mr. George Halkiades to the Bartlesville
Library Trust Authority for additional three-year terms at the recommendation of
Councilman Stuart.

iv. Reappointment of Ms. Debbie Haskell to an additional three-year term on the Park
Board at the recommendation of Councilman Curd.

v. Appointment of Mr. Andy Dossett to fill an unexpired term on the City Planning
Commission at the recommendation of Vice Mayor Gentges.

. Approval of Resolution

i. Amending the budget of the City of Bartlesville, Oklahoma for Fiscal Year 2020-
2021, appropriating unanticipated private grant revenue for the Restricted
Revenue Fund.

. Approval of Agreements, Contracts, and Engagement Letters

i. Planned Service Renewal Agreements between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville
Public Library and Johnson Controls for the Library’s HVAC System.

ii. Exhibition and Loan Agreements between Cherokee Nation Business and the
Bartlesville Area History Museum/City of Bartlesville.

ii. Preventative Maintenance Agreement with Schindler Elevator Company and the City
of Bartlesville/Bartlesville Public Library for the period, July 1, 2020 — June 30, 2021.

iv. Airport Hangar Lease Agreement for the Bartlesville Municipal Airport between the
City of Bartlesville, ConocoPhillips Company and Robert Tedstrom.

vi. In-Kind Gift Agreement between ConocoPhillips Company and the City of
Bartlesville to provide vehicles for the Bartlesville Municipal Airport.

vii. An Agreement for OMMS to perform a Best Practices Review for the Bartlesville
Police Department.

viii. Project agreement and resolution with the Oklahoma Department of Transportation
for Job Piece Number 23170(11) constructing a right turn lane on US-75 to Eastland
Parkway.

. Approval of Proposal
i. Proposal submitted by Ambler Architects to create an architectural rendering of the
teen space addition in the Bartlesville Public Library.

Approval of Rural Water District Request
i. Request from Washington County Rural Water District #2 to add a benefit unit to the
District to serve an 0.83 acre tract at 24125 N 3967 Road in Washington County.

. Receipt of Bids
i. 2020-2021-002 Water and Wastewater Line Repair Materials
ii. 2020-2021-003 Water Treatment Chemicals
iii. 2020-2021-004 Cudahy Street Pavement Rehabilitation-Virginia to Santa Fe

Mayor Copeland read the consent docket in its entirety. Mr. Stuart pulled ltems 6.d.iv and vi.
So that he could recuse himself from voting since he is employed by ConocoPhillips.



Mr. Dorsey moved to approve the consent docket with the exception of Items 6.d.iv. and vi.,
seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Mr. Curd, Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Mr. Stuart then recused himself and left Council Chambers.

Vice Mayor Gentges moved to approve ltems 6.d.iv. and 6.d.vi., seconded by Mr. Dorsey.

Aye: Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Dorsey, Mr. Curd, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None

Recused: Mr. Stuart

Motion: Passed

Mr. Stuart re-entered the meeting after the vote.

. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2020-2021-002 for Water and
Wastewater Line Repair Materials. Presented by Councilman Curd.

Mr. Curd moved to award Bid No. 2020-2021-002 to the vendor who submitted the low bid
meeting specifications, which are highlighted within the attached bid tabulation, seconded by
Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Mr. Curd, Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None
Motion: Passed

. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2020-2021-003 for Water Treatment
Chemicals. Presented by Councilman Curd.

Mr. Curd moved to award Bid No. 2020-2021-003 to the vendor who submitted the low bid
meeting specifications, which are highlighted within the attached bid tabulation, seconded by
Mr. Dorsey.

Aye: Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mr. Curd, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None
Motion: Passed

. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2020-2021-004 Cudahy Street
Pavement Rehabilitation — Virginia to Santa Fe. Presented by Vice Mayor Gentges.

Vice Mayor Gentges moved to award Bid No. 2020-2021-004 to Jeff Graham Construction,
Collinsville, Kansas, in the amount of $340,734.50, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

A brief discussion was held about the project, and a timeline for start of the project was given
as mid-to-end of August 2020.

Aye: Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mr. Curd, Vice Mayor Gentges, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None



Motion: Passed

10.Public hearing to assess and discuss the City’s performance in the administration of

11.

the grant received from the State of Oklahoma for Fiscal Year 2018 CDBG Small Cities
Set-Aside Program and take possible action to approve a resolution formally
accepting the project as completed. Presented by Nancy E. Warring, Asst.
Planner/Grants Administrator.

Ms. Warring reported that one requirement of participation in the CDBG Small Cities Set
Aside Program is the holding of a final public hearing after completion of the project to
assess and discuss the City's performance in the administration of the grant. The City
received funding for FY 2018 in the amount of $67,962 which was used with matching city
funds in the amount of $76,786.44 for the construction of a playground and sidewalks near
the entrance to Johnstone Park. Over the past six years, the City has been improving the
south section of Johnstone Park with a pavilion, restrooms, improved vehicle access and a
parking lot. However, there was limited pedestrian access and no play equipment in this
section of the park. Therefore, the project funding was to install a playground and sidewalks.
Ms. Warring provided a presentation showing the completed playground in the shape of a
pirate ship, and the sidewalks.

Mayor Copeland opened the public hearing at 7:50 p.m. There being no one appear to
speak, Mayor Copeland closed the public hearing at 7:51 p.m.

Mr. Stuart moved to approve the resolution formally accepting the project as completed as
presented, seconded by Vice Mayor Gentges.

Aye: Mr. Dorsey, Mr. Curd, Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Stuart, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None

Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to approve a resolution calling and giving notice of

an upcoming election for City Council Representatives for all wards of the City of
Bartlesville, Oklahoma. Presented by Jess Kane, City Attorney.

Mr. Kane reported that per City Charter, all five councilmembers come up for re-election
every two years in a non-partisan general election, if needed. This year that election date will
be November 3, 2020. The filing period for the election will begin at 8 a.m. on Monday,
August 3, 2020 and close at 5 p.m. on Wednesday, August 5, 2020. City Council
representatives are nominated by Ward and elected by the qualified electors of the Ward.
Each candidate must be a qualified elector of the City for six months prior to the time of the
elections and must be a qualified resident of his/her respective Ward for six months prior to
the time of the election.

Vice Mayor Gentges moved to approve the resolution calling the election for November 3,
2020 as presented, seconded by Mr. Dorsey.

Mr. Stuart commented that councilmembers must be 25 years of age prior to November 3,
2020.

Aye: Mr. Curd, Vice Mayor Gentges, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mayor Copeland
Nay: None



Motion: Passed
12.New Business.

There was no new business to report.
13.City Manager and Staff Reports.

Mr. Bailey provided a report on the status of the State and County regarding COVID-19
cases.

He also reported that Frontier Pool will be closed until the part arrives for the pump; the
Downtown Street Renovation is now underway; that the Pathfinder Project is complete; the
Tower Center at Unity Square ribbon cutting is scheduled for 5:50 p.m. Friday, July 10; and
he thanked the Bartlesville Kiwanis Club for a successful 4" of July fireworks display.

At the Mayor’s request, Mr. Bailey explained the bike lanes and that the sharrows painted on
these lanes do not mean “bicycles only”. The sharrows are there to guide bicyclists on the
bike approved path, and to also alert drivers of vehicles to be aware of bicyclists in the
marked lanes.

Mr. Curd complimented the contractor on the Pathfinder Project on a job well done.

Mr. Stuart also remarked how well the construction of the new skate park is coming along.
14.City Council Comments and Inquiries.

Vice Mayor Gengtes reported that everyone is welcome to attend the grand opening of

Tower Center at Unity Square on July 10. He added that social distancing will be respected

and masks are encouraged. He added that bringing a blanket or lawn chairs would be a

good idea.

He also commented that he was very glad to see the COVID numbers down in our area, but

asked that citizens continue to wash their hands, wear masks, social distance and be kind to

each other.

Mayor Copeland commented that the was glad that the City Council meeting was in person

tonight, and appreciated everyone’s patience with how the room is set up and the meeting is

conducted.

15.There being no further business to discuss, Mayor Copeland closed the meeting at

8:16 p.m.
Dale W. Copela z-,,___nma jor.
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WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS

CITY OF BARTLESVILLE

2020-2021-002

Them T.

AHaehment o Mindtes .

WATER & WASTEWATER MATERIALS - SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID
COREE | conmume |vattevwn | UTHTY | recinolocy
WATER SERVICES
. . \ Jarred
I P e L e e e
918-266-0209

g 3/4" PE Pipe C.T.S. 1000 ft|$ 021] s 0.19 | $ 0.19 | $ 0.18 | $ 0.23
5 1" PE Pipe C.T.S. 500  ft|$ 0.34 | $ 030 $ 0308 0.28 | § 0.36
i 1-1/2" PE Pipe C.T.S 600 ft|$ 0.79 | $ 0.68 | $ 0.56 | 3 0.64 | $ 0.75
P 2" PE Pipe C.T.S. 2000 ft|$ 115 8 106 | $ 1.05 | $ 0.98 | § 1.24
. 4" C-900 DR 18 40 ft|$ 215 $ 2.00 | $ 188 | $ 188 | $ 2.40
i 6" C-900 DR 18 3000 ft|$ 3.85 | $ 4.05 | 3 369 | 3 372 8 4.70
= 4" SCH 40 PVC 400 ft|3 175 | 8 157 | 8 140§ 1.40 | $ 160
g 6" PVC SDR 26 500 f|$ 245 235 $ 215 | $ 2218 3.00
o 8" PVC SDR 26 1000 ft| $ 445 $ 410 385 5 3.99 | § 6.00
" a °'ywrap(’;§’r‘?§ﬁ)r°”w 10 d|$  7500|$ a700|8 78008 39.00 | $ 118.80
§ Ca“ti°”Tap§éf’irilﬁe”°”M 10 dls 14508 900|$  1800]$ 10.80 | § 9.00
n Detedarg'”e_'fﬁgffjl)(bid Pl 5 HE 16.95 | $ 18.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 13.25 | $ 26.40
" Felyraps (bi‘:op”‘jrm”ﬂper 5 s 495§ 5008 6.00 | $ 4855 6.00
14 | #12 Solid Wire THHN (bid per ft)| 6000  ft| $ 0.10 | $ 0.10 | $ 0.11 ] $ 0.09 | $ 0.25




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND

AWARD TIE BID
C“(ZZE& FORTILINE VALT\E/ESVIN SUJFl’I;J-Il_'z TECLLE;IICY)GY
WATER SERVICES
. . . Jarred
e | gmsdames | o ttent | et | o | St 5
918-266-0209

1 |4"Mega Lugs (DIP) 8 eal$ 2395 | $ 2580 | $ 2736 | $ 2880 | $ 29.00
2 |4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge 8 eal$ 2750 | $ 2399 | $ 3885 (% 2390 (% 34.00
3 |6" Mega Lugs (DIP) 30 eal$ 2945 | $ 2578 | $ 3694 | $ 2570 | ¢ 35.00
4 6" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea| $ 3430 | % 30.00 | $ 39.89 | $ 2970 | $ 41.00
5 |8"Mega Lugs (DIP) 10 eal$ 4015 | $ 3514 | $ 5118 | $ 3470 | $ 47.00
6 [8" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea| $ 4630 | § 4050 | $ 3763 | $ 4045 | $ 55.00
7 |6"MJ 11 1/4° Bend 5 eal$ 3755 (% 3684 $ 5555 | $ 3745 $ 77.00
8 |[8"MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2 eal$ 51.05( $ 5010 | $ 12052 | $ 50.98 | $ 105.00
9 |6"MJ 22 1/2° Bend 5 ea|$ 3710 [ $ 3537 % 3958 | $ 35981 % 75.00
10 18" MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2 eal$ 5785 (% 5510 | 6169 | $ 56.08 | $ 115.00
11 [4"MJ 45° Bend 2 eal$ 2540 | $ 2417 | $ 2703 | % 2460 | % 53.00
12 [6" MJ 45° Bend 15 eal $ 4080 | $ 38911 % 4354 | $ 3958 | 83.00
13 8" MJ 45° Bend 5 eal$ 60.50 | $ 56.59 | $ 6334 |8 5758 | $ 117.00
14 |6" MJ 90° Bend 6 ea|$ 50.10 | $ 4775 | % 5344 | % 48.58 | $ 100.00
15 |[8" MJ 90° Bend 3 eal$ 7265 | $ 69.26 | $ 7753 % 7045 ( $ 147.00
16 (4" MJ Bolt Pack 24 ea|$ 805|% 1020 | § 927 |% 809 |% 10.00
17 12" MJ Bolt Pack 12 eal $ 1665 | $ 2345 $ 1948 | $ 1425 | $ 18.00
18 (4" MJ Plug 2 ea|$ 1420 | $ 13.56 | $ 1472 | $ 1379 | $ 38.00
19 |6" MJ Plug 6 eal$ 2750 | 2565 | $ 29.90 [ 26.09 [ $ 60.00
20 |8"MJ Plug 2 eal$ 4050 | $ 38.05| % 4338 | $ 3869 | % 86.00
21 |4 x2 MJ Plug 2 ea|$ 26.80 | $ 2505 | $ 4552 | $ 2549 | § 62.00
22 |8 x6 MJ Reducer 2 eal$ 4325 | % 4038 | $ 4566 | $ 4100 $ 96.00
23 |6 x6 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee 6 ecal$ 83.15 | $ 79.28 | % 88.74 [ $ 8068 | $ 167.00
24 |8 x 8 x6 MJ Swivel Tee 4 eal|$ 104.00 | $ 99.33 | § 119.96 | $ 101.00 | $ 208.00
25 |6 x6 x 6 MJ Straight Tee 6 eal|$ 7250 | $ 6897 | $ 8112 | $ 70.15 | § 145.00
26 |8 x 8 x6 MJ Straight Tee 4 eal$ 89.75 | $ 8547 | 3% 9143 | $ 86.95 181.00
27 |8 x 8 x 8 MJ Straight Tee 4 eal$ 109.00 | $ 103.16 | $ 109.38 | $ 10450 | $ 215.00




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND

AWARD TIE BID

CF\?ARI!; . FORTILINE VALT\E/$|§VIN SUJIEI_JI: TEC%EEIEGY
WATER SERVICES

. . : Jarred

Coimated | s s | Mo Mechne| et | nogiger |65 5
918-266-0209

28 |4 x2 MJ Tapped Plug 2 eal$ 2625 % 2505 | $ 4552 | $ 2549 |3 62.00
29 |6 x2 MJ Tapped Plug 4 eal$ 3925| % 36.84 | § 3981 % 3747 1% 85.00
30 |8 x2MJ Tapped Plug 2 eal$ 5195 % 4952 | $ 105.00 | $ 5038 | $ 110.00
31 |4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 8 eal$ 2725 (% 2594 | $ 2933 | % 2630 $ 59.00
32 |6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 24 eal$ 4550 | $ 4333 | $ 48.00 | $ 4399 | § 88.00
33 |8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length) 8 eal$ 7360 | $ 7015 | $ 7737 | $ 7130 | $ 115.00
34 |10" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 2 ea|$ 87.80 | 9% 83.71 | % 97.02 | $ 85.00 | $ 171.00
35 [12" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 8 eal$ 11850 | $ 11288 | $ 1M1.71 1 $ 114.00 | $ 231.00
36 |3/4"x4" T Bolts 100 eal $ 115§ 107 | $ 127 | $ 1.00| $ 1.50




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID
UTILITY

cone | rormume | FVEALEY | UILTY | recimoloon

Item Description Esti;nate Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin 5014 Jarred Rodriguez Jeff Shultz

# Quantity 918-637-3877 918-445-0005 581-5960 918-266-0209 866-580-1818
1 [3" Fire Hydrant Meter 3 ea| $ 1,500.00 no bid | § 587.55 | $ 485.00 no bid
2 |Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury 3 eal $ 1,550.00 nobid | $ 149258 | $ 140519 | $ 1,523.00
3 |Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury 2 ea| $ 1,595.00 no bid | $ 152547 | $ 143963 | $ 1,560.00
4 |Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury 2 eal $ 1,645.00 nobid | $ 1,605.03 | $ 147363 | $ 1,597.00
5 |Fire Hydrant, 4.5'Bury 3 eal| $§ 1,670.00 nobid | $ 1,648.09 | $ 1,518.08 | $ 1,635.00
g |Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury 3 eal $§ 1,675.00 no bid | $ 1,698.09 | $ 1,552.08 | $ 1,672.00
7 Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids 15 eal $ 265.00 | $ 207.75 | $ 129.84 | § 204.00 | $ 332.00
Small Meter Boxes 300 ea| $ 59.00 | $ 2875 % 4491 | % 4045 § 29.00
g |Small Meter Box Lids 20 ea| § 2400 | $ 3775 | $ 10.65 $ 20.00
10 |5 1/4"x 2 1/4" Valve Box Extension 24 eal $ 15.00 nobid | $ 833 |% 9.25| $ 29.00
11 |5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension 20 eal $ 19.00 nobid | $ 1134 [ $ 1345 § 44.00
i [ s ERSIOE TORESES 36 ea| $  38.00 no bid | § 3225 | § 3210 | § 82.00
" gao"'(/fPEE"EXT'g all Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom| 5 .| o 49.00 nobid | § 3474 |3 4100 8 109.00
14 |10" Valve Box Tops 10 eal $ 13.50 nobid | $ 855 |8% 1200 | $ 30.00
15 |16" Valve Box Tops 10 ea| $ 19.00 no bid | $ 1294 | $ 1725 § 42.00
16 |16" Valve Box Bottoms 10 ea| $ 25.00 no bid | $ 1124 | $ 1650 | $ 35.00
17 |24" Valve Box Bottoms 10 ea| $ 28.00 nobid | $ 16.11 | $ 23.00| $ 51.00
18 |3" RW MJ Gate Valve 3 eal$ 345.00 | $ 303.50 | $ 336.24 | § 29500 $ 371.00
19 |4" RW MJ Gate Valve 6 eal$ 385.00 | $ 339.50 | $ 37939 | % 31400 $ 449.00
20 |6" RW MJ Gate Valve 25 eal $ 49500 | $ 430.00 | $ 487.24 | $ 41000 | $ 550.00
21 |8"RW MJ Gate Valve 5 eal § 785.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 761.31 | $§ 640.00 | $ 850.00
22 |4" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 1 eal $ 490.00 | $ 42850 | $ 379.39 | § 410.00 | $ 542.00
23 |6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 10 ea| $ 690.00 | $ 605.00 | $ 487.24 | $ 565.00 | $ 684.00
24 |8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 5 eal$ 1,02500| $ 898.00 | $ 75131 | § 82500 $ 994.00




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS

2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID
Cﬁ;‘;& FORTILINE VALT_II\EIEEVIN ;’JF',';,'R TECL:IEIC_)II-_FZ)GY
WATER SERVICES
ltem # Description EstimaFed Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin RoJ:r:rge:ez Jeff Shultz
Quantity 918-637-3877 918-445-0005 501-581-5960 918-266.0209 866-580-1818
Dressers
1 |3/4" Galvanized Dressers 20 ea| $ 12.00 no bid | $ 4.01 nobid | $ 19.00
2 |1" Galvanized Dressers 20 ea| $ 13.50 no bid | $ 5.25 no bid | $ 22.00
Couplings
3 |1" Bolted Coupling 20 ea| $ 30.20 no bid | $ 2822 $ 2887 | % 38.60
4 |1.5" Bolted Coupling 12 ea| $ 30.95 no bid | $ 2974 | $ 32.80 | 43.70
5 |2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411 24 ea| $ 38.00 nobid | $ 3474 % 35421 % 54,75
6 |3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21 2 eal $ 89.95 nobid | $ 82.05 | $ 85.18 | $ 110.50
7 |4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33 Bea|$§ 11500 nobid | $ 10354 | $ 105.76 | $ 128.50
8 |6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65 20eal $  154.00 nobid | $ 14348 |$ 14663 | $ 164.70
9 |8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90 15eal $  181.00 nobid | $ 17389 |$ 17633 | $ 185.40
10 121'2%°”ed Coupling #462 OD 10,85- 4eal$ 31500 nobid | $ 29464 | $ 303.23 | $ 307.05
11 1‘21"'4%°”ed Coupling #482 OD 12,75 - 4eal$ 370,00 nobid | $  367.21|$ 35540 |$ 35695
12 |3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 36 eal $ 12.00 no bid | $ 401 8 373 | $ 19.00
13 |1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 30 ea| $ 13.50 no bid | $ 525 8 481 |3 22.00
14 |2" Galv. Comp. Coupling #522 24 eal| $ 24.50 no bid | $ 498 | $ 9871 % 38.50
|# 248 Clamps '
15 |1.1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 6 ea| $ 12.75 no bid | $ 11.34 | $ 11.40 | $ 15.70
16 |1.1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 15 ea| $ 23.50 no bid | $ 2228 | § 2198 | $ 24.85
# 261 Clamps (Single Band) ' 4l
17 | 3 7-1/2" Glamp #261 OD 2.35-2.63 5ea $ 35,50 nobid | $ 3374 | $ 3317 | $ 41.00
18 |40 4 7.1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41 5eal $ 4250 nobid | $ 39.83 39.77 50.45
19 |40 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74.5.14 5eal $ 64.50 no bid | $ 60.04 61.34 8075
20 _|4" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5eal ¥ 7900 nobid| g  7415(s 75.97 | $ 87.85
21_|6" x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2eal $ 7900 nobid|g 45218 44.93 | $ 56.15
22 6" x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 36 ea $ 47.00 nobid | ¢ 4592 | $ 46.36 | $ 56.15
23 |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 5ea ¥ 48.00 no bid i 4678 | $ 47.05 | $ 56.15
24 |6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea| ¥ 49.00 no bid | ¢ 73.45 | § 7430 | § 56.15
25 |6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 10 ea| $ 79.00 nobid | ¢ 73.84 | $ 75.00 | $ 56.15




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID

CORE& | rormume [vaLtevwin| YTHTY | recnology

WATER SERVICES

ltem # Description Estima?:ed Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin Ronarl;rge:ez Jeff Shultz

Quantity 918-637-3877 918-445-0005 501-581-5960 918-266-0209 866-580-1818
26 |6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2eal 88.00 no bid | ¢ 4429 | 8 84.25 | $ 99.30
27 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea| $ 88.00 no bid | ¢ 46.24 | $ 84.70 | $ 99.30
28 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 2eal ® 88.00 nobid | ¢ 4775 | 8 86.44 | § 99.30
29 [8"x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2¢eal ® 57.00 no bid | ¢ 53.74 | $ 53.87 | $ 65.85
30 #8#8;370-;)/2 Clemp #2610 B.63-6.04 (Par 4a| ® 5700 no bid 96.73 53.87 65.85
31 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 15 eal ® 57.00 no bid 53.28 5423 | § 65.85
32 393576;)/2 e e e 402 % 57.00 nobid | ¢ 5428 | $ 5420 | $ 65.85
33 [8" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10 ea| $ 91.00 nobid | ¢ 84.74 | $ 86.60 | $ 105,59
34 [8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2eal § 10200 no bid | ¢ 9584 | $ 98.85 | $ 120.65
35 _|8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10 ea| $ 102,00 nobid | ¢ 96.59 | $ 2950 | $ 120.65
36 |10" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44 2eal $ 13500 nobid | ¢ 12624 § 128.20 | $ 163.85

# 262 Clamps (Double Band) _
37 |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2 eal ¥ 78.00 nobid | ¢ 72.45 | $ 7239 | $ 93.25
38 |6 x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2eal 3  141.00 nobid ¢ 43474 s 136.80 | $ 166.15
39 |8 x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2 eal $ 82.00 nobid | ¢ 7981 | $ 80.80 | $ 101.35
40 [8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2ea| 15800 nobidfg  44943( g 152.40 | $ 156.50
41 10" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2ea $  197.00 nobid g 18841 s 189.50 | 8 197.30
42 [10"x20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2eal $  259.00 nobid| ¢ 25181 |8$  25245]$ 263.83
# 662 Wet Tap Saddles [l .

43_|6'x4" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2eal 5 28900 nobid | ¢ 27128 3 279.70 no bid
W 26262 Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe e $ 308.00 1o bid : I —— R
45 _|6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 5ea| ¥ 30800 nobid | ¢ 29474|$ 30026 no bid
46 |8"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2ea|$ 39500 nobid | ¢ 374678 381.54 no bid
47 |8'x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2eal $ 47900 nobid | ¢ 45481 | $ 460.40 no bid




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
RIVER UTILITY
Cﬁ;i& FORTILINE | VALLEY WIN :JF',';R: TECHNOLOGY
WATER SERVICES
. i . Jarred
ltem # Description Estimated | Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin Rodriguez Jeff Shultz
Quantlty 918-637-3877 918-445-0005 501-581-5960 918-266-0209 866-580-1818
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Stop
1 |BAa13-232w 100 ea| $ 2075 | $ 20.82 | $ 3681/ 8 29.76 | 30.25
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
2 |BA23-332-w 50 eal $ 58.25 | $ 58.14 | $ 69.37 | $ 58.05 | $ 58.75
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
3 |BAa43-232-W 50 eal$ 34.92 | 8 35.00 | $ 4287 | 8 34.95 | $ 35.50
3/4" Angle Bail Meter Valve BA-
4 la3332w 50 eal $ 59.95 | $ 50.80 | $ 7225] § 59.14 | $ 60.50
1" Angle Ball Meter Valve
5 |BA43-444-W 50 ea| $ 88.95 | $ 89.75 |8 10614 | § 88.98 | $ 90.75
1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female)
6 |KV13-444W (Stops) 50 eal $ 37.50 | $ 37.58 | $ 4588 | $ 3750 | $ 38.00
1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Flare) KV23-
7 l44aw 50 eal $ 39.95 | $ 40.10 | § 5224 | $ 40.01| $ 40.50
1" Angle Key Meter Valve
8 |(Compression) KV43-444W (Stops) 50 eal$ 42,95 | $ 4290 [ § 5224 | $ 4285 | $ 43.50
1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
9 |B11-888W 6 eal$ 12950 $ 13100 $ 15574 % 13059 8 132.00
2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
10 |B11-777-W 6 eal$  189.00 | $ 19060 | §  24184|$ 19000 $ 192.25
11 _|3/4"Ball Corp Stop  FB-1000-3 100 eal $ 37.95 | § 38.11 | $ 4549 | $ 38.05 | $ 38.50
12 |1" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-4 50 eal $ 49.50 | $ 50.12 | $ 5951 | $ 50.06 | $ 50.75
13 _[11/2"Ball Corp Stop  FB-1000-6 10 _eal $ 11200 $ 112358 13351($ 11226 | $ 113.50
14_|2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-7 15 ea|$ 18400  18585|%  21894|$ 18564 $ 187.75
15 |3/4" Insert, #51 500 eal $ 125 | $ 1.43 | $ 079 | $ 127 $ 1.30
1 |1 Insert, #52 500 eal $ 135] 8 150 § 093] § 134 8 1.35
17_||1=5" Insert #54 300 ea|$ 185 § 210 $ 2018 1.85 | $ 1.85
1g |2 Insert #55 300 eal $ 1.85| $ 210 | 284 | 8 1.85| 8 1.85
19 |34'x1"A-24 Adapters 50 ea|$ 20508 9808  1418|8%  2072|$ 2050
20 b Faeespiieeining - CHIEs S 75 ea|$  1235|§ 1241|$  1489[$ 12408 12.55
21 |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling  C-84-33 100 eal $ 11.75 | 11.80 | § 14.21] $ 1179 ] $ 12.00
22 |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling  L-84-33 100 ea| $ 12.85 | $ 12.92 | $ 15.84 | $ 12.92 | § 13.10
23 |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-33 75 eal $ 1425 | $ 1437 | $ 16.79 | 1436 | $ 14.55
24 |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling  L-14-33 50 eal $ 16.75 | $ 1675 | $ 20.25 | § 16.73 | $ 16.95
25 |1" Pack Joint Coupling  C-14-44 50 eal $ 16.75 | $ 16.85 | $ 2064 | $ 16.82 | $ 17.05




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD HEEID
CMQZE & | ForTILINE VALIT_II\E/$ svm SUJF',';,'I: TECl:IEgE;GY
WATER SERVICES

. . i Jarred
Eratea | st e | koMot | ot | o |ttt

918-266-0209
o6 |1"Pack Joint Coupling  C-84-44 50 eal$  1385|$ 140018  1699|8% 139689 1419
o7 |1"Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-44-44 50 eal $ 16453 164518 202118 16441 16.85
28 1" Pack Joint Coupling ~ L-14-44 50 eal $ 26.95 | $ 2732 | $ 33.04| 8 2730 % 27.60
bg |1 PackJoint Coupling  L-84-44 50 eal $ 2125 | $ 2151 | g 2140 | $ 2150 $ 21.75
30 |1 /2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-66 12 eal $ 48.50 | $ 49.02 | 8 58.24 | $ 48.96 | $ 49.50
31 |1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-66 12 eal $ 54.37 | $ 55.05 | $ 64.27 | $ 55.01 | $ 55.60
32 |1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-66 12 eal $ 37.75 | $ 38.32 | $ 4560 | $ 38.28 | $ 38.70
33 |1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-66 12 eal $ 61.60 | § 62.50 | $ 7421 $ 62.44 | $ 63.15
a4 |2"Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-14-77 12 eal s 5775 | § 58.36 | $ 7014 $ 5830 | 8 58.95
35 |2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-77 12 eal $ 7350 | $ 7435 | % 88.64 | $ 7425 | $ 75.05
35 |2 Pack Joint Coupling C-84-77 18 eal 5512 | $ 55.84 | $ 67.74 | $ 5577 | $ 56.40
a7 [2"Pack Joint Coupling ~ L-14-77 12 eal $ 9775 | $ 9892 |8  11851[$ 98.80 | $ 99.85
8 |2 Pack Joint Coupling  L-44-77 12 ea|$  15250|$ 15518 |$  184.25|%  15500|$ 156.65
39 |2" Pack Joint Coupling  L-84-77 12 ea|$ 8790 $ 8950 |$  10764|$%  8951|8% 045
40 |3/4'x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee  T-444-333 12 eal s 3475 | $ 3482 | § 4205 | 8 3477 % 35.15
41 |1'x1"x1" Comp Tee T-444-444 12 eal 3710 | 3724 | $ 4535| $ 3722 | $ 37.65
4o |1"x3/4" Brass Bushing CC Thread 100 eal $ 1070 | $ 9.93| % 3.84| 8 14.00 | § 1065
43 |1-1/2"x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thread 12 eal $ 28.95 | § 26.90 | $ 788 $ 3487 | % 28.80
44 |2"x1-1/2" Brass Bushing 12 eal $ 35.00 | § 3275 $ 11.91] % 5000 $ 35.05
45 |3/4"x 3" Brass Nipple 12 eal $ 255 % 2751 % 322| % 30718 245
46 |1"x 3" Brass Nipple 12 eal $ 370 $ 400 | $ 4208 446 | $ 3.55
47 |1-1/2"x 3" Brass Nipple 12 eal $ 7201 $ 700 | $ 1232 ] % 7811 % 6.20
48 |2 x3"Brass Nipple 12 eal 830§ 8.95| $ 9.09| % 1001 ] $ 8.00
49 |2"x6"Brass Nipple 12 eal $ 16.05 | $ 1730 | $ 17.44 | $ 1934 ] $ 15.25




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS
2020-2021-002

WATER MATERIALS - SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
RIVER UTILITY
Cﬁ;i& FORTILINE | VALLEY WIN s”Jl';g TECHNOLOGY
WATER SERVICES
ltem # D inti Estimated | Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin RoJ:r?e:ez Jeff Shultz
em escrption Quantity | 918-637-3877 | 918-445-0005 | 501-581-5960 918_263_0209 866-580-1818
3/4" Copper Setter
50 |VB72-12W-44-33 50 eal $ 85.95 | $ 87128 11221 s 87.03 | § 87.95
1" Copper Setter
51 |VB74-12W-44-44 50 eal$ 16900/ $ 17205 | ¢  21221l$ 171900 173.75
1 1/2" Copper Setter
52 |vBB76-15B-44-66 12 eal$  780.00| $ 79000 |$  92313|$  789.25| $ 797.45
2" Copper Setter
53 |vBB77-15B-44-77 12 eal$ 91500 $ 92570 |$ 1,00828|%  92470| $ 934.45
54 |Service Saddle 2'x1" CC 12 eal $ 3525 | $ 5750 | § 18.74 | $ 35.77 no bid
55 |Service Saddle 4"x3/4" CC 6 eal$ 33.95 | § 57.50 | $ 2824 | $ 34.39 no bid
56 |Service Saddle 4" x 1" CC 6 eal$ 33.95 | § 5750 | $ 3019 | $ 34.39 no bid
57 |Service Saddle 4'x 1-1/2" CC 6 eal$ 36.95 | $ 61.40 | § 64.14 | § 37.43 no bid
5g |Service Saddle 4" x2" CC 6 eal$ 4075 | $ 6140 | $ 63.84 | § 41.41 no bid
59 |Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC 12 eal $ 36.75 | $ 58.50 | $ 4445 3 37.07 no bid
g0 |Service Saddle 6'x1" CC 50 eal § 36.75 | § 58.50 | $ 4620 § 37.07 no bid
g1 |Service Saddie 6"x 1-1/2" CC 6 eal$ 4225 | $ 63.15 | $ 82.78 | $ 42 91 no bid
g2 |Service Saddle 6"'x2" CC 6 eal$ 4650 | $ 63.15 | $ 8374 | $ 46.60 no bid
g3 |Service Saddle 8"x 3/4" CC 6 eal $ 4580 | $ 70.39 | § 5875 | $ 45.94 no bid
g4 |Service Saddle 8"x1" CC 50 eal $ 4580 | $ 70.39 | $ 58.24 | $ 45.94 no bid
g5 |Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC 6 eal$ 4975 | $ 75.75 | $ 8531 | $ 49.25 no bid
66 |Service Saddle 8"x2"CC 6 eal$ 55.00 | $ 7575 | $ 8435| % 55.00 no bid




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS

2020-2021-002

WASTEWATER MATERIALS - SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID

C“c;';i & FORTILINE VALTZEI\TVIN SUJFIJ:S TECLI{I-II-\IIIC_)IIZ)GY

WATER SERVICES

Item # Description Estima.ted Jarad Barnes | Mike Merchant | Tyler Hardin Rc;l:rl;;e:ez Jeff Shuitz

Quantity 918-637-3877 918-445-0005 501-581-5960 918-266-0209 866-580-1818

Manhole Frames, Covers & Gasket
1 [8"Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687 5ea | $ 475.00 no bid | $ 582.28 | $ 197.75 | 215.00
2 |7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797 10ea [§ 240.00 no bid | $ 45122 | $ 19775 [ $ 208.00
3 |5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A 10ea |3 235.00 no bid | $ 174.00 [ 197751 $ 215.00
4 |Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24 10ea |3 245.00 no bid | $ 20523 | $ 19775 § 215.00
5 |Lamp Hole Box & Lid 10ea [$ 132.00 no bid | $ 79.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 149.00
Sewer Couplings (Hubs)
6 |4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 25ea | $ 4.50 nobid | $ 3401 % 3.95 no bid
7 |4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 50ea | $ 4,50 no bid | $ 465 | $ 3.95 no bid
8 |6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 20ea | § 8.95 nobid | $ 9791 8% 8.40 no bid
9 |8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 40ea | $ 8.95 no bid | $ 9881 8% 8.40 no bid
10 |8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 30ea | $ 13.50 no bid | $ 15.05 | § 12.90 no bid
11 |8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 100 ea | $ 13.75 no bid | $ 1626 | $ 13.90 no bid
12 |10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12ea |3 21.00 no bid | $ 2247 | $ 19.25 no bid
13 [10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 24 ea | $ 21.00 no bid | $ 1914 | $ 19.25 no bid
14 112" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12ea | $ 26.00 no bid | $ 2638 % 22.45 no bid
15 112" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 12ea | $ 26.00 no bid | $ 26.38 | $ 22.45 no bid
Fium_gg &{‘%@_smiles et

16 |4" PVC 45° Elbow SCH 40 DWV 100ea |$ 5.75 no bid | $ 4.99 | $ 4.39 | $ 5.80

10




CITY OF BARTLESVILLE
WATER AND WASTEWATERLINE REPAIR MATERIALS

2020-2021-002

WASTEWATER MATERIALS - SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CORE& | ormume [vaitevwin| YTHTY  lreunolooy
WATER SERVICES
Soimed | v | et | e | oo | S
918-266-0209
17 |4" PVC 22 1/2" Elbow SCH 40 DWV 24ea | § 8.95 no bid | $ 7.05| % 510 $ 4.90
18 |6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12ea | 8 26.00 nobid [ $ 24391 8% 2162 | 3 27.85
19 [8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12ea [ $ 64.00 no bid | $ 54.87 | § 53711 % 69.20
20 |6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20ea. | $ 25.00 nobid [ $ 2284 | % 23.74 no bid
with 8S Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
21 |8x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 40ea. | % 36.00 no bid | $ 28741 % 25.77 no bid
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
22 [10x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20ea. | $ 45.00 nobid | $ 4118 | % 38.50 no bid
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
23 |12x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 12ea. [ $ 58.00 no bid | $ 4651 [ $ 46.45 no bid
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
24 |1 1/2" Preformed Flex Plastic - 10 bxs.| $ 98.00 nobid|$ 55.00 | $ 67.20 no bid
Gasket (Ram-Nek)
25 |Romac Tap Saddle CB 4" 12ea. | $ 85.00 nobid | $ 6482 | $ 7478 | § 83.00
Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe
26 |Romac Tap Saddle CB 6" 12ea. | $ 105.00 no bid | § 10425 $ 99.67 | $ 111.00
Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe
27 |4" Rubber Test Cap 20ea. | § 4.50 no bid | $ 32218 203|9% 3.00
28 |3" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20ea. | $ 30.00 nobid | $ 16.81 [ § 21508 4.40
29 |4" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20ea. | $ 35.00 no bid | § 1821 1|8 2200 | % 5.95

11
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