

City Hall, Council Chambers 401 S. Johnstone Avenue Bartlesville, OK 74003

MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE BARTLESVILLE CITY COUNCIL Tuesday, July 5, 2022 7 p.m.

Mayor Dale Copeland 918-338-4282

MINUTES

(The Notice of Meeting was posted December 15, 2021 and the Agenda was posted June 30, 2022 at 6:00 p.m.)

Present were Mayor Dale Copeland, Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr., Councilmembers Trevor Dorsey, Paul Stuart, and Billie Roane.

City staff present were Mike Bailey, City Manager; Jess Kane, City Attorney; Jason Muninger, City Clerk/CFO; Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water Utilities; Micah Siemers, Director of Engineering; Kelli Williams, Chief Communications Officer; Laura Sanders, Director of Human Resources; Greg Collins, Assistant Community Development Director; Mike Richardson, Airport Director; Lt. Warren Morrow, Security; and Elaine Banes, Executive Assistant.

- 1. The business meeting of the Bartlesville City Council was called to order at 7:01 p.m. by Mayor Copeland.
- 2. Roll call was held and a quorum established.
- 3. The invocation was provided by Pastor Pam Crawford, Good Shepherd Presbyterian Church.
- 4. Citizens to be heard.

There were no citizens to be heard.

- 5. City Council Announcements and Proclamations.
 - Home Energy Aid Month July 2022 presented by Mayor Copeland.
- 6. Authorities, Boards, Commissions and Committee Openings
 - One opening on the City Planning Commission

Mayor Copeland read the openings and encouraged citizens to volunteer on City Committees. Applications can be found at www.cityofbartlesville.org or at City Hall in the City Manager's Office.

- 7. Consent Docket
 - a. Approval of Minutes
 - i. The Regular Meeting Minutes of June 6, 2022.
 - b. Approval or Ratification of Appointments to Authorities, Boards, Commissions, and Committees.

- i. Reappointment of Ms. Julie Uehlinger for a three-year term on the White Rose Cemetery Board at the recommendation of Mayor Copeland.
- ii. Appointment of Mr. Phillip Wright to complete an unexpired term on the Bartlesville Redevelopment Trust Authority recommended by Mr. Stuart.
- iii. Reappointment of Mr. John J. Kane to an additional three-year term on the City Planning Commission at the recommendation of Ms. Roane.

c. Approval of Resolutions

- i. Amend the contracts of the City Attorney, City Judge, City Manager and Golf Professional adjusting their compensation to accommodate the approved cost of living adjustments and merit increases for Fiscal Year 2022-2023.
- ii. Amending the budget of the City of Bartlesville, Oklahoma for Fiscal Year 2021-2022, appropriating 2022 General Obligation Bond proceeds for closing costs.
- iii. Amending the budget of the City of Bartlesville, Oklahoma for Fiscal Year 2022-2023, appropriating 2022 General Obligation Bond proceeds.
- iv. Amending the budget for the City of Bartlesville, Oklahoma for Fiscal Year 2022-23, appropriating unanticipated fund balance for the Golf Course Memorial Fund.

d. Approval of Agreements, Contracts, Engagement Letters and Change Orders

- i. "Back to School" Collaboration Agreement between the Bartlesville Area History Museum/City of Bartlesville and Amanda Stratford Photography to take family portraits in the Museum's Nelson Carr One Room School.
- ii. LSTA Terms and Conditions Agreement for federally funded grants issued by the Oklahoma Department of Libraries for Fiscal Year 2022-2023.
- iii. Update Appendix 1 of the Fraternal Order of Police (FOP) Collective Bargaining Agreement for Fiscal Year 2022-2023 to adjust the cost of living raise given to other City employees as a group.
- iv. Lease Agreement between the City of Bartlesville and Washington County for lease of the 4th floor of the City Hall Building for use by the Washington County Election Board.
- v. Engagement Letter for Audit Services with Arledge and Associates, P.C.
- vi. Engagement Letter for Audit Consulting Services with Crawford and Associates P.C.
- vii. Copier Lease and Maintenance Agreement with R.K. Black and Cannon Financial to restructure service resulting in a savings to the City.
- viii. Project maintenance, financing, and right-of-way agreement with the Oklahoma Department of Transportation for Project No. TAP-274D(038)TP, State Job No. 32980(04) for constructing a sidewalk along Shawnee Avenue between 16th Street and Valley Road.
- ix. Agreement for the deferment of a Planned Unit Development (PUD) Site Development Plan Amendment, Preliminary Plat, and Final Plat with Voice of the Martyrs, Inc. for property located at 1815 SE Bison Road.
- x. Change Order #2 from Magnum Construction, Inc. for the Sooner Pool Expansion Project.
- xi. Change Order #2 from Gorman Construction Company for the Bartlesville Public Library 2nd Floor Remodel.

e. Receipt of Financials

i. Interim Financials for the eleven months ending May 31, 2022.

f. Receipt of Bids

- i. Bid No. 2021-2022-011 for the Rehabilitate Taxilanes and Construct Apron.
- ii. Bid No. 2022-2023-001 Water & Wastewater Line Repair Materials.
- iii. Bid No. 2022-2023-002 Water Treatment Chemicals

Mayor Copeland read the consent docket in its entirety. Ms. Roane pulled Items 7.b.i., ii., and iii. from the consent docket for further discussion.

Mr. Stuart moved to approve the consent docket with the exception of Items 7. i., ii., and iii., seconded by Vice Mayor Curd.

Aye: Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

7.b. Approval or Ratification of Appointments to Authorities, Boards, Commissions, and Committees.

- i. Reappointment of Ms. Julie Uehlinger for a three-year term on the White Rose Cemetery Board at the recommendation of Mayor Copeland.
- ii. Appointment of Mr. Phillip Wright to complete an unexpired term on the Bartlesville Redevelopment Trust Authority recommended by Mr. Stuart.
- iii. Reappointment of Mr. John J. Kane to an additional three-year term on the City Planning Commission at the recommendation of Ms. Roane.

Ms. Roane provided background on the volunteers, and expressed her appreciation for their service on each of the respective Authorities, Boards and Committees.

Ms. Roane moved to approve Item 7.b. i., ii., and iii., seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

8. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2021-2022-011 for Rehabilitate Taxilanes and Construct Apron AIP 3-40-0007-017-2022. Presented by Ms. Roane.

Ms. Roane moved to award Bid No. 2021-2022-011 to Contech Inc., Broken Arrow, Oklahoma, in the amount of \$478,443.00, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

9. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2022-2023-001 for Water & Wastewater Line Repair Materials. Presented by Mayor Copeland.

Mayor Copeland moved to award Bid No. 2022-2023-001 to the low bid vendors according to the attached bid tabulations, seconded by Ms. Roane.

Aye:

Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

10. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2022-2023-002 for Water Treatment Chemicals for the Water Treatment Plant. Presented by Mayor Copeland.

Mayor Copeland moved to award Bid No. 2022-2023-002 to the low bid vendors according to the attached bid tabulations, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Ave:

Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

11. A public hearing and take possible action on an application from Dan Keleher of Keleher Architects, on behalf of Clint Sumner and Frankie E. Walters, the Frankie E. Walters Revocable Trust, and other owners, et al., to allow rezoning from RS-10 (Single Family Residential) and C-3/PUD to C-3/PUD (Major Shopping/Planned Unit Development), as well as approval of a Planned Unit Development and Site Development Plan at property described as part of the Northeast Quarter of the Southwest Quarter of Section 21, Township 26 North, Range 13 East, Bartlesville, Washington County, Oklahoma. Presented by Greg Collins, Assistant Director, Community Development.

Mr. Collins reported that the applicant is requesting a zoning change in order to develop around 10.59 acres of the approximately 12.92 acres into a pediatric medical clinic with office and laboratory space serving the clinic. The proposed uses of medical clinic office, and medical laboratory ae allowed in a C-3 zoning district which is the designation requested. Mr. Collins reviewed the land use and zoning history; additional plans for the property; site requirements; Public Participation meeting and results; and staff's required conditions. Staff finds that all conditions/factors are satisfied, or will be satisfied upon the applicant's/landowners' completion of any remaining conditions, and that the proposed development is appropriate at this location and is compatible with surrounding areas. The City Planning Commission considered the application at their May 24, 2022 meeting and adopted staff's recommendations, and recommends approval by the City Council. The conditions are attached to these minutes for reference.

Discussion covered the number of required parking spaces and how they will be used for the business; sidewalk regulations; and how gaps in sidewalk areas could be filled at a later day or by future development.

Mayor Copeland opened the public hearing at 7:57 p.m. Appearing to speak were: Jeffrey Service (sp), 4900 Fairview and Jolene Utter, 4904 Fairview. Both stated their opposition to the change in rezoning and subsequent development due to a perceived diminishment of green space near their properties by the U.S. Forestry project and the Minor Clinic, as well as their opposition to parking lot and building lighting, and potential increased traffic near their neighborhood.

Mr. Collins and Mr. Keleher provided information regarding the distance from the proposed medical office and clinic to Mr. Service's and Ms. Utter's homes; how lighting requirements are such that it should not pose a problem to them; how the U.S. Forestry's project is removal of cedars and brush that can pose a fire hazard; and how a medical practice is considered low intensity.

There being no one further appear to address this item, Mayor Copeland closed the public hearing at 8:09 p.m.

Mr. Dorsey moved to approve the request and adopt the Ordinance for rezoning as presented, seconded by Vice Mayor Curd.

Aye: Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

12. Discuss and take possible action to approve an Agreement between the City of Bartlesville and Strategic Government Resources, Inc. for hiring a new Community Development Director. Presented by Laura Sanders, Director, Human Resources.

Ms. Sanders reported that due to Lisa Beeman's upcoming retirement, it is necessary to hire a new Community Development Director. Due to the good results in the hiring of the Police and Fire Chiefs using Strategic Government Resources, Inc. in the past, it is staff's recommendation to work with them again. SGR provides assistance based on client preference in a streamlined manner and provides a competitive candidate pool. Ms. Sanders provided the outline for this process as follows: utilize SGR;s Digital Talent Marketing to post the positions including Bartlesville markets; accept and review applications and reduce to top candidates; have SGR issue Questionnaire's to top candidates with SGR evaluating and a follow-up briefing by City staff; reduce the pool followed with online interviews for remote candidates and in person interviews with locals; and finally running background checks as well as DISC Management style Analysis to be performed and reference check. Costs for the service is not final until the process gets underway. A budget of \$16,000 has been set aside for this agreement. Vice Mayor Curd inquired how the Council will be able to interact during the hiring process. Mr. Bailey explained, that per the City Charter, the City Council cannot participate in the hiring of City personnel. He added that he has welcomed the City Council's input on what they would like to see improved in the overall business of the Community Development Department, which is what he invited Community Development staff and many business professionals in the community to share with him as well. He concluded that he felt confident that with the assistance of SGR and Ms. Sanders, that an in-depth and successful process will be conducted.

Mr. Dorsey moved to approve the Agreement with Strategic Government Resources, Inc. as presented, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

13. Discuss and take possible action to approve a Resolution calling and giving notice of an upcoming election for City Council Representatives for all wards of the City of Bartlesville, Oklahoma. Presented by Jess Kane, City Attorney.

Mr. Kane reported City Council Representatives from each of the five wards of the City shall be elected every two years, and can only be elected by registered, qualified electors of their perspective Ward. Council Members shall be qualified electors of the City for six months prior to the time of their election and each Council Member must be a qualified resident of his/her respective ward for six months prior to the time of the election. A Council Member must have a record free of felony convictions, be at least twenty-five (25) years of age at the time of his election to office, and cannot hold any position in the City government by appointment of the City Manager. A member of the City Council shall hold no other public office which would constitute a conflict of interest according to State Statues. In conclusion, Mr. Kane stated that the non-partisan general election will be held

on November 8, 2022. The filing period for said election will begin at 8:00 a.m. on Monday, August 1, 2022 and close at 5:00 p.m. on Wednesday, August 3, 2022.

Ms. Roane moved to approve the Resolution as presented, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Aye: Mr. Stuart, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

14. Discuss and take possible action to approve a Resolution authorizing staff to utilize contractors to repair private property sewer service line defects to mitigate storm water inflow and infiltration into the public wastewater collection and treatment system. Presented by Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water Utilities.

Mr. Lauritsen reported that one of the biggest items that affect the City's wastewater collection and treatment system is stormwater inflow and infiltration. In 2020 and 2021, the City analyzed two small sewer basins, the Nebraska sub-basin, located in the NE side of town north of Wilson Elementary School, and the Maple sub-basin, located in the SW side of town around Jane Phillips Elementary School. There have been multiple rain related sanitary sewer overflows in these areas. A hydraulic study discovered that during a rain event, the wastewater flows in these two sub-basins would peak at approximately 18 times the average flow. The system is designed to convey a peak of 4.5 times the average flow. Thus, these areas are experiencing a tremendous amount of stormwater inflow and infiltration. Smoke testing was then utilized to determine the location of these defects. The testing identified 95 defects on the City's system and 223 defects on private service lines. On the 95 City defects, 73 were seals on manholes that are a minor repair, and the other 22 were on pipes. On the private side defects, 134 were uncapped clean-outs and 89 were service line defects. While the uncapped clean out is an inexpensive fix (typically less than \$10), repairing a service line can range between \$500 to \$9,000.

Mr. Lauritsen continued that currently, the City requires the property owner to make the necessary repairs on a service line defect within 60 days of being notified (Ordinance 2796, 2-16-1993). If the defect is not repaired in that 60-day period, the City can issue fines, take the property owner to civil court or disconnect water and/or wastewater service to the property. In the Nebraska and Maple sub-basins, the cost of these repairs will be cost prohibitive. Since the correction of the defect will benefit the City as much as the property owner, City staff is requesting to pilot a repair program. On a City identified sewer service line defect contributing inflow and infiltration into the City's system, staff will make contact with the property owner and offer to make the repairs, at no cost to the property owner, utilizing licensed plumbers. If the property owner refuses this offer, they will be required to make the repairs per the ordinance. If the property owner elects to have the City make the repair, they will have to execute an agreement that allows temporary access to the City and its contractor, indemnification to the City and acknowledgement that the service line remains the property of the property owner after the repair is complete. The plumber selected for the repair will provide a one- year warranty to the property owner for the repair and any warranty work through defective workmanship or materials will be between the property owner and plumber.

In conclusion, the proposed resolution is the framework for this program. It is based on available funding and can be amended or suspended by either the City Manager or

Director of Water Utilities. City staff has allocated up to \$100,000 for these private side repairs in the FY 22-23 budget.

Discussion covered how the focus in on the two sub-basins, Nebraska and Maple; how the defect is defined; the process of cutting off services if the customer does not cooperate with the process; how the cut-off process is included in the ordinance but the City would prefer working repairs out with citizen prior to using the law to end service for non-compliance; how repairs may be singular or if needed a whole line is repaired; and a suggestion that possible grants may be researched and utilized to assist customers with repairs.

Mr. Stuart moved to approve the Resolution as presented, seconded by Ms. Roane.

Aye: Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mayor Copeland

Nay: None Motion: Passed

15. Presentation, discussion and take possible action to approve the City of Bartlesville Strategic Plan. Presented by Mike Bailey, City Manager.

Mr. Bailey reported that in February of this year, the City Council approved hiring the Mejorando Group to facilitate the development of the City's first strategic plan that is focused on the City's role in the community. After that hiring, many steps were taken to arrive at the attached Bartlesville NEXT plan. The official kickoff was in March, and Mejorando facilitated several meetings to gather input including: one meeting with City Department Directors; one meeting with the City Council; one meeting with City economic development partners; one meeting with major employers; two meetings with the public; and four meetings with City employees.

Continuing, Mr. Bailey reported that on April, Mejorando conducted surveys of the City Council, City employees, and the public. All of the collected input was analyzed and distilled by a steering committee composed of a cross section of City Directors and the Mayor. The steering committee met for two days to review this input and began to draw a focus on the major opportunities and challenges in our community. In May, the steering committee reviewed all of the plans that the City had previously created. These included park plans, comprehensive land use plans, the 2013 Angelou Plan, and others. The steering committee also finalized the organization's Mission, Vision, and Core Values and began to develop Strategic Priorities and Key Objectives. In June, the steering committee met one final time to finalize all of the work that had been done previously. The Bartlesville NEXT plan is the culmination of all this work, but the adoption of this plan is only the beginning. Once the plan is adopted by Council, an implementation plan will be developed that will include more detailed goals, timelines, and performance measures. The steering committee is pleased with the final plan and looks forward to moving into the implementation phase after Council approval.

Using a PowerPoint, Mr. Bailey reviewed the proposed Mission, Vision and Core Values complete with how the steering committee arrived at the final results. He also provided detailed information about the five categories covering and entitled Strategic Priorities. The five categories are Financial Strength and Operation Excellence, Effective Infrastructure Network, Economic Vitality, Community Character, and Emerging Issues

Discussion covered the Mayor's participation on the steering committee; and the Vice Mayor's comments on the Council's continued participation in the Plan going forward.

Mr. Dorsey moved to approve the Strategic Plan as presented, seconded by Mr. Stuart.

Mr. Stuart commented on the key objectives, and Ms. Roane stated her appreciation of the work that went into developing the Strategic Plan.

Aye:

Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd, Ms. Roane, Mr. Stuart, Mayor Copeland

Nay:

None

Motion:

Passed

16. New Business.

There was no new business.

17. City Manager and Staff Reports.

Mr. Bailey reported a safe 4th of July over the past weekend holiday.

Mayor Copeland added that due to the holiday that Monday trash routes will be picked up tomorrow, Wednesday.

18. City Council Comments and Inquiries.

Mr. Stuart inquired about the water chemicals and how long do they keep the water treated and if other methods of treatment have been considered. Mr. Lauritsen stated that treatment lasts two to four weeks, and that other treatments are considered on a regular basis.

Vice Mayor Curd addressed the Community Development Director position again stating that he felt the City's recreational services requires a Recreation Director. Mr. Bailey stated that the Community Development Director currently covers Park Planning whereas recreation management is provided by the YMCA, and park maintenance is provided by the City's Park Department. He added that he will explore all qualifications during the interview process for the Community Development Director position.

Ms. Roane complimented the Bartlesville Area History Museum on their new employee and the Back to School photography sessions.

Mayor Copeland concluded the meeting by stating his appreciation for a great City staff, and the importance of Independence Day.

19. There being no further business to address, Mayor Copeland adjourned the meeting at 9:18 p.m.

Mayor



Agenda Item
June 28, 2022
Prepared by Terry Lauritsen
Water Utilities

1. SUBJECT, ATTACHMENTS, AND BACKGROUND

Discuss and take action to award water line and wastewater line material bids for the Water Distribution and Wastewater Maintenance departments, presented by Mayor Dale Copeland.

Budget and Source of Funds:

\$200,000 - Water Distribution Operating Fund \$50,000 - Wastewater Maintenance Operating Fund

Attachments:

Bid tabulations

II. STAFF COMMENTS AND ANALYSIS

Bids for water and wastewater materials are taken on an annual basis. Due to volatilities in the supply market, the bid was structured for a 6 month price guarantee with the option for one 6 month renewal upon mutual agreement of both the City and vendor. Bid packets were advertised in the local newspaper and sent to 13 vendors. Three (3) bids were received. There are over 200 material items requested for bid, which are shown by the attached bid tabulation. The quantities within the tabulation are estimates of materials for the coming fiscal year. Materials are purchased on an as needed basis to repair and maintain the water distribution and wastewater collection systems.

The total bid price for the water distribution materials is \$341,344,23, which represents a 19% increase from last fiscal year, and is \$141,344,23 over the available budget. Historically, the City purchases about 65% of the items included in the bid, but all the items are bid to establish a price in case we need to purchase it. If the material pricing exceeds the operational budget, there is \$6MM in operational reserves that can be utilized if needed.

The total bid price for the wastewater collection materials is \$27,500,96, which represents a 25% increase from last fiscal year. The material bid for wastewater maintenance is under the available operating budget by \$15,764.89.

III. RECOMMENDED ACTION

Staff recommends award to the vendor who submitted the low bid meeting specifications, which are highlighted within the attached bid tabulation.

Council Member or Staff Member

Date

PE & TUBING	TIE BID	FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY	No Bid \$ 84.00	No Bid \$ 7.00	No Bid \$ 14.50	No Bid \$ 8.00	No Bid \$ 60.00
CTION A: PI		FERGUSON	\$ 109.88	\$ 23.20	\$ 28.24	\$ 3.98	\$ 100.98
RIALS - SEC		CORE &	\$ 72.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 80.00
TER MATE		Estimated Quantity	10 וו	10 וו	אן 2	5 rl	12 rl
WATER & WASTEWATER MATERIALS - SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD	Description	Poly Wrap (bid per roll <u>200'x18"</u> per roll)	Caution Tape (bid per roll <u>1,000'</u> per roll)	Detectable Locator Tape (bid per roll 1,000' per roll)	Poly Tape (bid per roll 200' per roll)	#12 Solid Wire THHN (bid per roll)
	LOW	Item #	-	2	3	4	5

	WATER MATERIALS	1	SECTION B: DUCT	DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS	TINGS	
T(LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
1	4" Mega Lugs (DIP)	8 ea	\$ 43.00	\$ 25.45	No Bid	\$ 37.63
7	4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge	8 ea	\$ 48.50	\$ 30.58	No Bid	\$ 45.17
3	6" Mega Lugs (DIP)	30 ea	\$ 50.00	\$ 29.69	No Bid	\$ 46.47
4	6" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge	100 ea	\$ 57.30	\$ 37.14	No Bid	\$ 56.55
2	8" Mega Lugs (DIP)	10 ea	\$ 65.00	\$ 44.61	No Bid	\$ 63.33
9	8" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge	100 ea	\$ 78.00	\$ 54.92	No Bid	\$ 76.28
7	14" Mega Lugs (DIP) w/10 wedge	2 ea	\$ 170.85	\$ 127.86	No Bid	\$ 160.98
8	14" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/10 wedge	2 ea	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.26	No Bid	\$ 210.28
6	6" MJ 11 1/4° Bend	5 ea	\$ 132.10	\$ 148.61	No Bid	\$ 77.35
10	8" MJ 11 1/4° Bend	2 ea	\$ 164.20	\$ 285.21	No Bid	\$ 104.67
11	6" MJ 22 1/2° Bend	5 ea	\$ 128.35	\$ 211.67	No Bid	\$ 73.64
12	8" MJ 22 1/2° Bend	2 ea	\$ 174.60	\$ 296.45	No Bid	\$ 115.33
13	4" MJ 45° Bend	2 ea	\$ 90.75	\$ 162.58	No Bid	\$ 50.95
14	6" MJ 45° Bend	15 ea	\$ 135.60	\$ 219.49	No Bid	\$ 81.05
15	8" MJ 45° Bend	5 ea	\$ 176.00	\$ 299.38	No Bid	\$ 118.11
16	6" MJ 90° Bend	6 ea	\$ 154.20	\$ 239.54	No Bid	\$ 100.04
17	8" MJ 90° Bend	3 ea	\$ 203.15	\$ 327.16	No Bid	\$ 144.51

	WATER MATERIALS -		SECTION B: DUCT	DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS	TINGS	
Ľ	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
18	4" MJ Bolt Pack	24 ea	\$ 17.00	\$ 23.83	No Bid	\$ 16.21
19	12" MJ Bolt Pack	12 ea	\$ 30.65	\$ 46.00	No Bid	\$ 28.72
20	4" MJ Plug	2 ea	\$ 48.50	\$ 54.14	No Bid	\$ 28.72
21	6" MJ Plug	6 ea	\$ 80.75	\$ 86.54	No Bid	\$ 53.73
22	8" MJ Plug	2 ea	\$ 108.40	\$ 116.04	No Bid	\$ 79.20
23	4 x 2 MJ Plug	2 ea	\$ 72.10	\$ 79.57	No Bid	\$ 52.80
24	8 x 6 MJ Reducer	2 ea	\$ 142.00	\$ 243.79	No Bid	\$ 84.76
25	6 x 6 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee	6 ea	\$ 245.00	\$ 338.30	No Bid	\$ 165.35
26	8 x 8 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee	4 ea	\$ 292.50	\$ 423.08	No Bid	\$ 207.03
27	6 x 6 x 6 MJ Straight Tee	6 ea	\$ 225.00	\$ 352.46	No Bid	\$ 143.58
28	8 x 8 x 6 MJ Straight Tee	4 ea	\$ 264.00	\$ 429.42	No Bid	\$ 177.85
29	8 x 8 x 8 MJ Straight Tee	4 ea	\$ 303.00	\$ 488.92	No Bid	\$ 214.91
30	4 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug	2 ea	\$ 72.00	\$ 79.56	No Bid	\$ 52.80
31	6 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug	4 ea	\$ 102.80	\$ 111.47	No Bid	\$ 77.35
32	8 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug	2 ea	\$ 142.30	\$ 141.46	No Bid	\$ 103.28
33	4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length)	8 ea	\$ 92.95	\$ 166.00	No Bid	\$ 54.19
34	6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length)	24 ea	\$ 142.00	\$ 229.76	No Bid	\$ 90.78

	WATER MATERI	ALS - SECT	TERIALS - SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS	LE IRON FIT	TINGS	
ΓC	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
35	8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length)	8 ea	\$ 202.50 \$	\$ 328.72	No Bid	\$ 145.89
36	10" Solid Sleeves (12" Length)	2 ea	\$ 257.00	\$ 477.11	No Bid	\$ 174.61
37	12" Solid Sleeves (12" Length)	8 ea	\$ 318.30	\$ 558.49	No Bid	\$ 234.82
38	38 14" Solid Sleeves (12" Length)	2 ea	\$ 490.00	\$ 864.07	No Bid	\$ 354.78
39	3/4"x4" ⊤ Bolts	100 ea	\$ 2.15 \$	\$ 2.10	No Bid	\$ 1.99

	WATER MATERIALS -	SECTION C:		DRANTS, ME	VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES	
107	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
1	3" Fire Hydrant Meter	3 еа	\$ 1,575.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,228.00
2	4 1/2" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Mueller CMV	6 ea	\$ 395.00	\$ 171.76	No Bid	No Bid
3	5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Mueller	8 ea	\$ 425.00	\$ 208.12	No Bid	No Bid
4	5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Kennedy, KB- 10	8 ea	\$ 425.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, Kennedy, KB-10	4 ea	\$ 350.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	5 1/4" Fire Hyd. Main Valve (Old) M250 US	12 ea	\$ 260.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	5 1/4" Fire Hyd. Main Valve (New) M94-250 US	12 ea	\$ 260.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
∞	5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, U.S.	ea 9	\$ 275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury	3 еа	\$ 2,435.00	\$ 2,548.83	No Bid	\$ 2,313.75
10	Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury	2 ea	\$ 2,490.50	\$ 2,610.88	No Bid	\$ 2,370.00
11	Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury	2 ea	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 2,673.15	No Bid	\$ 2,426.50
12	Fire Hydrant, 4.5 Bury	3 еа	\$ 2,658.00	\$ 2,735.11	No Bid	\$ 2,482.90
13	Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury	3 еа	\$ 2,670.00	\$ 2,797.23	No Bid	\$ 2,539.25
14	Traffic Repair Kits for Mueller Centruian 022MUA301	3 еа	\$ 275.00	\$ 303.80	No Bid	No Bid
15	Rubber O-Rings for U.S. Hydrant (Standpipe seal)	18 ea	\$ 35.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	WATER MATERIALS -	SECTION C:	1	DRANTS, ME	VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES	
107	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
16	Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids (Carson 1730-18 HDPE)	15 ea	a \$ 345.00	\$ 306.81	No Bid	\$ 290.66
17	Small Meter Boxes (Carson 2200-18)	300 ea	a \$ 150.00	\$ 54.42	No Bid	\$ 51.45
18	Small Meter Box Lids	20 ea	a \$ 75.00	\$ 71.46	No Bid	\$ 67.69
19	Thru the lid flange & nut (Nepune) for attaching AMI antennas	200 ea	19.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	5 1/4" x 2 1/4" Valve Box Extension	24 ea	a \$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	No Bid	\$ 22.99
21	5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension	20 ea	a \$ 39.95	\$ 38.13	No Bid	\$ 45.98
22	Valve Box, Short Adj. 10"-Top 16"- Bottom COMPLETE	36 ea	a \$ 73.15	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 61.58
23	Valve Box, Tall Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom COMPLETE	50 ea	a \$ 96.80	\$ 72.80	No Bid	\$ 82.11
24	10" Valve Box Tops	10 ea	a \$ 29.35	\$ 21.67	No Bid	\$ 20.50
25	16" Valve Box Tops	10 ea	a \$ 44.85	\$ 32.07	No Bid	\$ 30.38
26	16" Valve Box Bottoms	10 ea	a \$ 39.35	\$ 29.47	No Bid	\$ 27.92
27	24" Valve Box Bottoms	10 ea	a \$ 53.75	\$ 40.73	No Bid	\$ 38.59
28	3" RW MJ Gate Valve	3 ea	a \$ 615.00	\$ 655.81	No Bid	\$ 534.43
29	4" RW MJ Gate Valve	6 ea	a \$ 635.00	\$ 732.35	No Bid	\$ 597.22
30	6" RW MJ Gate Valve	25 ea	a \$ 805.00	\$ 929.27	No Bid	\$ 762.00
31	8" RW MJ Gate Valve	5 ea	a 1,255.00	\$ 1,441.42	No Bid	\$ 1,214.00

	WATER MATERIALS -	SECTION	SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES	DRANTS, ME	TERS & BOXES	
107	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
32	32 4" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve	1 ea \$	\$ 775.00	\$ 857.70	No Bid	\$ 753.44
33	33 6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve	10 ea \$	\$ 1,115.00 \$	\$ 1,202.49	No Bid	\$ 1,064.00
34	34 8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve	5 ea \$	\$ 1,750.00 \$	\$ 1,768.51	No Bid	\$ 1,580.00
35	35 Water Sample Stations Eclipse #88	5 ea \$	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,009.44	\$ No Bid \$	\$ 1,000.00

	WATER MATERIALS - SECTI	ON D: COL	JPLINGS, CL	SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES	NG SLEEVES	10
07	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE &	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
	Dressers					
_	3/4" Galvanized Dressers	20 ea	\$ 24.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.00
2	1" Galvanized Dressers	20 ea	\$ 29.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.00
	Couplings					
3	1" Bolted Coupling	20 ea	\$ 49.80	\$ 47.03	No Bid	\$ 45.39
4	1.5" Bolted Coupling	12 ea	\$ 50.70	\$ 47.91	No Bid	\$ 51.56
5	2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411	24 ea	\$ 62.15	\$ 58.76	No Bid	\$ 54.67
9	3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21	2 ea	\$ 128.60	\$ 127.21	No Bid	\$ 120.52
7	4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33	6 ea	\$ 184.50	\$ 180.42	No Bid	\$ 170.93
∞	6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65	20 ea	\$ 223.90	\$ 218.97	No Bid	\$ 207.40
6	8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90	15 ea	\$ 275.00	\$ 269.65	No Bid	\$ 255.40
10	10" Boited Coupling #462 OD 10.65-12.20	4 ea	\$ 463.80	\$ 525.50	No Bid	\$ 538.17
11	12" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 12.75 - 14.40	4 ea	\$ 542.95	\$ 645.51	No Bid	\$ 661.16
12	3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522	36 ea	\$ 14.75	\$ 14.39	No Bid	\$ 13.63
13	1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522	30 ea	\$ 17.20	\$ 16.24	No Bid	\$ 15.39
14	2" Galv. Comp. Coupling #522	24 ea	\$ 31.35	\$ 29.64	No Bid	\$ 28.08

	WATER MATERIALS - SECTI	ON D: COL	JPLINGS, CL	SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES	NG SLEEVES	
07	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE &	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
	# 248 Clamps					
15	1-1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90	6 еа	\$ 24.50	\$ 25.20	No Bid	\$ 23.77
16	1-1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90	15 ea	\$ 47.00	\$ 48.19	No Bid	\$ 45.65
	# 261 Clamps (Single Band)					
17	2"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 2.35-2.63	5 ea	\$ 58.75	\$ 57.92	No Bid	\$ 54.87
18	4" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41	5 ea	\$ 75.95	\$ 74.25	No Bid	\$ 70.35
19	4" x 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14	5 ea	\$ 116.50	\$ 113.93	No Bid	\$ 107.94
20	4" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14	5 ea	\$ 126.55	\$ 126.53	No Bid	\$ 119.87
21	6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96	2 ea	\$ 82.10	\$ 83.91	No Bid	\$ 79.49
22	6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24	36 ea	\$ 84.50	\$ 86.57	No Bid	\$ 82.02
23	6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45	5 ea	\$ 93.05	\$ 87.86	No Bid	\$ 83.24
24	6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24	20 ea	\$ 145.00	\$ 138.75	No Bid	\$ 131.45
25	6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45	10 ea	\$ 148.15	\$ 140.03	No Bid	\$ 132.66
26	6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96	2 ea	\$ 167.50	\$ 152.65	No Bid	\$ 144.62
27	6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24	20 ea	\$ 157.15	\$ 153.68	No Bid	\$ 145.60
28	6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45	2 ea	\$ 157.15	\$ 156.95	No Bid	\$ 148.69
29	8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94	2 ea	\$ 102.00	\$ 100.58	No Bid	\$ 95.29

	WATER MATERIALS - SECTI	ON D: COL	JPLINGS, CL	S - SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES	NG SLEEVES	
07	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE &	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
30	8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39	15 ea	\$ 102.00	\$ 101.23	No Bid	\$ 95.91
31	8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 9.05-9.39 (Part #90507)	4 ea	\$ 102.00	\$ 101.23	No Bid	\$ 95.91
32	8" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94	10 ea	\$ 165.00	\$ 147.25	No Bid	\$ 152.59
33	8" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39	10 ea	\$ 165.00	\$ 161.69	No Bid	\$ 153.18
34	8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94	2 ea	\$ 180.50	\$ 184.61	No Bid	\$ 174.89
35	8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39	10 ea	\$ 185.00	\$ 185.87	No Bid	\$ 176.09
36	10" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44	2 ea	\$ 236.75	\$ 239.35	No Bid	\$ 226.76
	# 262 Clamps (Double Band)					
37	6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64	2 ea	\$ 135.35	\$ 132.38	No Bid	\$ 125.41
38	6" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64	2 ea	\$ 247.00	\$ 249.29	No Bid	\$ 236.17
39	8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79	2 ea	\$ 150.95	\$ 150.94	No Bid	\$ 142.99
40	8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79	2 ea	\$ 280.00	\$ 284.55	No Bid	\$ 269.58
41	10" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90	2 ea	\$ 340.00	\$ 353.80	No Bid	\$ 335.18
42	10"x20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90	2 ea	\$ 450.00	\$ 471.34	No Bid	\$ 446.54

	WATER MATERIALS - SECTI	ON D: COL	JPLINGS, CL	- SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES	NG SLEEVES	
70	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
	# 662 Wet Tap Saddles					
43	6"x4" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662	2 ea	\$ 560.00	\$ 574.22	No Bid	\$ 544.00
44	6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe #662	2 ea	\$ 625.00	\$ 622.85	No Bid	\$ 590.07
45	6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662	5 ea	\$ 625.00	\$ 625.31	No Bid	\$ 590.07
46	8"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662	2 ea	\$ 770.00	\$ 781.78	No Bid	\$ 740.63
47	8"x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662	2 ea	\$ 950.00	\$ 976.42	No Bid	\$ 925.03

	WATER MATERIALS -	- SECTION E:		BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES	SADDLES	
MOT	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE &	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
_	3/4" Angle Ball Meter Stop BA13-232W	100 ea	₩	\$ 40.62	\$ 42.90	\$ 37.48
2	3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve, BA23-332-W	50 ea	\$ 71.30	\$ 83.25	\$ 83.60	\$ 68.43
က	3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve, BA43-232-W	50 ea	\$ 42.90	\$ 50.18	\$ 50.35	\$ 44.02
4	3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve BA-43-332-W	50 ea	\$ 72.45	\$ 85.67	\$ 86.00	\$ 75.23
2	1" Angle Ball Meter Valve BA43-444-W	50 ea	\$ 109.60	\$ 128.55	\$ 129.00	\$ 112.87
9	1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female) KV13-444W (Stops)	50 ea	\$ 46.00	\$ 26.98	\$ 54.00	\$ 47.31
7	1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Flare) KV23- 444 W	50 ea	\$ 48.95	\$ 55.44	\$ 57.50	\$ 50.43
8	1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Compression) KV43-444W (Stops)	50 ea	\$ 52.50	\$ 59.44	\$ 61.70	\$ 53.99
6	1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop B11-666W	6 ea	\$ 159.70	\$ 188.81	\$ 188.00	\$ 164.42
10	2" Ball Valve Curb Stop B11-777-W	6 ea	\$ 233.25	\$ 274.90	\$ 274.00	\$ 239.51
11	3/4" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-3	100 ea	\$ 46.55	\$ 52.78	\$ 54.75	\$ 47.96
12	1" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-4	50 ea	\$ 60.75	\$ 69.45	\$ 72.00	\$ 63.06
13	1 1/2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-6	10 ea	\$ 137.75	\$ 156.73	\$ 161.50	\$ 141.33
14	2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-7	15 ea	\$ 226.83	\$ 259.18	\$ 267.00	\$ 233.76
15	3/4" Insert, #51	500 ea	\$ 1.70	\$ 1.08	\$ 2.10	\$ 1.66

	WATER MATERIALS		SECTION E:		BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES	SADDLES	
ИО7	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD	AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description		Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
16	1" Insert, #52		500 ea	\$ 1.83	\$ 1.24	\$ 2.25	\$ 1.76
17	1.5" Insert #54		300 еа	\$ 2.37	\$ 2.30	\$ 3.05	\$ 2.42
18	2" Insert #55		300 ea	\$ 2.37	\$ 2.37	\$ 3.05	\$ 2.42
19	3/4"x1" A-24 Adapters		20 ea	\$ 25.00	No Bid	\$ 28.20	\$ 25.52
20	3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-14-33	75 ea	\$ 15.20	\$ 17.91	\$ 17.80	\$ 15.63
21	3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-84-33	100 ea	\$ 14.45	\$ 16.71	\$ 16.95	\$ 14.85
22	3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L	L-84-33	100 ea	\$ 15.80	\$ 17.38	\$ 18.55	\$ 16.27
23	3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-44-33	22 ea	\$ 17.55	\$ 20.40	\$ 20.50	\$ 18.09
24	3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L	L-14-33	50 ea	\$ 20.50	\$ 25.83	\$ 24.05	\$ 21.08
25	1" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-14-44	ea 05	\$ 20.60	\$ 25.62	\$ 24.20	\$ 21.21
26	1" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-84-44	50 ea	\$ 17.05	\$ 19.76	\$ 20.05	\$ 17.60
27	1" Pack Joint Coupling C	C-44-44	50 ea	\$ 20.15	\$ 22.56	\$ 23.60	\$ 20.69
28	1" Pack Joint Coupling L	L-14-44	50 ea	\$ 33.15	\$ 38.78	\$ 39.25	\$ 34.38
29	1" Pack Joint Coupling L	L-84-44	50 ea	\$ 26.10	\$ 30.03	\$ 30.90	\$ 27.07
30	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling (C-14-66	12 ea	\$ 59.90	\$ 69.84	\$ 70.50	\$ 61.66
31	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling (C-44-66	12 ea	\$ 59.75	\$ 78.45	\$ 79.15	\$ 69.27
32	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling (C-84-66	12 ea	\$ 46.60	\$ 54.62	\$ 55.10	\$ 48.21

	WATER MATERIA	ALS - SE	SECTION E:	1	BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES	SADDLES	
TOM	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AW	ARD					TEBID
Item #	Description	_	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
33	1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-66	96	12 ea	\$ 76.35	\$ 89.10	\$ 89.90	\$ 78.63
34	2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-77		12 ea	\$ 70.65	\$ 83.23	\$ 83.90	\$ 73.42
35	2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-77		12 ea	\$ 90.00	\$ 105.96	\$ 106.90	\$ 93.52
36	2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-77		18 ea	\$ 67.35	\$ 79.57	\$ 80.30	\$ 70.24
37	2" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-77	1.2	12 ea	\$ 121.00	\$ 113.76	\$ 142.25	\$ 124.42
38	2" Pack Joint Coupling L-44-77	77	12 ea	\$ 188.05	\$ 221.16	\$ 223.10	\$ 195.17
39	2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-	-77	12 ea	\$ 109.80	\$ 127.68	\$ 128.70	\$ 112.69
40	3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee T-444-333	-333	12 ea	\$ 42.65	\$ 46.88	\$ 50.10	\$ 43.79
41	1"x1"x1" Comp Tee T-444-444	-444	12 ea	\$ 45.55	\$ 65.02	\$ 53.50	\$ 46.86
42	1" x 3/4" Brass Bushing CC Threa	ad	100 ea	\$ 14.80	No Bid	\$ 18.30	\$ 15.00
43	1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thr	read	12 ea	\$ 40.10	No Bid	\$ 49.50	\$ 40.00
44	2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing		12 ea	\$ 48.10	No Bid	\$ 60.25	\$ 48.50
45	3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple		12 ea	\$ 3.45	\$ 3.77	\$ 6.05	\$ 3.70
46	1"x 3" Brass Nipple		12 ea	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.38	\$ 8.80	\$ 5.35
47	1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple		12 ea	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.44	\$ 15.50	\$ 9.37
48	2" x 3" Brass Nipple		12 ea	\$ 11.35	\$ 11.28	\$ 19.75	\$ 12.00
49	2" x 6" Brass Nipple		12 ea	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.80	\$ 38.20	\$ 23.20

	WATER MATERIALS -	SECTION E:		BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES	SADDLES	
TOM	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE &	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
50	3/4" Copper Setter VB72-12W-44-33	50 ea	\$ 106.85	\$ 126.05	\$ 125.00	\$ 109.60
51	1" Copper Setter VB74-12W-44-44	50 ea	\$ 211.00	\$ 243.48	\$ 247.00	\$ 216.40
52	1 1/2" Copper Setter VBB76-15B-44-66	12 ea	\$ 951.50	\$ 1,112.35	\$ 1,136.00	\$ 993.61
53	2" Copper Setter VBB77-15B-44-77	12 ea	\$ 1,130.00	\$ 1,217.84	\$ 1,331.00	\$ 1,164.31
54	Service Saddle 2"x1" CC	12 ea	\$ 57.00	\$ 59.37	No Bid	\$ 56.25
22	Service Saddle 4"x3/4" CC	вө 9	\$ 56.45	\$ 57.05	\$ 82.75	\$ 54.05
99	Service Saddle 4" x 1" CC	е 9	\$ 56.45	\$ 57.05	\$ 82.75	\$ 54.05
22	Service Saddle 4"x 1-1/2" CC	6 еа	\$ 58.25	\$ 62.74	\$ 88.30	\$ 59.44
28	Service Saddle 4" x 2" CC	6 ea	\$ 64.45	\$ 68.72	\$ 88.30	\$ 65.11
69	Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC	12 ea	\$ 67.50	\$ 65.55	\$ 84.15	\$ 62.11
09	Service Saddle 6"x1" CC	ea 09	\$ 67.50	\$ 65.55	\$ 84.15	\$ 62.00
61	Service Saddle 6"x 1-1/2" CC	6 ea	\$ 71.00	\$ 71.20	\$ 90.80	\$ 67.45
62	Service Saddle 6"x2" CC	е 9	\$ 77.00	\$ 78.56	\$ 90.80	\$ 74.43
63	Service Saddle 8"x 3/4" CC	6 ea	\$ 75.75	\$ 77.45	\$ 101.25	\$ 73.38
64	Service Saddle 8"x1" CC	50 ea	\$ 75.75	\$ 77.45	\$ 101.25	\$ 73.30
9	Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC	е еа	\$ 80.25	\$ 83.82	\$ 108.95	\$ 79.41
99	Service Saddle 8"x2"CC	6 ea	\$ 86.60	\$ 91.44	\$ 108.95	\$ 86.63

	WASTEWATER MATE	ERIALS - SECTION F:		MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS	IGS, FITTINGS	
LOV	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
	Manhole Frames, Covers & Gasket					
1	8" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687	5 ea	\$ 840.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 859.64
2	7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797	10 ea	\$ 315.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 349.39
3	5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A	10 ea	\$ 365.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 411.07
4	Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24	10 ea	\$ 370.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 411.63
5	Lamp Hole Box & Lid	10 ea	\$ 230.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 247.60
	Sewer Couplings (Hubs) INDIANA SEAL ONLY	L ONLY				
9	4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC	25 ea	\$ 6.10	\$ 5.95	No Bid	\$ 5.03
2	4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC	50 ea	\$ 6.10	\$ 5.95	No Bid	\$ 5.03
8	6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC	20 ea	\$ 14.55	\$ 12.74	No Bid	\$ 11.00
6	6" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC	40 ea	\$ 14.55	\$ 12.74	No Bid	\$ 11.00
10	8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC	30 ea	\$ 22.40	\$ 19.60	No Bid	\$ 16.55
11	8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC	100 ea	\$ 22.40	\$ 19.60	No Bid	\$ 16.55
12	10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC	12 ea	\$ 33.60	\$ 29.43	No Bid	\$ 24.83
13	10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC	24 ea	\$ 30.60	\$ 29.43	No Bid	\$ 24.83
14	12" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC	12 ea	\$ 39.25	\$ 34.34	No Bid	\$ 28.98
15	12" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC	12 ea	\$ 39.25	\$ 34.34	No Bid	\$ 28.98

	WASTEWATER MATE	ERIALS - SECTION F:		MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS	AGS, FITTINGS	
ΓO	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD	-				TIE BID
Item #	# Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
	Fittings & Tap Saddles					
16	4" PVC 45° Elbow SCH 40 DWV	100 ea	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.54	No Bid	\$ 7.52
17	4" PVC 22 1/2" Elbow SCH 40 DWV	24 ea	\$ 16.75	\$ 11.44	No Bid	\$ 8.78
18	6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26	12 ea	\$ 65.00	\$ 41.96	No Bid	\$ 37.75
19	8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26	12 ea	\$ 125.00	\$ 104.25	No Bid	\$ 93.81
20	6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt	20 ea.	\$ 47.50	\$ 33.82	No Bid	\$ 34.92
	with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch		Partner			
21	8x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt	40 ea.	\$ 59.15	\$ 42.52	No Bid	\$ 46.48
	with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch					
22	10x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt	20 ea.	\$ 87.25	\$ 142.73	No Bid	\$ 67.61
	with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch					
23	12x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt	12 ea.	\$ 100.00	\$ 177.05	No Bid	\$ 83.87
	with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch					
24	1 1/2" Preformed Flex Plastic -	.10 bxs.	\$ 106.32	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.00
	Gasket (Ram-Nek)					
25	Romac Tap Saddle CB 4"	12 ea.	\$ 143.00	\$ 127.28	No Bid	\$ 120.72
	Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe					
26	Romac Tap Saddle CB 6"	12 ea.	\$ 176.05	\$ 169.67	No Bid	\$ 160.92
	Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe					

	WASTEWATER MATE	RIALS - SEC	TION E: MANI	ERIALS - SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS	IGS, FITTINGS	
LO	LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD					TIE BID
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	CORE & MAIN	FERGUSON	FORTILINE	UTILITY SUPPLY
27	27 4" Rubber Test Cap	20 ea.	\$ 4.63 \$	\$ 2.51	No Bid	\$ 2.50
28	28 5" Rubber Test Cap	20 ea.	\$ 6.80	\$ 3.72	No Bid	\$ 3.50
29	29 3" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps	20 ea.	\$ 75.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.00
30	30 4" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps	20 ea.	\$ 80.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.00



Agenda Item June 28, 2022

Prepared by Terry Lauritsen Water Utilities

I. SUBJECT, ATTACHMENTS, AND BACKGROUND

Discuss and take action to award water treatment chemicals for the Water Treatment Plant, presented by Mayor Dale Copeland.

Budget and Source of Funds: \$767,500 - Water Plant Operating Fund

Attachments:

Bid tabulation

STAFF COMMENTS AND ANALYSIS 11.

Bids for water treatment chemicals are taken on an annual basis. Due to volatilities in the chemical market, the bid was structured for a 90-day price guarantee with the option for up to three 90 day renewals upon mutual agreement of both the City and vendor. Bid packets were advertised in the local newspaper and sent to 25 vendors. Ten (10) bids were received and shown on the attached bid tabulation. Materials are purchased on an as needed basis.

The total bid price for the water treatment chemicals is \$1,190,564.00, which represents a 52.15% increase from last fiscal year. The bids, if held through the entire fiscal year, are over the operating budget by \$423,064, which will likely be more than available in the budget. There is \$6MM in water operational reserves that can be utilized if needed. .

III. RECOMMENDED ACTION

Staff recommends award to the vendor who submitted the low bid meeting specifications, which are highlighted within the attached bid tabulation.

Council Member or Staff Member

City of Bartlesville

Water Treatment Chemical Bid #2022-2023-002 Recommended Bid Award

LEGEND: SHADED AREA - RECOMMEND AWARD

CHEMICAL:	Chlorine Gas	Hydrofluorosilicic Acid	Potassium Permanganate	Coagulant	ACH	Coagulation Aid	Drying Bed Polymer	Polyphosphate	Sodium Hydroxide	Aqueous	Powdered Activated Carbon
Est. Quantity	60 TON	15,000 GALLONS	50,000 LBS	720 TON	12 TOTES	6,000 LBS	15,000 LBS	60,000 LBS	450,000 LBS	60 TON	46.000 LBS
Brenntag Southwest Inc.	\$1,965.000		\$4.750 \$2.85 alternate	\$1,180.000	\$1,732.500	\$3.190	\$2.640	\$0.880	\$0.2938	\$478.000	\$1.140
Carus Corporation								\$0.980			
Chemrite, Inc.			\$2.760					\$1.650			\$1.650
Chemtrade Chemicals US, LLC.				\$1,080.000							
Hawkins, Inc.			\$4.950		.61 lb		\$3.01 praestol	\$0.640			
Lhoist North America of Texas LLC									\$549.43 wet		
Pencco. Inc.		\$3.9576 gal									
Polydyne Inc.						\$2.310 lb.					
Shannon Chemical Corporation			\$2.44 lb.					\$1.18 lb			
USALCO, LLC				\$818/tn	.6040 wet lb						

Notes: 1. This product did not meet minimum specifications.