
 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 

 
NOTICE OF SPECIAL MEETING  

OF THE  
BARTLESVILLE CITY COUNCIL 

 
Monday, July 24, 2023 

5:30 p.m. 
 

Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr. 
918-338-4282 

 

Council Chambers at City Hall 
401 S. Johnstone Avenue 
Bartlesville, OK 74003 

 
 

AGENDA 
 
 

1. Call to order the business meeting of the Bartlesville City Council by Vice Mayor Curd. 
 

2. Roll Call and Establishment of a Quorum. 
 

3. Invocation. 
 

4. Citizens to be heard. 
 

5. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2023-2024-001 for water and 
wastewater line repair materials. Presented by Councilmember Roszel. 
 

6. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2023-2024-002 for water treatment 
chemicals. Presented by Councilmember Roszel. 
 

7. Update on the City of Bartlesville Water Supply. Presented by Terry Lauritsen, Director of 
Water Utilities. 
 

8. Discuss and take possible action to approve a Resolution repealing Emergency Water 
Rates established by Resolution 3670. Presented by Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water 
Utilities. 
 

9. Discuss and take possible action re-establishing the Bartlesville Water Resources 
Committee; setting terms of office for committee members; declaring the process for 
selection and appointment of Committee members; setting responsibilities of the 
Committee; and appointing Initial Committee Members. Presented by Mike Bailey, City 
Manager. 
 

10. City Manager and Staff Reports. 
 

11. City Council Comments and Inquiries. 
 

12. Adjournment. 
 
The Notice of Meeting and Agenda was received and filed in the Office of the City Clerk at 
5:00 p.m. Thursday, July 20, 2023 and posted in prominent public view at City Hall same day 
at 5:00 p.m.  
 



 
 
 

      Jason Muninger         /s/ Elaine Banes 
 
Jason Muninger, CFO/City Clerk            by Elaine Banes, Deputy City Clerk 
 
City of Bartlesville Agendas and Packets: https://www.cityofbartlesville.org/city-government/city-council/meeting-agendas/ 
 
*Live Streaming: https://www.cityofbartlesville.org/city-government/city-council/webcast/ 
*Televised on Sparklight Channel 56 
*Workshop portions of City Council meetings will not be live streamed or televised. The public is welcome to attend in person. 
 
Open Meetings Act Compliance (25 O.S. Sec. 301 et seq.): all discussion items are subject to possible action by the City Council. Official action 
can only be taken on items which appear on the agenda. The City Council may adopt, approve, ratify, deny, defer, recommend, amend, strike, or 
continue any agenda item. When more information is needed to act on an item, the City Council may refer the matter to the City Manager, Staff or 
City Attorney, or back to a committee or other recommending body. Under certain circumstance, items are deferred to a specific later date or stricken 
from the agenda entirely. Agenda items requiring a public hearing as required by law will be so noted. The City Council may at their discretion change 
the order of the business agenda items. City of Bartlesville encourages participation from all its citizens. If participation at any public meeting is not 
possible due to a disability, notification to the city Clerk at least one working day prior to the scheduled meeting is encouraged to make the necessary 
accommodations. The City may waive this rule if signing is not the necessary accommodation. 
 

https://www.cityofbartlesville.org/city-government/city-council/meeting-agendas/
https://www.cityofbartlesville.org/city-government/city-council/webcast/
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                                            

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon           
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                             
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

A-1 3/4" PE Pipe   C.T.S. 1000 ft 0.38$               0.31$                 NO BID 0.29$                  0.31$              

A-2 1" PE Pipe  C.T.S. 500 ft 0.62$               0.51$                 NO BID 0.49$                  0.50$              

A-3 1-1/2" PE Pipe  C.T.S 600 ft 1.05$               1.08$                 NO BID 1.02$                  1.10$              

A-4 2" PE Pipe  C.T.S. 3000 ft 1.60$               1.83$                 NO BID 1.70$                  1.76$              

A-5 4" C-900 DR 18 200 ft 5.66$               8.57$                 NO BID 6.02$                  6.22$              

A-6 6" C-900 DR 18 200 ft 11.57$             17.52$               NO BID 12.29$                12.70$            

A-7 4" SCH 40 PVC 400 ft 3.50$               6.17$                 NO BID 3.40$                  3.65$              

A-8 6" PVC SDR 26 500 ft 6.88$               10.41$               NO BID 7.78$                  7.55$              

A-9 8" PVC SDR 26 1000 ft 12.44$             18.85$               NO BID 13.27$                13.67$            

A-10 10" PVC SDR 26 100 ft 19.38$             29.34$               NO BID 20.60$                22.24$            

A-11 Poly Wrap (bid per roll 200' per roll) 10 rl 89.00$             122.75$             NO BID 74.00$                166.93$          

A-12
Caution Tape (bid per roll 3,000' per roll)  
ALL OTHER VENDORS BID 1,000' 
ROLLS

10 rl 15.00$             7.81$                 NO BID 10.00$                15.09$            

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION A:  PIPE & TUBING
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                                            

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon           
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                             
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION A:  PIPE & TUBING

A-13 Detectable Locator Tape (bid per roll  
1,000' per roll) 5 rl 26.00$             7.81$                 NO BID 17.50$                63.23$            

A-14 Poly Tape (bid per roll  200' per roll) 5 rl 8.00$               4.00$                 NO BID 10.00$                6.88$              

A-15 #12 Solid Wire THHN 500' roll (bid per roll) 12 rl 87.50$             108.13$             NO BID 70.00$                35.00$            
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN     

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                    
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

B-1 4" Mega Lugs (DIP) 8 ea 45.00$               39.71$                NO BID 37.62$                44.67$              

B-2 4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge 8 ea 49.80$               45.64$                NO BID 43.24$                49.99$              

B-3 6" Mega Lugs (DIP) 30 ea 56.80$               49.05$                NO BID 46.47$                57.16$              

B-4 6" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea 69.50$               57.14$                NO BID 54.14$                64.44$              

B-5 8" Mega Lugs (DIP) 10 ea 73.75$               66.84$                NO BID 63.33$                74.51$              

B-6 8" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea 83.50$               77.08$                NO BID 73.03$                83.99$              

B-7 14" Mega Lugs (DIP) w/10 wedge 2 ea 192.45$             169.92$              NO BID 160.98$              209.43$            

B-8 14" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/10 wedge 2 ea 240.00$             221.96$              NO BID 210.28$              261.01$            

B-9 6" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2 ea 72.15$               201.12$              NO BID 76.50$                77.35$              

B-10 8" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2 ea 98.00$               271.68$              NO BID 103.50$              104.68$            

B-11 6" MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2 ea 69.00$               196.96$              NO BID 72.88$                73.65$              

B-12 8" MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2 ea 108.00$             283.64$              NO BID 114.00$              115.33$            

B-13 4" MJ 45° Bend 2 ea 48.00$               148.48$              NO BID 50.40$                50.95$              

B-14 6" MJ 45° Bend 15 ea 76.00$               205.28$              NO BID 80.21$                81.06$              

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION B:  DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN     

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                    
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION B:  DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

B-15 8" MJ 45° Bend 5 ea 110.15$             286.76$              NO BID 116.85$              118.11$            

B-16 6" MJ 90° Bend 6 ea 93.25$               226.60$              NO BID 99.00$                100.05$            

B-17 8" MJ 90° Bend 3 ea 135.00$             316.40$              NO BID 143.00$              144.51$            

B-18 4" MJ Bolt Pack 24 ea 15.80$               18.20$                NO BID 16.04$                21.30$              

B-19 4" MJ Plug 2 ea 27.15$               48.61$                NO BID 28.42$                28.72$              

B-20 6" MJ Plug 2 ea 50.20$               79.06$                NO BID 53.00$                53.73$              

B-21 8" MJ Plug 2 ea 74.00$               111.57$              NO BID 78.25$                79.20$              

B-22 4 x 2 MJ Plug 2 ea 50.00$               75.65$                NO BID 52.25$                52.80$              

B-23 8 x 6 MJ Reducer 2 ea 79.00$               229.38$              NO BID 83.50$                84.76$              

B-24 6 x 6 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee 6 ea 137.00$             357.06$              NO BID 163.50$              165.35$            

B-25 8 x 8 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee 4 ea 197.00$             443.74$              NO BID 204.50$              207.04$            

B-26 6 x 6 x 6 MJ Straight Tee 6 ea 134.00$             332.62$              NO BID 142.00$              143.58$            

B-27 8 x 8 x 6 MJ Straight Tee 4 ea 166.00$             411.01$              NO BID 176.00$              177.86$            

B-28 8 x 8 x 8 MJ Straight Tee 4 ea 200.00$             472.52$              NO BID 212.50$              214.91$            
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN     

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                    
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION B:  DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

B-29 4 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2 ea 50.00$               75.65$                NO BID 52.25$                52.80$              

B-30 6 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 4 ea 72.75$               108.91$              NO BID 76.50$                77.35$              

B-31 8 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2 ea 96.15$               254.57$              NO BID 102.20$              103.29$            

B-32 4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 8 ea 51.00$               152.12$              NO BID 53.50$                54.19$              

B-33 6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 24 ea 85.00$               216.20$              NO BID 89.75$                90.78$              

B-34 8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length) 8 ea 136.00$             317.96$              NO BID 144.00$              145.90$            

B-35 10" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 2 ea 163.00$             370.40$              NO BID 172.75$              174.62$            

B-36 3/4"x4" T Bolts 100 ea 1.95$                 2.48$                  NO BID 1.97$                  1.99$                
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN      
Jared Barnes            
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Merchant      
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

C-1 3" Fire Hydrant Meter 3 ea 2,250.00$          NO BID NO BID 1,200.00$         529.25$            

C-2 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Mueller 8 ea 395.00$             230.47$              NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-3 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Kennedy, 
KB-10 8 ea 425.00$             NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-4 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, Kennedy, 
KB-10 4 ea 425.00$             NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-5 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, U.S. 6 ea 350.00$             NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-6 Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury 3 ea 2,500.00$          3,002.03$           NO BID 2,600.00$         2,395.66$         

C-7 Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury 2 ea 2,545.00$          3,075.13$           NO BID 2,660.00$         2,454.03$         

C-8 Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury 2 ea 2,600.00$          3,148.47$           NO BID 2,724.00$         2,512.95$         

C-9 Fire Hydrant, 4.5 Bury 3 ea 2,675.00$          3,221.45$           NO BID 2,787.00$         2,570.75$         

C-10 Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury 3 ea 2,725.00$          3,291.13$           NO BID 2,850.00$         2,629.11$         

C-11 Traffic Repair Kits for Mueller Centruian 
022MUA301 3 ea 320.00$             345.83$              NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-12 Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids 
(Carson 1730-18 HDPE) 15 ea 325.00$             345.89$              NO BID NO BID 307.37$            

C-13 Small Meter Boxes Complete with Lids 
(Carson 2200-18) 150ea. 135.00$             116.31$              NO BID NO BID 124.44$            

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION C:  VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN      
Jared Barnes            
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Merchant      
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION C:  VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

C-14 Small Meter Boxes (Carson 2200-18) 300 ea 57.65$               63.52$                NO BID NO BID 54.66$              

C-15 Small Meter Box Lids 50 ea 75.75$               42.45$                NO BID NO BID 74.10$              

C-16 Thru the lid flange & nut (Nepune) for 
attaching AMI antennas 200 ea 27.50$               71.46$                NO BID NO BID NO BID

C-17 5 1/4" x 2 1/4" Valve Box Extension 24 ea 23.00$               27.66$                NO BID 24.50$              21.58$              

C-18 5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension 20 ea 28.70$               40.57$                NO BID 35.75$              33.69$              

C-19 Valve Box, Short Adj. 10"-Top 16"-Bottom 
COMPLETE 36 ea 63.90$               NO BID NO BID 61.50$              68.83$              

C-20 Valve Box, Tall Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom 
COMPLETE 50 ea 74.00$               92.20$                NO BID 82.00$              82.11$              

C-21 10" Valve Box Tops 10 ea 19.25$               23.04$                NO BID 20.50$              22.95$              

C-22 16" Valve Box Tops 10 ea 29.25$               34.47$                NO BID 30.25$              30.38$              

C-23 16" Valve Box Bottoms 10 ea 25.00$               NO BID NO BID 27.90$              32.12$              

C-24 24" Valve Box Bottoms 10 ea 37.75$               42.58$                NO BID 38.50$              38.59$              

C-25 3" RW MJ Gate Valve 3 ea 575.00$             740.78$              NO BID 585.00$            555.89$            

C-26 4" RW MJ Gate Valve 6 ea 650.00$             829.07$              NO BID 650.00$            621.19$            
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN      
Jared Barnes            
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Merchant      
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION C:  VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

C-27 6" RW MJ Gate Valve 25 ea 840.00$             1,055.35$           NO BID 839.00$            792.69$            

C-28 8" RW MJ Gate Valve 5ea. 1,300.00$          1,652.95$           NO BID 1,335.00$         1,262.55$         

C-29 4" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 1ea. 615.00$             984.60$              NO BID 829.00$            783.65$            

C-30 6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 10ea. 850.00$             1,382.94$           NO BID 1,670.00$         1,106.99$         

C-31 8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 5ea. 1,300.00$          2,042.56$           NO BID 1,727.00$         1,643.23$         

C-32 Water Sample Stations Eclipse #88 5ea. 1,100.00$          1,215.42$           NO BID NO BID 1,117.67$         
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN            

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Weldon                
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                       
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

Couplings (Stainless Steel Nuts & Bolts)

D-1 1" Bolted Coupling 20 ea 39.45$               42.46$              NO BID 38.50$              42.28$              

D-2 1.5" Bolted Coupling 12 ea 45.00$               48.26$              NO BID 43.50$              48.03$              

D-3 2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411 24 ea 46.65$               52.09$              NO BID 46.25$              51.85$              

D-4 3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21 2 ea 131.80$             141.78$            NO BID 128.50$            141.11$            

D-5 4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33 6 ea 160.10$             176.03$            NO BID 159.75$            175.20$            

D-6 6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65 20 ea 222.00$             244.03$            NO BID 220.00$            242.89$            

D-7 8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90 15 ea 267.00$             293.47$            NO BID 264.00$            292.09$            

D-8 10" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 10.65-12.20 4 ea 480.00$             516.12$            NO BID 460.00$            513.70$            

D-9 12" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 12.75 - 14.40 4 ea 568.75$             605.04$            NO BID 545.00$            602.20$            

D-10 3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 36 ea 11.50$               34.67$              NO BID 11.75$              NO BID

D-11 1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 30 ea 13.00$               39.98$              NO BID 13.25$              NO BID

D-12 2" Galv. Comp. Coupling #522 24 ea 23.70$               70.25$              NO BID 24.00$              NO BID

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN            

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Weldon                
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                       
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

# 248 Clamps

D-13 1-1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 6 ea 21.00$               23.51$              NO BID 21.25$              23.40$              

D-14 1-1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 15 ea 41.00$               45.16$              NO BID 41.00$              44.95$              

# 261 Clamps (Single Band)

D-15 2"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 2.35-2.63 5 ea 52.00$               54.28$              NO BID 49.25$              54.03$              

D-16 4" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41 5 ea 62.00$               69.59$              NO BID 63.25$              69.26$              

D-17 4" x 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5 ea 95.00$               106.79$            NO BID 97.00$              106.29$            

D-18 4" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5 ea 105.40$             118.59$            NO BID 106.00$            118.04$            

D-19 6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2 ea 70.00$               78.65$              NO BID 70.75$              78.28$              

D-20 6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 36 ea 72.25$               81.13$              NO BID 73.00$              80.76$              

D-21 6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 5 ea 73.65$               82.74$              NO BID 74.00$              81.96$              

D-22 6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea 115.80$             130.04$            NO BID 117.00$            129.44$            

D-23 6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 10 ea 116.85$             131.24$            NO BID 117.75$            130.63$            

D-24 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2 ea 126.45$             142.00$            NO BID 127.75$            141.33$            
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN            

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Weldon                
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                       
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

D-25 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea 127.50$             143.17$            NO BID 128.75$            142.55$            

D-26 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 2 ea 127.50$             144.39$            NO BID 129.90$            143.71$            

D-27 8" x 7-1/2"  Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2 ea 83.95$               94.27$              NO BID 84.80$              93.83$              

D-28 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 15 ea 83.95$               94.87$              NO BID 85.25$              94.43$              

D-29 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 9.05-9.39 (Part 
#90507) 4 ea 83.95$               94.87$              NO BID 85.25$              94.43$              

D-30 8" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 10 ea 130.00$             150.94$            NO BID 135.00$            150.25$            

D-31 8" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10 ea 130.00$             151.53$            NO BID 136.00$            150.83$            

D-32 8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2 ea 154.00$             173.01$            NO BID 155.00$            172.20$            

D-33 8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10 ea 155.10$             174.20$            NO BID 156.50$            173.38$            

D-34 10" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44 2 ea 201.90$             224.32$            NO BID 199.75$            223.28$            

# 262 Clamps (Double Band)

D-35 6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2 ea 110.45$             124.07$            NO BID 110.25$            123.49$            

D-36 6" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2 ea 208.05$             233.66$            NO BID 208.00$            232.53$            
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN            

Kenzie                        
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE               
Mike Weldon                
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                       
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

D-37 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2 ea 126.00$             141.45$            NO BID 125.96$            140.79$            

D-38 8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2 ea 240.00$             266.68$            NO BID 237.48$            265.43$            

D-39 10" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2 ea 295.00$             331.57$            NO BID 295.27$            330.02$            

D-40 10"x20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2 ea 390.00$             441.73$            NO BID 393.38$            439.66$            

# 264 Clamps

D-41 6"x7.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea 98.50$               110.66$            NO BID 98.50$              110.13$            

D-42 6"x12.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.56-6.96 20ea. 140.00$             158.39$            NO BID 141.00$            157.65$            

D-43 6"x15"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20 ea 153.75$             172.68$            NO BID 153.75$            171.88$            

# 662 Wet Tap Saddles

D-44 6"x4" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2 ea 415.00$             462.39$            NO BID 397.00$            460.22$            

D-45 6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe #662 2 ea 490.00$             550.70$            NO BID 490.00$            548.11$            

D-46 6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 5 ea 490.00$             550.92$            NO BID 485.00$            548.33$            

D-47 8"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2 ea 561.35$             630.35$            NO BID 556.00$            627.39$            

D-48 8"x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2 ea 736.60$             827.15$            NO BID 729.00$            823.28$            

12



WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                      

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE                
Mike Weldon             
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY SUPPLY          
Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

E-1 3/4" Angle Ball Meter Stop                     
BA13-232W 100 ea 40.37$              44.69$               41.98$            41.00$                 39.82$              

E-2 3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,                 
BA23-332-W 50 ea 78.75$              91.60$               81.84$            79.16$                 79.26$              

E-3 3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,                                 
BA43-232-W 50 ea 47.45$              55.21$               49.28$            47.66$                 46.75$              

E-4 3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve                        
BA-43-332-W 50 ea 80.10$              94.24$               84.17$            81.44$                 79.83$              

E-5 1" Angle Ball Meter Valve                        
BA43-444-W 50 ea 121.00$            141.43$             126.31$          122.20$               119.80$            

E-6 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female) 
KV13-444W (Stops) 50 ea 50.65$              54.56$               52.90$            51.22$                 50.18$              

E-7 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Flare) KV23-
444 W 50 ea 54.15$              60.99$               56.45$            65.00$                 54.67$              

E-8 1" Angle Key Meter Valve 
(Compression) KV43-444W (Stops) 50 ea 58.00$              65.40$               60.39$            58.45$                 57.28$              

E-9 1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop                 
B11-666W 6 ea 176.50$            207.71$             184.35$          178.00$               178.53$            

E-10 2" Ball Valve Curb Stop                       
B11-777-W 6 ea 257.00$            302.42$             268.23$          258.00$               254.41$            

E-11 3/4" Ball Corp Stop   FB-1000-3 100 ea 51.45$              58.08$               53.64$            51.92$                 50.88$              

E-12 1" Ball Corp Stop         FB-1000-4 50 ea 67.15$              76.41$               70.54$            68.27$                 66.91$              

E-13 1 1/2" Ball Corp Stop   FB-1000-6 10 ea 152.00$            172.41$             158.14$          153.00$               153.15$            

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION E:  BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                      

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE                
Mike Weldon             
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY SUPPLY          
Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION E:  BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

E-14 2" Ball Corp Stop         FB-1000-7 15 ea 250.00$            285.13$             261.57$          253.06$               248.09$            

E-15 3/4" Insert, #51 500 ea 1.55$                1.67$                 2.02$              1.53$                   1.92$                

E-16 1" Insert, #52 500 ea 1.65$                1.70$                 2.15$              1.62$                   2.05$                

E-17 1.5" Insert #54 300 ea 2.25$                2.20$                 2.96$              2.23$                   2.87$                

E-18 2" Insert #55 300 ea 2.25$                2.28$                 2.96$              2.23$                   2.81$                

E-19 3/4"x1" A-24 Adapters 50 ea 26.65$              NO BID 13.82$            26.68$                 13.11$              

E-20 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling    C-14-33 75 ea 16.75$              19.70$               17.48$            16.93$                 16.41$              

E-21 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling    C-84-33 100 ea 15.95$              18.37$               16.63$            16.08$                 15.62$              

E-22 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling    L-84-33 100 ea 17.50$              19.12$               18.21$            18.00$                 17.27$              

E-23 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling    C-44-33 75 ea 19.40$              22.43$               20.25$            20.00$                 19.02$              

E-24 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling    L-14-33 50 ea 22.80$              28.41$               23.60$            22.10$                 22.39$              

E-25 1" Pack Joint Coupling      C-14-44 50 ea 22.95$              28.18$               19.70$            23.00$                 22.27$              

E-26 1" Pack Joint Coupling       C-84-44 50 ea 19.05$              21.74$               23.16$            19.50$                 18.49$              
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                      

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE                
Mike Weldon             
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY SUPPLY          
Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION E:  BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

E-27 1" Pack Joint Coupling       C-44-44 50 ea 22.40$              24.48$               23.16$            22.50$                 21.75$              

E-28 1" Pack Joint Coupling       L-14-44 50 ea 37.20$              42.67$               38.46$            37.22$                 36.69$              

E-29 1" Pack Joint Coupling       L-84-44 50 ea 29.30$              33.04$               30.29$            29.31$                 28.74$              

E-30 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling  C-14-66 12 ea 66.75$              76.83$               69.01$            66.75$                 66.84$              

E-31 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling  C-44-66 12 ea 75.00$              86.31$               77.49$            75.00$                 75.05$              

E-32 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling  C-84-66 12 ea 52.15$              60.08$               53.95$            52.20$                 52.25$              

E-33 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling  L-84-66 12 ea 85.10$              98.02$               87.98$            85.12$                 85.20$              

E-34 2" Pack Joint Coupling        C-14-77 12 ea 79.45$              91.56$               82.15$            79.48$                 77.13$              

E-35 2" Pack Joint Coupling        C-44-77 12 ea 101.25$            116.57$             104.64$          101.24$               98.24$              

E-36 2" Pack Joint Coupling        C-84-77 18 ea 76.05$              87.54$               78.60$            76.00$                 73.79$              

E-37 2" Pack Joint Coupling        L-14-77 12 ea 134.70$            125.16$             139.23$          134.70$               130.71$            

E-38 2" Pack Joint Coupling        L-44-77 12 ea 213.45$            243.30$             218.39$          211.29$               211.50$            

E-39 2" Pack Joint Coupling           L-84-77 12 ea 123.25$            140.46$             125.98$          122.00$               122.00$            

E-40 3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee   T-444-333 12 ea 47.40$              51.59$               49.02$            47.41$                 46.03$              
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                      

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE                
Mike Weldon             
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY SUPPLY          
Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION E:  BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

E-41 1"x1"x1" Comp Tee          T-444-444 12 ea 50.75$              47.16$               52.41$            50.74$                 49.21$              

E-42 1" x 3/4" Brass Bushing CC Thread 100 ea 17.35$              15.08$               17.91$            16.00$                 17.35$              

E-43 1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thread 12 ea 45.30$              41.02$               48.48$            43.00$                 46.95$              

E-44 2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 12 ea 55.20$              49.68$               59.00$            53.00$                 57.14$              

E-45 3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 12 ea 3.40$                5.14$                 3.95$              4.50$                   4.89$                

E-46 1"x 3" Brass Nipple 12 ea 4.80$                6.63$                 5.72$              6.50$                   6.83$                

E-47 1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12 ea 8.70$                9.47$                 10.03$            10.00$                 11.25$              

E-48 2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12 ea 11.15$              15.10$               12.85$            12.90$                 15.88$              

E-49 2" x 6" Brass Nipple 12 ea 21.55$              29.56$               24.82$            24.00$                 30.78$              

E-50 3/4" Copper Setter                                
VB72-12W-44-33 50 ea 118.60$            138.62$             122.62$          120.00$               125.35$            

E-51 1" Copper Setter                                    
VB74-12W-44-44 50 ea 236.75$            276.57$             242.16$          240.00$               247.55$            

E-52 1 1/2" Copper Setter                          
VBB76-15B-44-66 12 ea 1,085.00$         1,263.49$          1,111.79$       1,075.00$            1,136.50$         

E-53 2" Copper Setter                                  
VBB77-15B-44-77 12 ea 1,275.00$         1,383.30$          1,302.76$       1,260.00$            1,331.72$         

E-54 Service Saddle 2"x1" CC 12 ea 49.55$              57.49$               63.29$            49.56$                 55.39$              
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description
 CORE & MAIN                      

Kenzie                     
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew Barton          
918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE                
Mike Weldon             
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY SUPPLY          
Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION E:  BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

E-55 Service Saddle 4"x3/4" CC 6 ea 47.60$              55.23$               92.37$            47.62$                 53.23$              

E-56 Service Saddle 4" x 1" CC 6 ea 47.60$              55.23$               92.37$            47.62$                 53.23$              

E-57 Service Saddle 4"x 1-1/2" CC 6 ea 50.75$              60.13$               98.60$            51.84$                 57.95$              

E-58 Service Saddle 4" x 2" CC 6 ea 56.15$              66.53$               98.60$            57.36$                 64.11$              

E-59 Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC 12 ea 54.70$              63.47$               93.93$            54.72$                 61.16$              

E-60 Service Saddle 6"x1" CC 50 ea 54.70$              67.40$               93.93$            54.72$                 61.16$              

E-61 Service Saddle 6"x 1-1/2" CC 6 ea 59.40$              73.32$               101.38$          59.42$                 66.42$              

E-62 Service Saddle 6"x2" CC 6 ea 65.55$              76.05$               101.38$          65.57$                 73.29$              

E-63 Service Saddle 8"x 3/4" CC 6 ea 64.50$              79.77$               113.02$          64.67$                 72.25$              

E-64 Service Saddle 8"x1" CC 50 ea 64.50$              67.52$               113.02$          64.67$                 72.25$              

E-65 Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC 6 ea 69.95$              81.14$               121.64$          69.96$                 78.19$              

E-66 Service Saddle 8"x2"CC 6 ea 76.25$              88.54$               121.64$          76.33$                 85.31$              
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description

 CORE & 
MAIN     

Kenzie                      
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

Manhole Frames, Covers & Gasket

F-1 8" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687 5 ea 780.00$          NO BID NO BID 818.00$             299.25$            

F-2 7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797 10 ea 299.20$          NO BID NO BID 332.00$             736.22$            

F-3 5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A 10 ea 340.05$          NO BID NO BID 391.00$             379.92$            

F-4 Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24 10 ea 340.05$          NO BID NO BID 391.00$             NO BID

F-5 Lamp Hole Box & Lid 10 ea 140.25$          NO BID NO BID 335.00$             212.09$            

Sewer Couplings   (Hubs) INDIANA SEAL ONLY

F-6 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 25 ea 5.10$              5.96$               NO BID 5.40$                 5.11$                

F-7 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 50 ea 5.10$              5.96$               NO BID 5.40$                 5.11$                

F-8 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 20 ea 10.95$            12.75$             NO BID 10.50$               10.93$              

F-9 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 40 ea 10.95$            12.75$             NO BID 10.50$               10.93$              

F-10 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 30 ea 16.85$            19.60$             NO BID 16.50$               16.81$              

F-11 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 100 ea 16.85$            19.60$             NO BID 16.50$               16.81$              

F-12 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12 ea 25.20$            29.43$             NO BID 24.75$               25.24$              

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION F:  MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS 
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description

 CORE & 
MAIN     

Kenzie                      
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION F:  MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS 

F-13 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 24 ea 25.20$            29.43$             NO BID 24.75$               25.24$              

F-14 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12 ea 29.45$            34.34$             NO BID 29.00$               29.45$              

F-15 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 12 ea 29.45$            34.34$             NO BID 29.00$               29.45$              

Fittings & Tap Saddles

F-16 4" PVC 45˚ Elbow SCH 40 DWV 100 ea 7.55$              14.50$             NO BID 8.00$                 7.11$                

F-17 4" PVC 22 1/2˚ Elbow SCH 40 DWV 24 ea 11.75$            9.29$               NO BID 9.25$                 11.11$              

F-18 6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12 ea 36.75$            58.18$             NO BID 39.75$               41.00$              

F-19 8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12 ea 93.80$            69.70$             NO BID 95.00$               93.81$              

F-20 6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee,  Gasket Skirt 20 ea 35.00$            73.71$             NO BID 36.50$               34.92$              

     with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch

F-21 8x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee,  Gasket Skirt 40 ea 59.15$            98.12$             NO BID 48.50$               48.27$              

     with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

TIE BID

Item # Description

 CORE & 
MAIN     

Kenzie                      
918-586-7100 

 FERGUSON 
WW           

Matthew 
Barton          

918-459-9536 

 FORTILINE             
Mike Weldon            
918-445-0005 

 UTILITY 
SUPPLY          

Brandon Epps                
918-284-6831 

 WINWATER 
FORT SMITH                  
Zach Wolfe                               

580-370-6340 

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

Estimated 
Quantity

SECTION F:  MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS 

F-22 10x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee,  Gasket Skirt 20 ea 68.00$            142.73$           NO BID 70.00$               67.62$              

     with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch

F-23 12x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee,  Gasket Skirt 12 ea 100.00$          177.06$           NO BID 85.00$               83.87$              

     with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch

F-24 1 1/2" Preformed Flex Plastic - 10 bxs 110.00$          24.82$             NO BID NO BID 151.38$            

   Gasket (Ram-Nek)

F-25 Romac Tap Saddle CB 4" 12 ea 119.65$          126.07$           NO BID NO BID 107.95$            

      Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe

F-26 Romac Tap Saddle CB 6" 12 ea 159.50$          168.07$           NO BID NO BID 143.91$            

       Outlet Fits 6" to 12" Pipe

F-27 4" Rubber Test Cap 20 ea 4.00$              2.91$               NO BID 4.00$                 2.64$                

F-28 5" Rubber Test Cap 20 ea 4.50$              3.90$               NO BID 5.00$                 3.53$                

F-29 3" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20 ea 35.00$            NO BID NO BID 50.00$               NO BID

F-30 4" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20 ea 35.00$            NO BID NO BID 50.00$               NO BID
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SHADED AREA - RECOMMEND AWARD 1st Quarter pricing

CHEMICAL: Chlorine Gas Hydrofluorosilicic 
Acid

Potassium 
Permanganate Coagulant ACH Coagulation 

Aid
Drying Bed 

Polymer Polyphosphate Sodium 
Hydroxide

Aqueous 
Ammonia

Powdered Activated 
Carbon

Est. Quantity 60 TON 15,000 GALLONS 50,000 LBS 720 TON 12 TOTES 6,000 LBS 15,000 LBS 60,000 LBS 450,000 LBS 60 TON 46,000 LBS

$730/ton
no plant trial

$850/ton $1844/tote
$223.30/MG $0.50/lb

$850/ton *$1530/tote
$212.67/MG $0.51/lb.

* - Award based on price per pound.  Water Tech price per tote was based on the smaller size (275 gallon), where Hawkins price per tote was based on the larger size (330 gallon)

City of Bartlesville
Water Treatment Chemical Bid #2023-2024-002

$2.50

$3.78

Chemrite Inc.

Baker Services Inc.

Carus

LEGEND:       

Carbon Activated Corp.

$260.00

Shannon Chemical Corp.

Hawkins,Inc.

Pencco. Inc.

Univar

Chemtrade Chemicals 
US,LLC

Polydyne Inc.

TRInternational

$3.09

$1.240

$1.37

$1.18

$2.54/lb.

$2.36 $0.80

$4.27 $1.14

$1.320

$0.274

$0.245

$2.64

$1.000

Recommended Bid Award 

Airgas $380.20

Brenntag $2,280 $1889.66/tote $0.264 $1.285

USALCO, LLC

Water Tech Inc. $2.10
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Agenda Item ___    

July 19, 2023 
Prepared by Terry Lauritsen 

Water Utilities  
 

 

I. SUBJECT, ATTACHMENTS, AND BACKGROUND 

Discuss and take action on a proposed resolution repealing the emergency water 
rates established by Resolution 3670 

Attachments: 
  Resolution  

 
II. STAFF COMMENTS AND ANALYSIS 

On April 3, 2023, Council approved amendments to the Water Shortage Ordinance 
(3569) and a Resolution implementing the Stage 2 Emergency Water Rates (3669).  
Water supply levels continued to decline in April and fell below 60% the week of 
April 17, which triggered the Stage 3 restrictions.  The Stage 3 Emergency Water 
Rates (3670) were approved by Council on May 15, 2023.  Water supply hovered 
between 56% and 58% in May, June and early July.  Rains on July 14 & 15 had a 
significant impact on the water supply.  Prior to the rain on July 14, water supply was 
57.1%.  After the rains, water supply rose to 66.2% on July 15, 72.1% on July 17 and 
as of July 19, water supply is 73.5% with inflow still coming into Hulah Lake.  Per 
the Water Shortage Ordinance, there are no restrictions or emergency water rates 
when water supply is between 70% to 79%, only advisories and voluntary 
conservation.  Thus, staff is requesting that Council repeal Resolution 3670, which 
enacted the Stage 3 emergency water rate adjustment, and return to the normal 
volumetric rates.  If approved, the repeal of the emergency water rates will be 
retroactive to July 17. 

 

III. BUDGET IMPACT 

None 

 
 

IV. RECOMMENDED ACTION 

Staff recommends approval of the proposed resolution. 
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RESOLUTION NO.  _________ 

A RESOLUTION REPEALING EMERGENCY WATER RATES ESTABLISHED BY 
RESOLUTION 3670. 

WHEREAS, the Water Shortage that necessitated the implementation of emergency water rates has 
subsided. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BARTLESVILE, OKLAHOMA, that Resolution 3670 is hereby repealed retroactive to Monday, 
July 17, 2023. 
 
APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL AND SIGNED BY THE MAYOR OF THE 
CITY OF BARTLESVILLE THIS _____DAY OF _________________, 2023. 

 
 
    _________________________________________ 
    Dale Copeland, Mayor 
    City of Bartlesville 
 
 
_________________________________________ 
City Clerk 
City of Bartlesville 



RESOLUTION NO.  _________ 

A RESOLUTION RE-ESTABLISHING THE BARTLESVILLE WATER RESOURCES 
COMMITTEE; SETTING TERMS OF OFFICE FOR COMMITTEE 
MEMBERS; DECLARING THE PROCESS FOR SELECTION AND 
APPOINTMENT OF COMMITTEE MEMBERS; SETTING RESPONSIBILITIES OF 
THE COMMITTEE; AND APPOINTING INITIAL COMMITTEE MEMBERS. 

WHEREAS, the City of Bartlesville is experiencing a water shortage caused by a significant drought 
in southeast Kansas and northeast Oklahoma; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council recognizes that the demand for water will increase as the area 
population increases; and 

WHEREAS, this demand can only be met with sustainable adequate water supply; and 

WHEREAS, to assure an adequate water supply for future needs, research and cooperation is 
necessary and vital to the completion of the task; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council of Bartlesville, Oklahoma desires to establish the Bartlesville Water 
Resources Committee. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BARTLESVILE, OKLAHOMA, that the Bartlesville Water Resources Committee is hereby 
created; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Committee shall consist of the following members: 

• The Mayor or his designee from the current City Council
• One additional City Council Member
• The City Manager of Bartlesville
• One resident of each ward in Bartlesville
• One resident of Dewey
• One resident of Washington County
• A representative of the Bartlesville Development Authority
• A representative of the Bartlesville Regional Chamber of Commerce
• Three ex-officio members, each representing a Federal Legislator's Office
• One ex-officio member serving as a legislative liaison
• The Water Utilities Director of the City of Bartlesville as an ex-officio member; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, all members shall be appointed for an initial term of 
three years; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, all members are eligible for reappointment for an 
unlimited number of additional three-year terms. 
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Committee shall be responsible for the following tasks: 
 

• Study and identify a supplemental water source sufficient to address the City’s immediate 
needs during the current water shortage. 

• Review the City’s current drought plan and make recommendations for changes. 
• Study and identify supplemental water sources sufficient to ensure water security to meet the 

City’s long-term needs. 
• Make recommendations to the City Council related to all previous tasks. 

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the following individuals shall be appointed to the committee: 
 

• Dale Copeland, Mayor 
• Billie Roane, City Council Member 
• Mike Bailey, City Manager  
• George Halkiades, Ward 1 representative 
• Bill Dausses, Ward 2 representative 
• Tom Gorman, Ward 3 representative 
• Quinn Schipper, Ward 4 representative 
• Harvey Little, Ward 5 representative 
• Kevin Trease, Dewey resident 
• Mike Dunlap, Washington County Resident 
• David Wood, Bartlesville Development Authority 
• Sherri Wilt, Bartlesville Regional Chamber of Commerce 
• Mack Savala, Senator Lankford’s office (ex officio) 
• Crystal Campbell, Senator Mullin’s office (ex officio) 
• Derrick Sisney, Representative Brecheen’s office (ex officio) 
• Julie Daniels, legislative liaison (ex officio) 
• Terry Lauritsen, Water Utilities Director (ex officio) 

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that any conflicting resolutions including Resolutions 2872, 3009, 
3012, and 3173 are hereby repealed. 
 
APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL AND SIGNED BY THE MAYOR OF THE 
CITY OF BARTLESVILLE THIS _____DAY OF _________________, 2023. 

 
 
    _________________________________________ 
    Dale Copeland, Mayor 
    City of Bartlesville 
 
 
_________________________________________ 
City Clerk 
City of Bartlesville 
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