MINUTES OF THE
SPECIAL MEETING

m CI-I.y Of - AR LESVI(L)F T2II'EI'Y COUNCIL
ﬁnB bartlesville

CONNECTED/ IVIBRANT Monday, July 24, 2023
5:30 p.m.
Council Chambers at City Hall
401 S. Johnstone Avenue Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr.
Bartlesville, OK 74003 918-338-4282

MINUTES

(The Notice of Meeting and the Agenda was posted June 20, 2023 at 3:45 p.m.)

Present were Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr. and Councilmembers Trevor Dorsey (arriving at 5:41 p.m.),
Billie Roane and Loren Roszel. Absent was Mayor Dale Copeland.

City staff present were Mike Bailey, City Manager; Tracy Roles, Assistant City Manager; Jess Kane,
City Attorney(via phone); Jason Muninger, CFO/City Clerk; Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water
Utilities; and Police Chief Kevin Ickleberry.

1. The business meeting of the Bartlesville City Council was called to order by Vice Mayor
Curd at 5:30 p.m.

2. Roll Call was conducted and a quorum established.
3. The invocation was provided by Quinn Schipper.
4. Citizens to be heard.

There were no citizens to be heard.

5. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2023-2024-001 for water and
wastewater line repair materials. Presented by Councilmember Roszel.

Mr. Roszel moved to award Bid No. 2023-2024-001 to the vendor who submitted the low bid
meeting specifications which are highlighted in the attached bid tabulations, seconded by Ms.
Roane.

Ayes: Mr. Roszel, Ms. Roane, Vice Mayor Curd
Nays: None
Motion: Passed

6. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2023-2024-002 for water treatment
chemicals. Presented by Councilmember Roszel.

Mr. Roszel moved to award Bid No. 2023-2024-002 to the vendor who submitted the low bid
meeting specifications which are highlighted in the attached bid tabulations, seconded by Ms.
Roane.



Ayes: Ms. Roane, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Nays: None
Motion: Passed

. Update on the City of Bartlesville Water Supply. Presented by Terry Lauritsen, Director
of Water Utilities. (Councilmember Dorsey arrived during the presentation of this item.)

Mr. Lauritsen reported that the watershed and surrounding area received beneficial rainfall over
a week ago. Using a PowerPoint, he reported on the Bartlesville water service area; raw water
supply and locations; overall water supply that is currently at 76%; watershed locations; the
Kansas Mesonet showing drought conditions; how Copan is still low due to lack of rain runoff to
it; and water supply projection since supply is still considered low. Mr. Muninger reported on the
effect of the emergency rates on revenue. He stated that the total additional amount collected
was $32,795, with commercial accounts bringing in $25,696, and residential customers $7,099.
Comparisons from last year show a $150,000 reduction in revenue due to conservation. A brief
discussion covered the average increase on commercial and residential meters; how citizens
stepped up conservation; and how monitoring will continue.

. Discuss and take possible action to approve a Resolution repealing Emergency Water
Rates established by Resolution 3670. Presented by Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water
Utilities.

Mr. Lauritsen reported that on April 3, 2023, Council approved amendments to the Water
Shortage Ordinance (3569) and a Resolution implementing the Stage 2 Emergency Water Rates
(3669). Water supply levels continued to decline in April and fell below 60% the week of April
17, which triggered the Stage 3 restrictions. The Stage 3 Emergency Water Rates (3670) were
approved by Council on May 15, 2023. Water supply hovered between 56% and 58% in May,
June and early July. Rains on July 14 & 15 had a significant impact on the water supply. Prior to
the rain on July 14, water supply was 57.1%. After the rains, water supply rose to 66.2% on July
15, 72.1% on July 17 and as of July 19, water supply is 73.5% with inflow still coming into Hulah
Lake. Per the Water Shortage Ordinance, there are no restrictions or emergency water rates
when water supply is between 70% to 79%, only advisories and voluntary conservation. Thus,
staff is requesting that Council repeal Resolution 3670, which enacted the Stage 3 emergency
water rate adjustment, and return to the normal volumetric rates. If approved, the repeal of the
emergency water rates will be retroactive to July 17.

Ms. Roane moved to approve the Resolution repealing Emergency Water Rates established by
Resolution 3670 which will be retroactive to July 17, 2023, seconded by Mr. Roszel.

Mr. Roszel stated his appreciation to City Staff and the YMCA for getting Frontier Pool and the
splash pads open.

Ayes: Mr. Dorsey, Mr. Roszel, Ms. Roane, Vice Mayor Curd
Nays: None
Motion: Passed

. Discuss and take possible action re-establishing the Bartlesville Water Resources
Committee; setting terms of office for committee members’ declaring the process for
selection and appointment of Committee members; setting responsibilities of the
Committee; and appointing Initial Committee Members. Presented by Mike Bailey, City
Manager.



Mr. Bailey reported that prior to and during the recent drought, he had been in discussion with
his staff analyzing different options to strengthen Bartlesville’'s water supply options. Staff felt
that re-establishing the Bartlesville Water Resources Committee was the best place to begin
researching and investigating options. Due to the recent rainfall, the situation is not as urgent,
although continues to be extremely important. The Committee has not met in many years and
due to many of the former members no longer able to serve due to a variety of reasons, a new
roster was developed with a few changes from the original. Mr. Bailey read who the Committee
will consist of and that term limits will be unlimited three-year terms. The Committee will be
tasked with studying and identifying a supplemental water source sufficient to address the City’s
immediate needs during the current water shortage; review the City’s current drought plan and
make recommendations for changes; study and identify supplemental water sources sufficient
to ensure water security to meet the City’'s long-term needs; and to make recommendations to
the City Council related to all previous tasks. Mr. Bailey read the proposed appointees as follows:
Dale Copeland, Mayor; Billie Roane, City Counciimember; Mike Bailey, City Manager, George
Halkiades, Ward 1 Representative; Bill Dausses, Ward 2 Representative; Tom Gorman, Ward 3
Representative; Quinn Schipper, Ward 4 Representative; Harvey Little, Ward 5 Representative,
Kevin Trease, Dewey Resident; Mike Dunlap, Washington County Commissioner; David Wood,
Bartlesville Development Authority; Sherri Wilt, Bartlesville Regional Chamber of Commerce;
Mack Savala, Senator Lankford’s office (ex officio); Crystal Campbell, Senator Mullin’s office (ex
officio); Derrick Sisney, Representative Brecheen’s office (ex officio); Julie Daniels, Legislative
Liaison (ex officio) and Terry Lauritsen, Water Utilities Director (ex officio). This Resolution will
repeal conflicting resolutions including Resolutions 2872, 3009, 3012 and 3173. Mayor
Copeland, Tom Gorman, David Wood and Julie Daniels also served on the original committee.

A brief discussion covered a suggestion that the Resolution be amended in the membership
portion from “A resident of Washington County’ to “A Washington County Commissioner”; how
Commissioner Dunlap expressed his desire to represent Washington County when approached
about the Committee; and how each person was chosen either from a recommendation from a
Councilmember, from City staff, or a head of the various organizations. Vice Mayor Curd affirmed
each appointment saying each proposed appointment are well qualified to serve on this
committee.

Mr. Roszel moved to approve the Resolution re-establishing the Bartlesville Water Resources
Committee including each appointment, and the Washington County Commissioner
modification, seconded by Ms. Roane.

Mr. Bailey added that the original committee held a position for an Osage County Representative
because a possible water supply in the early 2000’s was located in Osage County. That is no
longer an option, therefore an Osage County Representative is not necessary.

Ayes: Mr. Roszel, Ms. Roane, Mr. Dorsey, Vice Mayor Curd
Nays: Passed
Motion: Passed

10.City Manager and Staff Reports.

Mr. Bailey encouraged citizens to participate in completing the Sidewalk Survey which can be
found on the City’s website.



He also reported that Frontier Pool is now open to the public. Mr. Bailey expressed his
appreciation to YMCA and the City staff to getting the pool in short-time. City Ride had already
provided and will continue to provide shuttle rides to Osage Hill State Park Swimming Pool on
Tuesdays and Thursdays. The cost for both pools are the same. Ms. Roane encouraged citizens
to sign up for City Beat as it contains information covering pool information, as well as other City
related issues. Children under 12 must be accompanied by a guardian to use the shuttle. Mr.
Bailey also stated his appreciation of City Ride who stepped up and did not require any charge
from citizens or the City for the shuttle to Osage Hills.

11.City Council Comments and Inquiries.
Mr. Roszel stated how the citizens did a great job during the water shortage, and on how the
community came together during this time. Vice Mayor concurred. Ms. Roane appreciated the

local media also.

12.There being no further business to address, Vice Mayor Curd adjourned the meeting at
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2023-2024-001

SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN FERCHSON FORTILINE
. Estimated . ww i 4
Item # Description . Kenzie Mike Weldon
Quantity | 415 5g6.7100 |Matthew Barton| g0’ /< 0005 | Bra
918-459-9536 91¢
A-1 3/4" PE Pipe C.T.S. 1000 ft]| $ 038 % 0.31 NO BID $
A-2 1" PE Pipe C.T.S. 500 ft| $ 062]% 0.51 NO BID $
A-3 1-1/2" PE Pipe C.T.S 600 ft| $ 1051 % 1.08 NO BID $
A-4 2" PE Pipe C.T.S. 3000 ft| $ 160 % 1.83 NO BID $
A-5 4" C-900 DR 18 200 ft| $ 566 | % 8.57 NO BID 3
A-6 6" C-900 DR 18 200 ft| % 1157 | 17.52 NO BID 3
A-7 4" SCH 40 PVC 400 ft| $ 350 (% 6.17 NO BID $
A-8 6" PVC SDR 26 500 ft| $ 6.88 | % 10.41 NO BID $
A-9 8" PVC SDR 26 1000 ft]| $ 1244 | $ 18.85 NO BID $
A-10 |10"PVC SDR 26 100 ft| $ 1938 | § 29.34 NO BID $
A-11 Poly Wrap (bid per roll 200’ per roll) 10 | $ 89.00( % 122.75 NO BID $
Caution Tape (bid per roll 3,000' per roll)
A-12  |ALL OTHER VENDORS BID 1,000 10 M| $ 15.00 | $ 7.81 NO BID $
ROLLS




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

; CORE & MAIN FERGESON FORTILINE
_ Estimated ) Www . §
Item # Description . Kenzie Mike Weldon
Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Bra
918-459-9536 91¢
Detectable Locator Tape (bid per roll
A-13 1,000’ per roll) 5 rf$ 26.00 | $ 7.81 NO BID $
A-14  |Poly Tape (bid per roll _200' per roll) 5 r] $ 800|$ 4.00 NO BID 3
A-15  |#12 Solid Wire THHN 500’ roll (bid per roll) 12 r| $ 8750 (% 108.13 NO BID $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN e FORTILINE

Item # Description Estlmafed Kenzie W Mike Weldon \

Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Bra

918-459-9536 91¢
B-1 4" Mega Lugs (DIP) 8eal$ 4500 | % 39.71 NOBID | $
B-2 4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge 8eal$ 4980 | $ 45.64 NOBID | $
B-3 6" Mega Lugs (DIP) 30eal$ 56.80 | $ 49.05 NOBID | $
B-4 6" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea| $ 69.50 | $ 57.14 NOBID | $
B-5 8" Mega Lugs (DIP) 10ea| $ 73.75 | $ 66.84 NOBID | $
B-6 8" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100 ea| $ 8350 (% 77.08 NOBID | $
B-7 14" Mega Lugs (DIP) w/10 wedge 2eal$ 19245 | $ 169.92 NOBID| $
B-8 14" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/10 wedge 2eal$ 24000 | $ 221.96 NOBID | $
B-9 6" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2eal$ 72151 % 201.12 NOBID | $
B-10 (8" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2eal$ 98.00 | $ 271.68 NOBID | $
B-11  |6" MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2eal$ 69.00 ( $ 196.96 NOBID | $
B-12  |8"MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2eal$ 108.00 | $ 283.64 NOBID | $
B-13  [4" MJ 45° Bend 2eal $ 48.00 | $ 148.48 NOBID | $
B-14 |6" MJ 45° Bend 15ea| $ 76.00 | $ 205.28 NOBID | $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN HEESUSOR FORTILINE

Item # Description Estlmafed Kenzie ww Mike Weldon ¢

Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Bra

918-459-9536 91¢
B-15 |8"MJ 45° Bend S5eal $ 11015 | $ 286.76 NOBID | $
B-16 (6" MJ 90° Bend 6eal $ 9325|% 226.60 NOBID | $
B-17 |8"MJ 90° Bend 3eal $ 13500 | $ 316.40 NOBID | $
B-18 [4" MJ Bolt Pack 24ea| $ 1580 | $ 18.20 NOBID | $
B-19 (4" MJ Plug 2eal $ 27151 % 48.61 NOBID | $
B-20 (6" MJ Plug 2eal $ 50.20 | $ 79.06 NOBID | $
B-21 8" MJ Plug 2eal$ 7400 | $ 111.57 NOBID | $
B-22 |4 x2 MJ Plug 2eal$ 50.00 | $ 75.65 NOBID | $
B-23  [8 x6 MJ Reducer 2eal $ 79.00 | $ 229.38 NOBID | $
B-24 |6 x6 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee Geal $ 137.00 | $ 357.06 NOBID | $
B-25 |8 x 8 x 6 MJ Swivel Tee 4eal$ 197.00 | $ 443.74 NOBID | $
B-26 |6 x 6 x 6 MJ Straight Tee 6eal $ 134.00 | $ 332.62 NOBID | $
B-27 |8 x 8 x 6 MJ Straight Tee 4deal$ 166.00 | $ 411.01 NOBID | $
B-28 |8 x 8 x 8 MJ Straight Tee 4eal 200.00 | $ 472.52 NOBID | $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN FERGH=DN FORTILINE
. Estimated . Ww . {
Item # Description . Kenzie Mike Weldon
Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Bra
918-459-9536 91¢
B-29 |4 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2eal $ 50.00 | $ 75.65 NOBID | $
B-30 |6 x2 MJ Tapped Plug 4eal$ 72751 % 108.91 NOBID | §
B-31 8 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2eal$ 96.15 | $ 254,57 NOBID | $
B-32 |4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 8eal $ 51.00 | $ 152.12 NOBID | $
B-33 [6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 24 ea|l $ 85.00 | $ 216.20 NOBID | $
B-34 [8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length) Beal $ 136.00 | $ 317.96 NOBID | $
B-35 [10" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 2eal $ 163.00 | $ 370.40 NOBID | §
B-36 [3/4"x4" T Bolts 100 ea| $ 195| % 2.48 NOBID | $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

(Carson 2200-18)

] CORE & MAIN N FORTILINE
. Estimated Www .
Item # Description . Jared Barnes Mike Merchant
Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Br:
918-459-9536 91
C-1 3" Fire Hydrant Meter 3eal $ 2,250.00 NO BID NOBID | $
C-2 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Mueller 8eal$ 395.00 | $ 230.47 NO BID
c-3 i;ﬁtoﬁre Hydrant Main Valve, Kennedy, 8eal$ 425.00 NO BID NO BID
C-4 %gﬁoﬁre Hydrant Repair Kit, Kennedy, deals 425.00 NO BID NO BID
C-5 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, U.S. 6eal$ 350.00 NO BID NO BID
C-6 Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury 3eal $ 250000 | $ 3,002.03 NOBID | $
Cc-7 Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury 2eal$ 254500 | $ 3,075.13 NOBID | $
C-8 Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury 2eal$ 260000 1| $ 3,148.47 NOBID | $
C-9 Fire Hydrant, 4.5 Bury 3eal$ 267500 | $ 3,221.45 NOBID | $
C-10 Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury 3eal $ 2725001 $ 3,291.13 NOBID | $
Traffic Repair Kits for Mueller Centruian
C-1 022MUA301 3eal$ 32000 | $ 345.83 NO BID
Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids

C-12 (Carson 1730-18 HDPE) 15 eal $ 32500 $ 345.89 NO BID
C-13 Small Meter Boxes Complete with Lids 15032a.| $ 135.00 | § 116.31 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN FERGUSON FORTILINE
. Estimated ww .
Item # Description ) Jared Barnes Mike Merchant
Quantity 918-586-7100 Matthew Barton 918-445-0005 Br:
918-459-9536 91

C-14 Small Meter Boxes (Carson 2200-18) 300 ea| $ 5765 $ 63.52 NO BID
C-15  [Small Meter Box Lids 50 ea| $ 7575 $ 42.45 NO BID

) Thru the lid flange & nut (Nepune) for
C-16 attaching AMI antennas 200 ea| $ 2750 | $ 71.46 NO BID
C-17 5 1/4" x 2 1/4" Vaive Box Extension 24 ea| $ 2300 $ 27.66 NOBID | $
C-18 5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension 20ea| $ 2870 % 40.57 NOBID| $

Valve Box, Short Adj. 10"-Top 16"-Bottom

C-19 COMPLETE 36eal$ 63.90 NO BID NOBID | §

) Valve Box, Tall Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom
C-20 COMPLETE 50 ea| $ 7400 | $ 92.20 NOBID | $
C-21 10" Valve Box Tops 10eal $ 1925 | $ 23.04 NOBID | $
C-22 16" Valve Box Tops 10eal $ 29251 % 34.47 NOBID| $
C-23 16" Valve Box Bottoms 10ea| $ 25.00 NO BID NOBID | §
C-24 |24" Valve Box Bottoms 10eal $ 37751 % 42.58 NOBID | $
C-25 |3"RW MJ Gate Valve 3ea|l $ 575.00 | $ 740.78 NOBID | $
C-26 |4"RW MJ Gate Valve G6eal$ 650.00 | $ 829.07 NOBID | $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

. CORE & MAIN FERCUSON FORTILINE
. Estimated ww .
Iitem # Description Quantity Jared Barnes Matthew Barton Mike Merchant Br:
918-586-7100 918-445-0005 | _ -
918-459-9536 91
C-27 |6" RW MJ Gate Valve 25¢ea|l $ 84000 | $ 1,055.35 NOBID | §
C-28 [8"RW MJ Gate Valve 52a. $ 1,300.00 | $ 1652.95 NOBID | $
C-29 4" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 1z2a. $ 615.00 | $ 984.60 NOBID | $
C-30 [6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Vaive 10:a. $ 850.00 | $ 1382 94 NOBID | §
C-31 8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 52=a. $ 1,300.00 | $ 2 042 56 NOBID | $
C-32 Water Sample Stations Eclipse #88 52a. $ 1.100.00 | $ 1215.42 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

FERGUSON
. CORE & MAIN ww FORTILINE
.. Estimated ] :
Iitem # Description Quantity Kenzie Matthew Mike Weldon Brz
918-586-7100 Barton 918-445-0005 9 1‘
918-459-9536
Couplings (Stainless Steel Nuts & Bolts)
D-1 1" Bolted Coupling 20eal $ 3945 | % 42 .46 NOBID | $
D-2 1.5" Bolted Coupling 12 eal $ 45.00  $ 48.26 NOBID | $
D-3  |2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411 24 eal $ 4665 | $ 52.09 NOBID| $
D-4  |3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21 2eal $ 13180 $ 141.78 NOBID | $
D-5 |4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33 6eal$ 160.10 | $ 176.03 NOBID | $
D-6 |6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65 20eal $ 22200 % 24403 NOBID | $
|D-7  |8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90 15eal $ 267.00 | $ 293.47 NOBID | $
D-8 10" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 10.65-12.20 4eald 480.00 | $ 516.12 NOBID | $
D-9 12" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 12.75 - 14.40 4eal$ 568.75 | $ 605.04 NOBID | $
D-10 |3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 3B eal $ 11650 | § 34.67 NOBID | $
D-11  |1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 30eal $ 13.00 | $ 39.98 NOBID | $
D-12 |2" Galv. Comp. Coupling #522 24ea|l $ 2370 | % 70.25 NOBID | $




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

FERGUSON
. CORE & MAIN ww FORTILINE
L. Estimated ] .
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Matthew Mike Weldon Br:
918-586-7100 Barton 918-445-0005 91‘
918-459-9536
# 248 Clamps
D-13  [1-1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 6eal$ 2100 | 23.51 NOBID | $
D-14  |1-1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 15eal § 4100 | § 4516 NOBID | $
# 261 Clamps (Single Band)
D-15  [2"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 2.35-2.63 Seal$ 52.00 | $ 54.28 NOBID | $
D-16  |4" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41 Seal $ 62.00 | $ 69.59 NOBID | $
D-17 [4"x 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 Seal$ 9500 | % 106.79 NOBID | $
D-18 4" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 Seal$ 10540 | $ 118.59 NOBID | §
D-19 [6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2eal$ 70.00 | $ 78.65 NOBID | $
D-20 [6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 36eal$ 7225 | $ 81.13 NOBID | $
D-21 |6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 S5eal $ 7365 % 82.74 NOBID | §
D-22 6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20eal$ 11580 | $ 130.04 NOBID | §
D-23 [6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 10 ea| $ 116.85 | $ 131.24 NOBID | $
D-24 |6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2eal$ 126.45 | $ 142.00 NOBID | §

10



WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

FERGUSON
. CORE & MAIN ww FORTILINE
L. Estimated i .
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Matthew Mike Weldon i
918-586-7100 Barton 918-445-0005 9 1‘
918-459-9536
D-25 |6"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20ea| $ 12750 | $ 143.17 NOBID | §
D-26 |6"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 2eal$ 12750 | $ 144.39 NOBID | §
D-27 [8"x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2eal$ 83.95|$ 94.27 NOBID | $
D-28 |8"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 15eal $ 83.95| % 94.87 NOBID | §
D-29 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 9.05-9.39 (Part 4eal $ 83.95 | $ 94.87 NOBID | §
#90507)
D-30 |8"x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 10ea| $ 130.00 | $ 150.94 NOBID | $
D-31  |8"x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10 ea| $ 130.00 | § 151.53 NOBID | $
D-32 8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2eal$ 154.00 | $ 173.01 NOBID | §
D-33 |[8"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10ea| $ 1656.10 | $ 174.20 NOBID | $
D-34 |10" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44 2eal$ 20190 | $ 224.32 NOBID | $
# 262 Clamps (Double Band)

D-35 |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2eal$ 11045 | $ 124.07 NOBID | $
D-36 |6" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2eal $ 208.05 | % 233.66 NOBID | $

11



WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

FERGUSON
. CORE & MAIN ww FORTILINE
L. Estimated ; .
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Matthew Mike Weldon Br
918-586-7100 Barton 918-445-0005 9 1‘
918-459-9536
D-37 |8"x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2eal$ 126.00 | $ 141.45 NOBID | §
D-38 8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2eal$ 240001 % 266.68 NOBID | $
D-39 |10"x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2eal $ 29500 | $ 331.57 NOBID | $
D-40 |10"x20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2eal$ 390.00 | $ 44173 NOBID | §
# 264 Clamps
D-41 |6"x7.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20ea| $ 98.50 | $ 110.66 NOBID | §
D-42 |[6"x12.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.56-6.96 202a.| $ 140.00 | $ 158.39 NOBID| $
D-43 |6"x158"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20eal $ 153.75 | $ 172.68 NOBID | $
# 662 Wet Tap Saddles
D-44 16"x4" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2e€a|$ 41500 | % 462.39 NOBID | $
D-45 |6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe #662 2eal $ 490.00 | $ 550.70 NOBID | $
D-46 |6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 S5eal $ 490.00 | $ 550.92 NOBID | §
D-47 |[8"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2eald 561.35 | $ 630.35 NOBID | $
D-48 [8"x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2eal$ 73660 | $ 827.15 NOBID | $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD Tl
) CORE & MAIN FERGUSON FORTILINE | UTILIT
. Estimated ; ww .
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Matthew Barton Mike Weldon | Brant
918-586-7100 918-459-9536 918-445-0005 | 918-
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Stop
E-1 BA13-232W 100 ea| $ 40.37 | $ 4469 | $ 4198 $
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-2 BA23-330-W 50eal $ 78.75 [ $ 9160 | $ 8184 $
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-3 BA43-232-W 50 ea| $ 4745 | % 5521 | $ 4928 ( $
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve
E-4 BA-43-332-W 50 eal $ 80.10 [ $ 9424 | 3 8417 | $
1" Angle Ball Meter Valve
E-5 BA43444-W 50 ea| $ 121.00 | $ 14143 | $ 126.31 | §
) 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female)
E-6 KV13-444W (Stops) 50eal $ 50.65 | $ 5456 | $ 5290 | §
E.7 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Flare) KV23- 50 eal $ 5415 | $ 6099 | § 56.45 | $
444 W
1" Angle Key Meter Vaive
E-8 (Compression) KV43-444W (Stops) 50 ea| $ 58.00 | $ 6540 $ 6039 $
1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-9 B11-666W 6eal $ 176.50 | $ 20771 $ 18435 | $
2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-10 B11-777-W 6eal $ 25700 | $ 30242 | § 26823 | $
E-11 3/4" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-3 100 ea| $ 5145 | % 58.08 | $ 5364 | $
E-12 1" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-4 50 ea| $ 6715 % 76411 % 7054 | $
E-13 1 1/2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-6 10eal $ 152.00 | $ 17241 | 15814 | $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD Tl

. CORE & MAIN et FORTILINE | UTILIT

Item # Description E;lt:zat:tey d Kenzie Matth:::vaa rton Mike Weldon | Brani

918-586-7100 918-459-9536 918-445-0005 | 918-
E-14 2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-7 15eal $ 25000 $ 28513 $ 26157 | $
E-15 3/4" Insert, #51 500 ea| $ 155|% 1671 % 202 %
E-16 1" Insert, #52 500 ea| $ 165 (9% 1701 $ 215 | %
E-17 1.5" Insert #54 300ea|l $ 225 (% 220 $ 296 | $
E-18 2" Insert #55 300 ea| $ 225 | % 2281 % 296 | $
E-19 3/4"x1" A-24 Adapters 50 ea| $ 26.65 NOBID | § 1382 %
E-20 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-33 75eal $ 16.75 | $ 1970 $ 1748 1 $
E-21 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-33 100 ea| $ 1595 | $ 1837 | $ 1663 | $
E-22 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-33 100 ea| $ 1750 | $ 1912 $ 18211 $
E-23 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-33 75eal $ 1940 | % 2243 | $ 2025 | %
E-24 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-33 50 ea| $ 2280 | % 2841 | § 2360 | $
E-25 1" Pack Joint Coupling  C-14-44 50 ea| $ 2295 $ 28.18 | $ 1970 | $
E-26 1" Pack Joint Coupling  C-84-44 50eal $ 19.05( % 21741 % 2316 | $

14



WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD T!

. CORE & MAIN FER e i FORTILINE | UTILIT

Item # Description Eglt"::‘atit; d Kenzie Matthtma rton Mike Weldon | Bran¢

918-586-7100 918-459-9536 918-445-0005 | 918-
E-27 1" Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-44-44 50 ea| $ 22401 9% 2448 | $ 2316 | $
E-28 1" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-44 50 ea| $ 3720 | $ 4267 % 3846 | $
E-29 1" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-44 50 ea| $ 2930 | $ 33041 % 3029 | $
E-30 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-66 12ea|l $ 66.75 | $ 76831 % 69.01] $
E-31 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-66 12eal $ 7500 | % 8631 § 7749 %
E-32 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-66 12 ea|l $ 5215 | $ 60.08 | $ 5395 | $
E-33 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-66 12 eal $ 85.10 | $ 98.02 | % 87.98 | $§
E-34 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-77 12eal $ 7945 | % 9156 | $ 8215| $
E-35 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-77 12eal $ 101.25 | $ 11657 | $ 10464 | $
E-36 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-77 18 eal $ 76.05 (% 8754 | % 7860 %
E-37  |2" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-77 12ea| $ 13470 | $ 12516 | $ 13923 $
E-38 2" Pack Joint Coupling L-44-77 12ea| $ 21345 | % 24330 | $ 21839 | $
E-39 2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-77 12eal $ 12325 8 14046 | $ 12598 | $
E-40 3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee T-444-333 12eal $ 4740 | % 5159 | 3% 4902 $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD Tl

. CORE & MAIN FERGUSON FORTILINE |UTILI

Item # Description Eglt:::‘:it;d Kenzie Matthma rton Mike Weldon | Bran¢

918-586-7100 918-459-9536 918-445-0005 | 918-.
E-41 1"x1"x1" Comp Tee T-444-444 12 eal $ 50.75 | $ 4716 | $ 5241 | §
E-42 1" x 3/4" Brass Bushing CC Thread 100 ea| $ 1735 ( $ 15.08 | $ 1791 ( $
E-43 1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thread 12ea| $ 4530 $ 4102 $ 4848 | $
E-44 2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 12eal § 55201 % 4968 | $ 59.00 | $
E-45  |3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 12ea| $ 340 | % 514 | $ 395( %
E-46 1"x 3" Brass Nipple 12ea| $ 48093 663| % 5721 %
E-47 1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12eal § 870 % 947 | % 10.03( $
E-48 2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12 ea|l $ 1115 % 1510 | $ 12851 $
E-49 2" x 68" Brass Nipple 12 ea| $ 2155 | % 2056 | $ 2482 | $
E50 [0 Sopher Seter s50eal $ 11860 |$  13862|$ 12262 %
E51 || ooPRer Seter s0eal §  236.75|8 27657 |$ 24216 §
Es2 |1 12 Copper Seer 12eal $ 108500 |$ 126349 |$ 111179
E53  [o ooPPerSeter 12eal $ 127500 [$  1,38330|$ 130276 $
E-54 Service Saddle 2"x1" CC 12eal $ 4955 | % 5749 $ 6329 | $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2023-2024-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD Tl

. CORE & MAIN FER SO FORTILINE | UTILIT

Item # Description E;::::]at:; d Kenzie Mattht‘:\‘:’vaa rton Mike Weldon | Brant

918-586-7100 918-459-9536 918-445-0005 | 918-
E-55  |Service Saddle 4"x3/4" CC 6eal $ 4760 $ 5523 | $ 92371 %
E-56  |Service Saddle 4" x 1" CC 6eal $ 4760 ( 5523 $ 92371 %
E-57 Service Saddle 4"x 1-1/2" CC 6eal $ 50.75 | $ 60.13 | $ 9860 | $
E-58 Service Saddle 4" x 2" CC 6eal $ 56.15 | $ 66.53 | $ 9860 | $
E-59  |Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC 12eal $ 5470 | $ 6347 | $ 93.93( %
E-60 |Service Saddle 6"x1" CC 50 eal $ 5470 | $ 6740 | $ 9393 §
E-61 Service Saddle 6"x 1-1/2" CC 6eal $ 5940 | % 7332 % 101.38 | $
E-62 Service Saddle 6"x2" CC 6eal $ 6555| % 76.05( % 101.38 | $
E-63 [Service Saddle 8"x 3/4" CC 6eal $ 64.50 | $ 79771 % 113.02 | $
E-64 |[Service Saddle 8"x1" CC 50eal $ 64.50 | $ 6752 | % 113.02 | $
E-65 Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC G6eal $ 69.95 ( $ 81141 8 12164 $
E-66 Service Saddle 8"x2"CC G6eal $ 76.25 | $ 8854 | % 12164 $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2023-2024-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD 1
. e FERV(S\lIJVSON FORTILINE y
Item # Description Estlma_ted MAIN Matthew Mike Weldon .
Quantity iy 8l-(:8n62-$1 00| Barton [918-445-0005 39'138"_
918-459-9536
Manhole Frames, Covers & Gasket
F-1 8" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687 5eal § 780.00 NO BID NOBID| $
F-2 7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797 10 eai $ 299.20 NO BID NOBID | $
F-3 5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A 10 eal $ 340.05 NO BID NOBID | §
F-4 Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24 10 ea| $ 340.05 NO BID NOBID| $
F-5 Lamp Hole Box & Lid 10 ea| $ 140.25 NO BID NOBID | $
Sewer Couplings (Hubs) INDIANA SEAL ONLY
F-6 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 25 eal $ 510 $ 5.96 NOBID| $
F-7 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 50 ea| $ 510 $ 5.96 NOBID| $
F-8 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 20eal § 1095| % 12.75 NOBID| $
F-9 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 40 ea| $ 1095 8 12.75 NOBID| $
F-10 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 30 eaL $ 1685 $ 19.60 NOBID| $
F-11 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 100 ea| $ 1685 % 19.60 NOBID| $
F-12 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12 ea| $ 2520 $ 2943 NOBID | $
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2023-2024-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

with 8S Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch

19

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD
FERGUSON
; 0 Ww FORTILINE i
" Estimated MAIN . S
Item # Description . ) Matthew Mike Weldon
Quantity Kenzie Bran
918-586-7100 Barton 918-445-0005 918.
918-459-9536
F-13 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 24 eal $ 25201 % 29.43 NOBID | $
F-14 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12 eal $ 2945| 3% 34.34 NOBID| $
F-15 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 12 eal $ 2945| $ 34.34 NOBID| $
Fittings & Tap Saddles
F-16 4" PVC 45" Elbow SCH 40 DWV 100 eaI $ 755 % 14.50 NOBID| $
F-17 4" PVC 22 1/2° Elbow SCH 40 DWV 24 eal $ 11751 $ 9.29 NOBID| $
F-18 6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12 eg| $ 36.75| $ 58.18 NOBID| $
F-19 8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12 eal $ 9380 $ 69.70 NOBID | $
F-20 6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20 ea|l $ 35001] % 73.71 NOBID| $
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-21 8x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt



WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2023-2024-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

20 eaI $

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD T
. CORES FERVE:’VSON FORTILINE N
Item # Description Estlmafed MAIN Matthew Mike Weldon .
Guantity 9 8'_(;;‘;':1 oo|  Barton |918-445-0005 %’13;
918-459-9536
F-22 10x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20 ea| § 68.00 | $ 142.73 NOBID| $
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-23 12x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 12 ea| $ 100.00
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-24 1 1/2" Preformed Flex Plastic - 10 bxy $ 110.00 | $ 24.82 NO BID
F-25 Romac Tap Saddle CB 4" 12 eal $ 11965 | $ 126.07 NO BID
F-26 Romac Tap Saddle CB 6" 12 ea| $ 156950 [ $ 168.07 NO BID
F-27 4" Rubber Test Cap 20 eal $ 400 $ 2.91 NOBID | $
F-28 5" Rubber Test Cap 20eal $ 450 $ 3.90 NOBID | $
F-29 3" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20 ea| $ 35.00 NO BID NOBID | §
F-30 4" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 35.00 NO BID NOBID | $




City

Water Treatment C

Recomme
LEGEND: SHADED AREA - RECOMMEND AWARD 1st Qu
CHEMICAL.: Chlorine Gas Hydrofluo_rosnllcic Fotagsiam Coagulant
Acid Permanganate
Est. Quantity 60 TON 15,000 GALLONS 50,000 LBS 720 TON 12
Airgas
Brenntag $2,280 $18!
Baker Services Inc.
Carbon Activated Corp.
Carus
Chemrite Inc. $3.09
Chemtrade Chemicals $730/ton
US,LLC no plant trial
. $850/ton $1
Hawkins,inc.
ns $223.30/MG $
Pencco. Inc. $3.78
Polydyne Inc.
Shannon Chemical Corp. $4.27
TRInternational
Univar $2.50
USALCO, LLC
Water Tech Inc. A $1

$212.67/MG $

* - Award based on price per pound. Water Tech price per tote was based on the smaller size (275



