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MINUTES

{The Notice of Meeting and Agenda were posted June 27, 2024 at 5:30 p.m.)

City Council present were Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr., Loren Roszel and Quinn Schipper.
Mayor Dale Copeland and Councilor Trevor Dorsey were absent.

City staff present were Mike Bailey, City Manager; Jess Kane, City Attorney; Jason
Muninger, CFO/City Clerk; Laura Sanders, Assistant City Manager; Micah Siemers,
Director of Engineering; Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water Ultilities; Kelli Williams, Chief
Communications Officer; Larry Curtis, Director of Community Development; Alicia
Shelton, Internal Financial Supervisor; Kelsey Walker, Communications and Marketing
Manager; Deputy Police Chief Troy Newell; Deputy Chief Andrew Ward; Fire Chief H.C.
Call; and Elaine Banes, Executive Assistant.

1. The business meeting of the Bartlesville City Council was called to order at 5:40
p.m. by Vice Chairman Curd.

2. Roll call was conducted and a quorum established.
3. Citizens to be heard.
There were no citizens to be heard at this meeting.

4. City Council Announcements and Proclamations.

e Recognition and presentation of awards to the graduates of the Citizens Academy 2024
Class |. City Manager Mike Bailey and Assistant City Manager Laura Sanders
recognized the inaugural class as follows: Debra Cook, Shonda Crites, Dianne Crow,
Hailey “Jade” Davis, Harry Deathe, Andy Dossett, Jennifer Ennis, Lonnie Gillman,
Sarah Hester, Lauren McKinney, Robert McWilliams, Chenin Patton, Amos Radlinger,
Ryan Reynolds, Stacie Sauber, Quinn Schipper, Barbara Shoff, Rachel Showler,
Rachelle Wilson, and Russell Zora.

Ms. Sanders thanked Tri County Tech for providing transportation for the attendees to
see the various departments of the City. She also thanked the applicant’s families and
employers for supporting their attendance to the sessions. Vice Mayor Curd and Mr.
Roszel thanked City staff for a successful Academy, as well as those who attended.

5. Authorities, Boards, Commissions and Committee Openings
e One opening on the Ambulance Commission



e One opening on the Adams Municipal Golf Course Oversight Committee
e One opening on the City Planning Commission
e One opening on the Bartlesville Water Resources Committee (Ward 4 Representative)

Vice Mayor Curd read the openings and encouraged citizens to volunteer on City
Committees. Applications can be found at www.cityofbartlesville.org or at City Hall in the city
Manager’s Office.

6. Consent Docket
a. Approval of Minutes
i. The Regular Meeting Minutes of June 3, 2024.

b. Approval and/or Ratification of Appointments to Authorities, Boards,
Commissions, and Committees.
i. Appointment of Ms. Caroline Casselberry to a three-year term on the Community
Center Trust Authority at the recommendation of Mayor Copeland.
ii. Ratify reappointment of Chase Allcott to the Bartlesville Development Authority
Board of Trustees for a second three-year term at the recommendation of Mayor
Copeland.

c. Approval of Ordinance
i. Amend Ordinance and Joinder Agreement on the Assistant City Manager
Customized Manager Option (CMO) Plan through the Oklahoma Municipal
Retirement Fund.

d. Approval of Resolutions
i. Resolution directing filing and notification of the publication of the 2024 printed
supplement #31 to the City of Bartlesville Municipal Code.

e. Approval and/or Ratification of Agreements, Contracts, Engagement Letters,
Change Orders, Addendums, Employment Agreements and Memorandums of
Understanding.

I.  Service Agreement between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville Police Department
and Tri County Technology Center to provide a satellite office/substation and
training classroom on the east side of the City of Bartlesville, including the Police
Department providing one resource office on location for Tri County Technology
Center.

ii. Lease Agreement between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville Police Department
and Tri County Technology Center to provide a satellite office/substation and
training classroom on the east side of the City of Bartlesville.

iii. Service Agreement between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville Police Department
and Axon Enterprise, Inc. to provide an upgrade to Police Department’s current
body camera system.

iv. Janitorial Contracts between the City of Bartlesville and Simply Green Clean LLC
for janitorial services for City Hall and the Public Library.

v. Short Form Contract between the City of Bartlesville and Canady Construction to
construct a new roof on the Adams Golf Course Pro Shop.

vi. Contract between the City of Bartlesville and Brightly Software, Inc. for purchase
and implementation of Asset Management Software.

vii. Amendment #1 to the Professional service Contract between the City of Bartlesville
and Murray GeoConsulting LLC for monitoring and reporting of constituents of
emerging concern (CEC) for the Wastewater Treatment Plant indirect potable reuse
pilot plant study.



viii.

iX.

X.

Xi.

Xii.

Xiil.

Xiv.

XV.

Contract between the City of Bartlesville and B-Town Construction to install flow
meters at the Hillcrest and Nebraska lift stations.

Airport Hangar Lease Agreement between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville
Municipal Airport and Wings of Change Ministries.

Amendment to the Professional Service Contract with Guy Engineering Services,
Inc. for design services on the Tuxedo Boulevard Bridges over the Caney River and
Overflow/Pond Rehabilitation and Repair Project.

Memorandum of Understanding between the City of Bartlesville and Fraternal Order
of Police, Lodge 117, for FY 2023-25, to change stipend payments to an hourly
rate instead of monthly rates.

Memorandum of Understanding between the City of Bartlesville and the Fraternal
Order of Police, Lodge 117, for FY 2023-2025, adding the City’s Employee
Performance and Recognition Program in to the collective bargaining agreement,
effective July 1 of each year as incorporated as part of the agreement.

Agreement between the City of Bartlesville and Wilson Psychological Associates,
PLLC, to provide biannual “Wellness Visits” for police officers, E911 dispatchers,
and peer support team members of the Bartlesville Police Department.

Employment Agreement between Jason Dochney and the City of Bartlesville to
provide interim leadership at Adams Municipal Golf Course.

Request approval for video depiction displaying all likenesses, images, property,
and official personnel, from both the Bartlesville Police Department and the
Bartlesville Fire Department for the purpose of honoring first responders in a
musical video to the song, “Those Who Fight” by local artist Aaron Ray Vaughan.

f. Receipt of Bartlesville NEXT Progress Report

Bartlesville NEXT Progress Report — June 2024.

g. Receipt of Financials

Interim Financials for eleven months ending May, 2024.

h. Receipt of Bids

Bid No. 2024-2025-001 for Water & Wastewater Line Repair Materials
Bid No. 2024-2025-002 for Water Treatment Chemicals

Vice Mayor Curd read the consent docket in its entirety. Mr. Roszel removed Item 6.e.iii. for
further discussion. Mr. Schipper removed ltem 6.e.xv.for further discussion.

Mr. Roszel moved to approve the consent docket except for Items 6.e.iii. and 6.e.xv.,
seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd

Voting Nay: None

Motion: Passed

Item 6.e.iii. Service Agreement between the City of Bartlesville/Bartlesville Police

Department and Axon Enterprise, Inc. to provide an upgrade to Police
Department’s current body camera system.

Mr. Roszel inquired as to the level of support that is provided by Axon and
if 50 cameras would be sufficient. Deputy Police Chief Newell reported
that Axon would provide round-the-clock support at no extra cost. He also
reported that with the cameras that are already in place, that the 50
additional should cover all of their needs and that additional cameras



could be purchased in the future if needed. Responding to Vice Mayor
Curd’s inquiry, Captain Newel stated that Axon cameras provide updates
not previously provided such as unlimited iCloud storage and more
features.

Item 6.e.xv. Request approval for video depiction displaying all likenesses, images,
property, and official personnel, from both the Bartlesville Police
Department and the Bartlesville Fire Department for the purpose of
honoring first responders in a musical video to the song, “Those Who
Fight” by local artist Aaron Ray Vaughan.

Mr. Schipper expressed his appreciation to Mr. Vaughan. Mr. Vaughan reported that he
had provided the lyrics to the City Council and will be using local police and fire for the
video. He added that he received permission from everyone in the video prior to filming. Mr.
Bailey added that those appearing in the video volunteered their time and were not
compensated.

Mr. Schipper moved to approve ltems 6.e.iii. and xv., seconded by Mr. Roszel.

Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Before moving forward, Vice Mayor Curd asked Mr. Kane to explain voting with the reduced
number of City Council at tonight's meeting. Mr. Kane stated that in order to approve any
proposed ordinances, a simple quorum of three would not be legal. All three Council
members must vote Aye in order for an ordinance to be adopted.

7. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2024-2025-001 for Water &
Wastewater Line Repair Materials. Presented by Councilman Loren Roszel.

Mr. Roszel moved to award Bid No. 2024-2025-001 to the various vendors as highlighted
within the attached bid tabulation, seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

8. Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2024-2025-002 for Water Treatment
Chemicals. Presented by Councilman Loren Roszel.

Mr. Roszel moved to award Bid No. 2024-2025-002 to the various vendors as highlighted
within the attached bid tabulation, seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

9. Discuss and take possible action to approve a Resolution calling and giving notice of
an upcoming election for City Council Representatives for all wards of the City of
Bartlesville, Oklahoma. Presented by Jess Kane, City Attorney.



10.

11.

Mr. Kane reported that City Council representatives from each of the five wards of the City
Council are elected every two years by only registered, qualified electors of their perspective
ward. Councilmembers must be qualified electors of the City for six months prior to the time
of their filing as well as be a qualified resident of his/her respective ward for six months prior
to the time of their filing. They must be record free of felony convictions, be at least 25 years
of age at the time of the election to office and cannot hold any position in the City
government by appointment of the City manager. As a member of the City Council, they
cannot hold any other public office which would constitute a conflict of interest according to
State Statues. Per the Washington County Election Board, the non-partisan general elections
will be held on November 4, 2024. The filing period for said election will begin at 8:00 am.
Monday, August 5, 2024 ending 5:00 p.m. Wednesday, August 7, 2024.

Mr. Roszel moved to approve the Resolution as presented, seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to approve an Agreement for Services between JJ
Keegan and the City of Bartlesville on conducting a comprehensive strategic review of
the Adams Municipal Golf Course management model. Presented by Vice Mayor Jim
Curd.

Vice Mayor Curd introduced the item, then turned it over to Assistant City Manager Laura
Sanders. Ms. Sanders reported that at the City Council meeting on May 6, 2024 the strategic
direction of the Adams Municipal Golf Course was discussed. It was determined that staff
would issue a Request for Proposals for a consultant/firm to potentially conduct a
comprehensive strategic review of the golf course as well as comparable golf courses to
identify how these courses are managed in comparison to Adams Golf Course. A steering
committee was created to provide guidance. The RFPs were distributed and two firms
provided proposals. The steering committee reviewed the proposals of both firms and after
careful consideration, they chose to recommend JJ Keegan to the City Council. The total cost
for their services is $15,000.

A brief discussion covered how Mr. Barker and Mr. Ppool who are on the steering committee
provided valuable input; how the timing provides a great opportunity to provide a well-
managed golf course; how the company was researched and found to be objective and non-
self-serving based on reviews from previous organizations who used their services; and how
having an outside entity managing the City golf course is not the goal.

Vice Mayor Curd moved to approve the Agreement for Services between JJ Keegan and the
City of Bartlesville as presented, seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to adopt an ordinance permitting the use of golf
carts on City streets. Presented by Councilman Loren Roszel.

Mr. Roszel moved to table Item 11 until there is a full Council on August 5, 2024 at the City
Council Regular Meeting, seconded by Mr. Schipper.



Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

12. Discuss and take possible action to adopt an ordinance to change the name of the

13.

east/west segment of Oak Park Road to Roane Road within the Oak Wood Addition.
Presented by Larry R. Curtis, Director of Community Development.

Mr. Curtis stated that this item was brought forward by the Oak wood Addition developer and
City staff. He reported that the housing development known as Arcadian will consist of the
construction of over 100 single family residences on a majority of the lots within the Oak
Wood Addition to the City of Bartlesville. As a pre-requisite to the construction of said homes,
public infrastructure to serve the development must first be installed, including roads. The
plat for the Oak Wood Addition to the City of Bartlesville was recorded in Washington County
in 1982. It dedicated right of way and established names for streets within the subdivision. In
the western and northern portion of the subdivision, an east/west and north/south segment of
right of way were both given the name Oak Park Road. Modern street naming best practices
generally seek to avoid giving perpendicular streets the same name to lessen confusion and
improve the furnishing of police and fire protection to the residents of the city. No other
existing street or right of way within the City of Bartlesville aligns with this east/west segment
of Oak Park Road and this east/west segment of Oak Park Road has not yet been
conslructed. The developer of the Arcadian project intends to construct a portion of this
east/west segment where it would connect to Virginia Ave. He supports the name change for
the public safety reasons listed, and has suggested a name in honor of Billie Roane, the City
Councilor that previously represented the area. It was agreed by the City Council and staff
that re-naming the road to honor Ms. Roane is a wonderful gesture.

Mr. Schipper moved to adopt the Ordinance as presented, seconded by Mr. Roszel.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to adopt an ordinance amending Appendix D-
General Schedule of Fees, which establishes the fees and costs charged by the City of
Bartlesville; authorizing periodic adjustment and the waiver of fees by the City
Manager. Presented by Larry R. Curtis, Director of Community Development.

Mr. Curtis reported that Appendix D has not been updated since 2019. With this amendment,
Chapter 6 will be added. The proposed amendment aligns with the City Council’s vision for
maintaining fiscal responsibility and transparency in City services. The proposed Appendix D
attached to these minutes, provides a reference source for citizens and those transacting
business with the City. Adjustments to the fees are necessary to ensure that the City
recovers the costs and expenses associated with providing certain services. Specifically,
Chapter 6 of appendix D addresses fees related to Parks and Recreation. This includes
special event permits, film permits, road closure fees, and various other permits and rental
fees for shelters, sports fields, and recreation facilities. The detailed breakdown of these fees
ensures that the City can continue to maintain and improve its recreational amenities and
services.

Discussion covered Section 2 of the ordinance regarding the City Manager's authorization
with amending the verbiage, provided by City Attorney Kane, to add to the last sentence of



14.

Section 2., “provided that such adjustment is limited to a particular event or program which
serves a municipal public purpose.” Additional discussion covered how fields will be
managed for practices; how a calendar of field reservations for soccer can be found on the
City’s website; how if the fields are not reserved, then they can be used for practice. Mr.
Bailey added that Price and Artunoff Fields are managed by 4F Sports who sublease them
from the City, and would need to be notified if one of those fields were used. Mr. Curtis
confirmed referring to Exhibit A of the proposed Ordinance Chapter 6, Parks and Recreation
Fees, quoting, “Per Section 13-5(f), the City Council may elect to enter into a contract, lease,
or agreement with any other public or private entity for the use, operation, and/or
management of any park, recreational facility, open space area or part thereof.”

Mr. Roszel moved to adopt the Ordinance with the amendment to Section 2 as discussed,
seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd

Voting Nay: None

Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to approve an Addendum to the Disposition and

Development Agreement between the City of Bartlesville, Buffalo Roam, and
Bartlesville Redevelopment Trust Authority. Presented by Mike Bailey, City Manager.

Mr. Bailey reported he will be reporting on both ltem 14. and 15. logether. He conlinued that
previously the City of Bartlesville, Buffalo Roam and the Bartlesville Redevelopment Authority
entered into a Disposition and Development Agreement that defined the rights and
obligations of all three parties. The agreement forms the basis for the economic development
transaction with Buffalo Roam. In order to close the transaction, receive title to the building,
and become eligible for the City’s funding, Buffalo Roam must first obtain the financing or
private equity sufficient to cover their share of the deal. Buffalo Roam has now attained
approval for financing with Blue Sky Bank who has required Buffalo Roam to create a
separate real estate holding company for ownership of the building. In order to do so, it is
now necessary for the Council and BRTA Board to approve an addendum adding the real
estate holding company, 520 S. Osage, LLC to the Disposition and Development Agreement.
This addendum does not alleviate Buffalo Roam'’s obligations under this agreement as it only
adds 520 S. Osage, LLC as a party to Buffalo Roam’s portion of the agreement. Additionally,
the Disposition and Development Agreement includes, as a requirement prior to closing, that
Buffalo Roam provide a completion bond and construction bond. However, these bonds are
typically only available after award of a contract. The award of contract will only occur after
closing. In order to navigate this obstacle, Buffalo Roam has proposed to amend the
agreement to provide that all bonds will be provided within 120 days of closing but before
construction begins. He concluded that City staff and the City Attorney have reviewed the
addendum, and that Jeff Smith, Buffalo Roam, is present and available to answer questions.

Discussion covered that all funding and assets will go to Buffalo Roam; that the building is
the security and all City funding will go into the improvements to the building; and how the
building is a significant asset to the City. Mr. Smith explained again why the Addendum and
1st Amendment were needed. All City Council members present stated their appreciation to
Mr. Smith for staying committed to the project and for his ongoing efforts to bring it to fruition.

Mr. Schipper moved to adopt the Addendum as presented, seconded by Mr. Roszel.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None



Motion: Passed

15. Discuss and take possible action to approve Amendment #1 to the Disposition and

16.

17.

18.

Development Agreement between the City of Bartlesville, Buffalo Roam, and
Bartlesville Redevelopment Trust Authority. Presented by Mike Bailey, City Manager.

See presentation in Item 14.

Mr. Schipper moved to adopt the Amendment #1 as presented, seconded by Mr. Roszel.

Voting Aye: Mr. Roszel, Mr. Schipper, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to fill the City Council liaison positions for
Authorities, Boards, Commissions and Committees vacated by the passing of Ward 4
City Councilor Billie Roane. Presented by Vice Mayor Jim Curd, Jr.

Vice Mayor Curd opened discussion on the item. Mr. Schipper stated that was willing to fill
each of the liaison positions that Ms. Roane held. This will include being the Council liaison
to the City Planning Commission, Downtown Landscape Task Force, History Museum Trust
Authority, Keep Bartlesville Beautiful, Tax Incentive District Review Committee, Tower Green
Design Commitlee, Transportation Committee and the Water Resources Committee.

Mr. Roszel moved to approve Mr. Schipper to the vacated seats previously held by Ms.
Roane, seconded by Mr. Schipper.

Voting Aye: Mr. Schipper, Mr. Roszel, Vice Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

New Business.

There was no new business to discuss.

City Manager and Staff Reports.

Mr. Bailey reported on:

The success of the Airport Classic;

Pathfinder is now open after the tornado debris had been cleared;
The site for tree debris from the tornado is now closed;

He was proud of how the City employees provided great assistance to citizens immediately
following and over several weeks after the May 6 tornado;

FEMA is gathering and assessing tornado damage costs of which Bartlesville is eligible for
reimbursement for the tornado expenses;

The pickleball courts are nearly complete with only a section of lights left to install;



Veterans Park Memorial is also nearly complete, flags are up, and only the sign left to install.
He added his appreciation to SLB (formerly Schiumberger) for providing funding for the
memorial;

City offices will be closed July 4 so Thursday trash pickup will be on Wednesday, July 3;
FreedomFest will be held July 4 at Sooner Park beginning at 5 p.m.;
Reminder that fireworks are illegal inside Bartlesville City limits;
And, that the lakes are full.

19. City Council Comments and Inquiries.
Mr. Schipper acknowledged and appreciated the Police and Fire Chiefs for providing mental
health services to first responders referring to Item 6.e.xiii. and the agreement with Wilson
Psychological Associates, PLLC. Mr. Bailey agreed and stated that police and fire leadership
through the years have provided well for their departments, and that he is proud of their
leadership. Mr. Roszel also acknowledged John Beckloff with Project Tribute Foundation who
also provides mental health services and life saving equipment to first responders. Mr.
Schipper acknowledged Grant Mental Health as well.

20. There being no further business to address, Vice Mayor Curd adjourned the meeting at

7:33 p.m.
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY
Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECHNOLOGY TULSA WINWATER
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz ~ 918- 580-370-6340
210-8992
A-1 3/4" PE Pipe C.T.S. 1000 (ft] $ 0.28 NO BID $ 0.28 NO BID
A-2 1" PE Pipe C.T.S 500 |[ft]$ 0.45 NO BID 3 0.46 NO BID
A-3 1-1/2" PE Pipe C.T.S 600 |ft]$ 0.88 NO BID $ 097 NO BID
A-4 2" PE Pipe C.T.S. 3000 |ft]$ 1.40 NO BID $ 1.66 NO BID
A-5 4" C-900 DR 18 200 |ft]$ 532 NO BID $ 6.19 NO BID
A-6 6" C-900 DR 18 200 |ft|$ 10.67 NO BID $ 12,65 NO BID
A-7 4" SCH 40 PVC 400 (ft| $ 265 NO BID 3 2.56 NO BID
A-8 6" PVC SDR 26 500 |[ft]$ 6.34 NO BID $ 8.02 NO BID
A9 8" PVC SDR 26 1000 |[ft]$ 11.48 NO BID $ 13.65 NO BID
A-10 |10"PVC SDR 26 100 |[ft] $ 17.88 NO BID $ 21.19 NO BID
: Poly Wrap (bid per roll _200" per roll)
A-11 Core & Main = 200' UTS = 440 10 | $ 56.00 NO BID $ 147.40 NO BID
A-12  |Caution Tape (bid per roll 1,000' per roll) 10 IR 7.90 NO BID $ 6.95 NO BID
A-13 Detec’table Locator Tape (bid per roll 5 ils 2035 NO BID $ 36.06 NO BID
1,000 per roll)




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY
Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECHNOLOGY TULSA WINWATER
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 918- 580-370-6340
210-8992
A-14  |Poly Tape (bid per roll _100' per roll) 5 rl$ 5.30 NO BID 3 3.85 NO BID
A-15 :‘:3 Salid Wire THHN 500" roll (bid per 12 |nls 60.00 NO BID $ 76.00 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUJ;IIE)llT_Z)GY JuESA

Item # Description E;ﬂ;‘:i‘gd Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) "ZV;:"I"'@Z';':

918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz LAy

918-210-8992

B-1 4" Mega Lugs (DIP) 8leal $ 39.35 NO BID $ 34,37 NO BID
B2  |4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge 8lea| $ 44.00 NO BID $ 40.41 NO BID
B3  [6"Mega Lugs (DIP) 30[ea| $ 45.80 NO BID $ 48.25 NO BID
B-4  [6"Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100[ea| $ 70.15 NO BID $ 56.19 NO BID
B5  [8"Mega Lugs (DIP) 10|eal § 62,00 NO BID $ 61.80 NO BID
B-6  [8"Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100[ea| $ 71.00 NO BID $ 74.30 NO BID
B-7  [14" Mega Lugs (DIP) w/10 wedge 2|eal $ 162.00 NO BID $ 167.12 NO BID
[B8 |14 Mega Lugs (PvC) wit0 wedge 2lea| $ 210.00 NO BID $ 170.27 NO BID
IB-g 6" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2|ea| $ 77.20 NO BID $ 138.38 NO BID
B-10  [8" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2leal $ 104.85 NO BID $ 176.86 NO BID
B-11  [6"MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2|eal $ 73.85 NO BID $ 134.51 NO BID
B-12  [8"MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2|eal $ 115.10 NO BID $ 188.00 NO BID
B-13 4" MJ 45° Bend 2|ea| $ 51.35 NO BID $ 105.54 NO BID
B-14 |6" MJ 45° Bend 15|eal $ 81.30 NO BID $ 142,25 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUI-TIIIIE;P(()GY s S
Item # Description E;:";;:;d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) V;;’:r’m)ﬁs
918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz e
918-210-8992
[B-15 [8" My 45° Bend 5lea| $ 118,10 NO BID $ 190.91 NO BID
B-16  [6"MJ 90° Bend 6leal $ 100.85 NO BID $ 162.11 NO BID
B-17  [8"MJ 90° Bend 3leal 145.70 NO BID $ 218 51 NO BID
B-18  |4" MJ Bolt Pack 24eal $ 16.90 NO BID $ 12.90 NO BID
B-19  |4"MJPlug 2lea| $ 29.10 NO BID $ 4292 NO BID
B-20 |6"MJ Plug 2lea| $ 54.40 NO BID $ 70.91 NO BID
B-21 8" MJ Plug 2lea| 5 79.85 NO BID $ 99.38 NO BID
[3-22 |ex2mipug 2lea| $ 53.50 NO BID $ 68.10 NO BID
IB-23 8 x 6 MJ Reducer 2lea| 3 85.15 NO BID $ 151.09 NO BID
[5-24  [6x6x6MJSwivel Tee Slea $ 167.55 NO BID $ 246.12 NO BID
B-25 |8x8x6 MJ Swivel Tee 4lea $ 209.80 NO BID $ 298.61 NO BID
B-26 [6x6x 6 MJ Straight Tee Glea $ 145.00 NO BID $ 236.38 NO BID
B-27 |8x8x6 MJ Straight Tee 4|ea $ 180.00 NO BID $ 268213 NO BID
B-28  |8x 8x 8MJ Straight Tee 4]ea $ 216.65 NO BID $ 325.82 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY TULSA

Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECHNOLOGY WINWATER

Item # Description Quantit Kenzie Mike Weldon SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe

¥ 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340

918-210-8992

B-29 |4 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2lea| $ 53.25 NO BID $ 68.10 NO BID
B-30 |6 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 4leal $ 77.55 NO BiD $ 95.60 NO BID
B-31 |8 x 2 MJ Tapped Plug 2leal $ 103.90 NO BID $ 124,56 NO BID
'B-32 4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 8leal $ 54.10 NO BID $ 108.93 NO BID
IB-33 6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 24leal $ 90.16 NO BID $ 152.42 NO BID
IB-34 8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length) 8lea| $ 145.60 NO BID $ 219.96 NO BID
B-35 |10" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 2leal $ 174.25 NO BID $ 276.61 NO BID
B-36 [3/4"x4" T Bolts 100lea| $ 2.05 NO BID $ 1.59 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CORE & MAIN |  FORTILINE TECUJ:JE;IEGY TS
Item # Description Eg:;'::ff 4] " Kkenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) ‘g::"mﬁz
Y | 918-586-7100 | 918-445.0005 | Jeff Shuitz SNl
918-210-8992
C1  |3"Fire Hydrant Meter 3leals 185000 NO BID $ 135576 | NOBID
C2 |5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Vaive, Mueller 8| eal $ 690.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cc3 i;_’?OF're T N LTS CITLE 8| eal s 595.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-4 i;_’:o's‘re WlySianHRERaIFISE IKehnedy; 4| eal s 595.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-5 |5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, U.S. 6| eal § 550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-6 Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury 3l eal $ 2,560.00 NO BID $ 245644 | $ 2,381.25
c7  |Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury 2|eals 260000 NO BID $ 251605 |§  2.439.04
C8  |Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury 2|eals  2680.00 NO BID $ 257565 |$  2,496.81
C9  [Fire Hydrant, 4.5 Bury 3| eals 274500 NO BID $ 263526 |$  2,554.60
C-10  |Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury 3| eals 279500 NO BID $ 269486 |§ 262011
Traffic Repair Kits for Mueller Centruian
C1 | oontanans 3| eal $ 450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids
€12 || o ranas e 15| ea| $ 315.65 NO BID $ 317.35 | $ 314.05
Small Meter Boxes Complete with Lids
C-13 | Corson 220016, 150ea | $ 135.00 NO BID $ 128.16 | $ 126.83




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUJI\I:Z;IZ)GY fEes
Esti
Item # Description ;E::Itfd Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) V;;::m&’:
¥ 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992
C-14 Small Meter Boxes (Carson 2200-18) 300| ea| $ 56.25 NO BID $ 56.30 | $ 55.71
C-15 Small Meter Box Lids 50| ea] $ 76.15 NO BID $ 73921 §% 73.15
c16 | nruthe lid flange & nut (Nepune) for 200| eal $ 4560 NO BID NO BID NO BID
attaching AMI antennas
C-17 5 1/4" x 2 1/4" Valve Box Extension 24| eal § 34.50 NO BID $ 19.45 NO BID
C-18 5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension 20| ea| $ 4595 NO BID 3 45.98 NO BID
Valve Box, Short Adj. 10"-Top 16"-Bottom
C-19 COMPLETE 36| ea| $ 116.00 NO BID $ 48.44 NO BID
Valve Box, Tall Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom
C-20 COMPLETE 50| eal $ 135.55 NO BID $ 68.97 NO BID
C-21 10" Valve Box Tops 10| ea| $ 19.25 NO BID 3 20.53 NO BID
C-22 16" Valve Box Tops 10| ea| $ 30.15 NO BID $ 30.38 NO BID
C-23 16" Valve Box Bottoms 10| ea| $ 28.00 NO BID $ 27.92 NO BID
C-24 24" Valve Box Bottoms 10| ea| $ 40.15 NO BID $ 38.59 *NO BID
C-25 3" RW MJ Gate Valve 3l eal$ 597.30 NO BID $ 66254 | $ 536.72
C-26 4" RW MJ Gate Valve 6| eal $ 670.00 NO BID $ 75350 | $ 596.36
C-27 6" RW MJ Gate Valve 25| eal $ 874.00 NO BID $ 92268 | $ 750.84




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
) CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECU!-Irr!lLOIII)GY Ay
Item # Description E;:;"r:it;d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) ‘g::r‘mﬁs
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992

C-28 |8"RW MJ Gate Valve 5|lea | $ 1,350.00 NO BID $ 1,42552 | $ 1,208.95
C-29 4" RW Fiange x MJ Tapping Valve 1lea.| $ 836.00 NO BID $ 91125 | § 606.76
C-30 |6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 10|ea | $ 1,185.00 NO BID $ 1,238.22 | 765.12
C-31 8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 5|ea.| $ 1,773.00 NO BID $ 179778 | $ 1,225.37

C-32 Water Sample Stations Eclipse #88 5|ea.| $ 1,210.00 NO BID $ 999.00 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BiD TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES
LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUJIL%IZ)GY -l
Item # Description E;z;':‘at:;d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) VZV;Z‘:VVAVZ';:
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 |Jeff Shultz 918 580-370-6340
210-8992
Couplings (Stalnless Steel Nuts & Bolts)
D-1 1" Bolted Coupling 20feal $ 3845 NOBID | $ 53.34 NO BID
D-2 1.5" Bolted Coupling 12leal $ 43.45 NOBID | $ 56.73 NO BID
lD-3 2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411 24leal $ 46.15 NOBID | $ 66.21 NO BID
D-4 3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21 2leal $ 128.45 NOBID | $ 109.26 NO BID
D-5 4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33 6lea| $ 1569.65 NOBID | $ 137.52 NO BID
D-6 6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65 20leal $ 219.75 NOBID | $ 162.11 NO BID
D-7 8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90 15leal $ 263.50 NOBID | $ 200.07 NO BID
D-8 10" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 10.65-12.20 4leal $ 458.00 NOBID | $ 318.28 NO BID
D-9 12" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 12.75 - 14.40 4leal $ 544.79 NOBID | $ 351.10 NO BID
D-10 |3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 36jeal $ 19.75 NOBID | $ 6.47 NO BID
D-11  |1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 30lea| $ 20.15 NOBID | $ 8.67 NO BID
D-12 |2" Galv. Comp. Coupling #522 24 Eal $ 39.20 NOBID | $ 16.41 NO BID
I# 248 Clamps




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY TULSA
Item # Description Eg::ji::::g : CoiiniirAlN Mﬁl?eR\;rVI:IIgloEn SLTRC\;ITSIEC)SL&?’E) ‘;V;Z\:v \:/Zﬁz
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 |Jeff Shultz 918 580-370-6340
210-8992
D-13 |1-1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 6leal $ 21.00 NOBID | § 16.91 NO BID
D-14 [1-1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 15lea| § 41.00 NO BID | $ 33.28 NU BID
# 261 Clamps (Single Band)
ID-15 2"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 2,35-2.63 5leal $ 49.00 NOBID | § 51.36 NO BID
ID-16 4" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41 5lea| $ 62.00 NOBID | § 70.24 NO BID
D-17 |4"x 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5leal $ 95.00 NOBID | $ 95.57 NO BID
D-18 |4"x 158" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 Sleal $ 105.40 NOBID | § 152.89 NO BiD
D-19 |[6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2|eal § 70.00 NOBID | § 84.55 NO BID
D-20 |6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 36feal $ 72.25 NOBID | § 84.55 NO BID
D-21 |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 5leal $ 73.65 NOBID | § 84.55 NO BID
D-22 |6"x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20lea| $ 115.80 NOBID | $ 111.51 NO BID
D-23 |6"x12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 10lea| $ 116.85 NOBID | $ 111.51 NO BID
ID-24 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2lea| $ 126.45 NOBID | § 138.26 NO BID
ID-25 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20lea| $ 127.50 NOBID | $ 138.26 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES
LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN |  FORTILINE TECUIIFLLC;IZ)GY (oA
Item # Description Eg:"::;it&d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) VZV;Z‘]'VQEQR
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 |Jeff Shultz 918 2°°" "% %
210-8992

|o-26 |6"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 2|ea $ 127.50 NOBID | § 138.26 NO BID
D-2¢ |8 x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2|ea $ 83.95 NOBID | § 86.74 NO BID
D-28 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 15|ea $ 83.95 NOBID | § 86.74 NO BID
D-29 2;3576;)’2" Clamp #261 OD 9;05-9:39 (Part alea| 83.95 NO BID | $ 86.74 NO BID

[p-30  [ex12-172" Clamp #261 00 8.54-8.94 10|eal $ 130.00 NOBID | § 140.80 NO BID

[D-31 [8" x 12-122" Clamp #261 0D 8.99-9.39 10|eal § 130.00 NOBID | § 111.25 NO BID
D-32 |8"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2lea| $ 154.00 NOBID | § 140.80 NO BID
D-33 [8"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10|ea| $ 155.10 NOBID | § 140.80 NO BID
D-34  [10"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44 2lea| $ 198.10 NOBID | § 166.51 NO BID

# 262 Clamps (Double Band)

ID-35 6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2lea| § 110.00 NOBID | § 120.58 NO BID
D-36 |6 x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2leal 5 207.95 NOBID | § 202.47 NO BID
D-37 (8" x7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2lea| $ 125.95 NOBID | $ 127.05 NO BID
D-38 8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2lea| 5 236.00 NOBID | $ 21134 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES
LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN | FORTILINE TECUJFLIE;II)GY A
Item # Description E;;'mit;d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) ‘;V;':":"xﬁz
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 |Jeff Shultz 18 220 OU®
210-8992
D-39  [10" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2lea| $ 295.00 NOBID|[$ 24146 NO BID
D-40 |10°%20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2|ea| $ 390.00 NOBID | $ 334.10 NO BID
|# 264 Clamps
[0-41 |&"x7.5'1" cC Clamp #264 0D 6 84-7.24 20lea| $ 98.50 NOBID | § 154,55 NO BID
D-42  [6"x12.5x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6 56-6.96 20ba| $ 140.00 NOBID | § 235.72 NO BID
D-43  [6x15"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20[eal $ 153.75 NOBID | § 217.83 NO BID
|# 862 Wet Tap Saddles
[0-44  |6xa” et Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2lea| $ 396.85 NOBID | § 654.67 NO BID
IE45 6'x6" Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe #662 2lea| $ 490.00 NOBID | $ 694.76 NO BID
[0-46 [6x6" wet Tap Saddle cioD #662 5leal $ 484.65 NOBID | § 694.76 NO BID
D-47 |8'x6" Wet Tap Saddie CIOD #5662 2lea| $ 555.00 NOBID|$ 740.31 NO BID
D-48 |8x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #8562 2lea| $ 728.75 NOBID | $ 956.81 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY TULSA
Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECHNOLOGY WINWATER
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Stop
*E-1 BA13-232W 100| ea| $ 39801 9% 4065 § 40011 9% 39.41
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-2 BA23-332-W 50( eal $ 78751 % 78251 % 78.04 | % 76.83
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-3 BA43-232-W 50| ea| $ 46.70 | $ 47731 § 4698 | § 46.27
3/4" Angle Bali Meter Valve
E-4 BA-43-332-W 50| eal $ 7985 | % 81501 $ 7295 | % 79.02
1" Angle Ball Meter Valve
E-5 BA43-444-W 50| ea| $ 115.70 | $ 12232 | $ 12047 | $ 118.58
1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female)
IE-G KV13-444W (Stops) 50| ea| $ 4840 | $ 5123| % 5048 | % 49.67
!5-7 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Flare) KV23- 50| ea| s 5170 | $ 5466 | 3 53.83 | 8 =
444 W
3 1" Angle Key Meter Valve
E-8 (Compression) KV43-444W (Stops) 50| ea| $ 5510 | $ 5848 | § 5763 | % 56.70
1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-9 B11-666W 6l eal $ 170.00 | $ 17853 | $ 17548 | $ 173.07
2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-10 B11-777-W 6lea| $ 24550 | $ 259.76 | $ 25562 | § 251.81
|E-11 3/4" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-3 100] ea| $ 4920 | $ 5195] % 51191 $ 50.36
IE—12 1" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-4 50| ea| $ 6465 | % 68321 % 67311 % 66.23
IE-13 1 1/2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-6 10| ea| $ 146.00 | $ 15315 | $ 150.84 | $ 148.46
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID

Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUJILIZDI[:)GY WI;l\}jVLASTAER

Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340

918-210-8992

E-14  |2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-7 15| ea| $ 23960 | $ 25331 | § 24948 | $ 24556
E-15  |3/4" Insert, #51 500 ea| $ 1471 % 205| % 151 (% 1.92
IE-16 1" Insert, #52 500| ea| $ 157 |8 215 § 1608 2.056
E-17 1.5" Insert #54 300| ea| $ 213 |8 3009 220 8 2.81
E-18  |2"Insert #55 300| ea| $ 213§ 3008 220§ 2.81
IE—19 3/4"x1" A-24 Adapters 50| ea| $ 2525 | % 1338 | § 26.31 | § 13.11
IE-20 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-33 75| ea| $ 16.05 | $ 1693 | § 16.68 | § 16.41
E-21 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-33 100| ea| $ 1515 | § 1611 ] § 15.86 | $ 15.62
E-22 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-33 100 ea| $ 1665 | $ 1763 | $ 1737 | $ 17.10
E-23  |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-33 75|ea| $ 1850 | § 1961] $ 1932 | $ 19.02
E-24  |3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-33 50| ea| $ 2160 | $ 2285 % 2251 (% 22.16
E-25 1" Pack Joint Coupling  C-14-44 50| eal $ 2170 | $ 297 | % 2263 | $ 2227
E-26 1" Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-84-44 50|ea| $ 1790 | § 19.07 | § 18.78 | $ 18.49
E-27 1" Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-44-44 50| ea| $ 3005|$ 22431 % 2210 | % 21.75
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID

) CORE & MAIN| FORTILINE TECUJFEIIE;[Z)GY UL

Item # Description Egr::::gd Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) ‘g::xvxzﬁ:
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Joff Shuitz | 861 TOTE

918-210-8992

'E-ZS 1" Pack Joint Coupling  L-14-44 50| eal 35.20 | $ 3724 | § 36.70 | § 36.11
!E-29 1" Pack Joint Coupling ~ L-84-44 50| eal $ 27.75 | $ 2934 | $ 2890 | § 28.44
E-30 |1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-66 12| ea| $ 64.45 | $ 66.83 | § 65819 64.79
E-31  |11/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-66 12| ea| $ 72405 75.04 | 3 7394 | § 7275
E32 |1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-66 12| ea| $ 50.35 | $ 5224 | § 5145 | § 50.65
[E-33 |1 112" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-66 12| eal $ 8215 | $ 8520 | § 83.92 | § 82.60
IE-34 2" Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-14-77 12| ea| § 74.50 | 3 79.56 | $ 7837 | 77.13
E-35  |2' Pack Joint Coupling  C-44-77 12| ea| $ 94.90 | $ 10134 | $ 99.81 | § 98.24
E-36  |2" Pack Joint Coupling ~ C-84-77 18| ea| $ 71.30 | $ 7612 $ 7497 | 8 73.79
E-37  |2' Pack Joint Coupling  L-14-77 12| eal $ 127.50 | $ 13483 | $ 13279 | $ 130.71
E-38  [2'Pack Joint Coupling  L-44-77 12| ea| $ 204.20 | § 21149 | $ 20831 [ § 205.03
'E-39 2" Pack Joint Coupling ~ L-84-77 12| eal $ 117.75 | $ 12200 | § 12027 | $ 118.27
IE-40 3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee T-444-333 12| ea| $ 44855 4747|'s 4674 |3 46.03
IE-41 1"1"1" Comp Tee  T-444-444 12| ea| $ 4757 | $ 5076 | $ 5002 | $ 49.21

15




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
UTILITY TULSA
Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECHNOLOGY WINWATER
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992
|E-42 1" x 3/4" Brass Bushing CC Thread 100| ea| $ 1735 | % 17351 % 1334 | § 16.82
E-43 1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thread 12| ea] § 4530 $ 4695 % 36.08 | $ 4552
E-44 2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 12| eal $ 5520 | $ 57.14 | % 4393 | § 55.39
IE-45 3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea| $ 4.30 NOBID | $ 3.33 NO BID
IE-46 1"x 3" Brass Nipple 12|ea| $ 6.25 NOBID | $ 4,83 NO BID
E-47 1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea| $ 10.75 NOBID | $ 8.47 NO BID
E-48 2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea| $ 13.95 NOBID | $ 10.86 NO BID
E-49 2" x 6" Brass Nipple 12| ea| $ 27.00 NOBID | § 20.97 NO BID
3 3/4" Copper Setter
E-50 VB72-12W-44.33 50| ea| $ 114.55 | § 11875 | $ 116.97 | § 118.75
1" Copper Setter
E-51 VB74-12W-44-44 50| ea| $ 22855 | $ 23452 | $ 231.00 | $ 237.02
11/2" Copper Setter
E-52 VBB76-15B-44.66 12| ea| $ 1,049.45 | $ 107665 $ 1,060.47 | $ 1,076.69
2" Copper Setter
E-53 VBB77.15B-44.77 12| ea| $ 1,230.00 | $ 126160 $ 124265 | $ 1,331.72
E-54 Service Saddle 2"'x1" CC 12| ea| $ 49,55 NOBID | $ 59.33 NO BID
E-55 Service Saddle 4"x3/4" CC 6leal 47.60 NOBID | § 69.57 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUJILL(;IBGY Mo
Item # Description E;::;"natit; d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) VZV::::V \'I‘\\I-:)IIEfS
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992

E-56  |Service Saddie 4" x 1" CC 6| eal § 47.60 NOBID | § 69.57 NO BID
E-b/  |Service Saddle 4"x 1-1/2" CC 6leal 3 50.75 NOBID | $ 7278 NO BID
E-58  |Service Saddle 4" x 2" CC 6|eal $ 56.00 NOBID| $ 72.78 NO BID
iE-59 Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC 12| eal $ 54.70 NOBID| § 76.74 NO BID
lE—60 Service Saddle 6"x1" CC 50| ea| $ 54.70 NOBID| $ 76.74 NO BID
E-81 Service Saddle 6"x 1-1/2" CC 6|eal $ 59.40 NOBID| § 82.82 NO BID
E-62  [Service Saddle 6"x2" CC Bl ea| $ 65.55 NOBID | $ 82.82 NO BID
E-63  |Service Saddle 8"x 3/4" CC 6|ea| $ 64.50 NOBID| § 87.97 NO BID
E-64  |Service Saddle 8"x1" CC 50| ea| $ 64.50 NOBID| $ 87.97 NO BID
E-65  [Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC 6eal $ 69.95 NOBID | $ 94,63 NO BID
E-66  [Service Saddle 8"x2"CC 6leal $ 76.25 NOBID | 94.63 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

2024-2025-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
. CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUI-TFEILOHL-Z)GY i
Item # Description E;:"::::;d Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) VZV;':I‘:VQE'EE
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shuitz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992
Manhole Frames, Covers & Gasket
F-1 8" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687 5lea | § 456.00 NOBID | $ 280.10 NO BID
F-2 7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797 10lea | $ 330.00 NOBID | $ 384.24 NO BID
F-3 5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A 10lea | $ 465.00 NOBID | § 329.55 NO BID
F-4 Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24 10lea | § 465.00 NOBID | % 330.00 NO BID
F-5 Lamp Hole Box & Lid 10|ea | § 224.50 NOBID | § 198.52 NO BID
Sewer Couplings (Hubs) INDIANA SEAL ONLY
F-6 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 25(ea | 5.10 NOBID | § 8.06 NO BID
F-7 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 50jea | $ 5.10 NOBID | § 8.06 NO BID
F-8 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 20jea | $ 10.45 NOBID | $ 17.26 NO BID
F-9 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 40lea | $ 10.45 NOBID | $ 17.26 NO BID
F-10 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 30|ea | $ 16.45 NOBID | $ 26.53 NO BID
F-11 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 100jea | § 16.45 NOBID | § 26.53 NO BID
F-12 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12lea | $ 24.70 NOBID | $ 39.84 NO BID
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2024-2025-001

SECTION F:

MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
Estimated CORE & MAIN FORTILINE TECUIJ::EJIIZ)GY WI-NrUWl;\ST‘:ER
Item # Description Quantity Kenzie Mike Weldon | SERVICES (UTS) Zach Wolfe
918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Jeff Shultz 580-370-6340
918-210-8992
F-13 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 24lea | § 24.70 NOBID | $ 39.84 NO BID
F-14 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12 éau $ 28.95 NOBID | $ 46.49 NO BID
F-15 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 12|ea 28.95 NOBID | $ 46.49 NO BID
Fittings & Tap Saddles
F-16 4" PVC 45° Elbow SCH 40 DWV 100|ea | $ 8.00 NOBID | $ 7.16 NO BID
F-17 4" PVC 22 1/2° Elbow SCH 40 DWV 24lea | § 12,55 NOBID | $ 11.18 NOBID
F-18 6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12lea | $ 39.50 NOBID | § 40.40 NO BID
F-19 8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12|ea | § 95.00 NOBID | § 100.37 NO BID
F-20 6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20|ea.| $ 37.00 NOBID | $ 37.36 NO BID
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-21 8x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 40[ea.| $ 51.65 NOBID | $ 49.73 NO BID
with 8S Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
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