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C|Ty Of MINUTES OF THE
REGULAR MEETING OF THE

bq r.“ eSVI l Ie BARTLESVILLE CITY COUNCIL

CONNECTED/CREA

Monday, July 7, 2025

City Hall, Council Chambers 5:30 p.m.
401 S. Johnstone Avenue

Bartlesville, OK 74003

James S. Curd, Jr., Mayor
918-338-4282

MINUTES
(The Notice of Meeting was posted December 15, 2024 and
the Agenda was posted June 27, 2025 at 5:30 p.m.)

City Council in attendance was Mayor Jim Curd, Jr.,, Vice Mayor Trevor Dorsey, and
Councilmembers Tim Sherrick, Larry East and Aaron Kirkpatrick.

City staff in attendance was Mike Bailey, City Manager; Laura Sanders, Assistant City Manager,
Jess Kane, City Attorney; Jason Muninger, CFO/City Clerk; Terry Lauritsen, Director of Water
Utilities; Fire Chief H.C. Call; Deputy Fire Chief Barry Campbell; Matt McCollough, Director of IT;
Larry Curtis, Director of Community Development; Alicia Shelton, Accounting and Finance
Supervisor; Deputy Police Chiefs Troy Newell and Andrew Ward; Police Captain Elkins; and
Elaine Banes, Executive Assistant.

1. The business meeting of the Bartlesville City Council was called to order by Mayor Curd
at 5:30 p.m.

2. Roll Call was conducted a quorum established.

3. Invocation by Councilman Kirkpatrick.

4. Public Comments on Agenda Items.

Mary Fowler (Agenda Item 7.h.i.)—- Expressed concern over data retention policies.
Defended her tone as assertive in opposition to corruption and thanked Counciiman
Sherrick for urging public involvement.

Shavonne Robles (Agenda ltem 9)— Requested clarity on fluoride in city water. Shared
research suggesting risks of fluoride removal without dental program replacements, urged
a pause for public education.

Sarah Burnett (Agenda Item 9) — Cited Governor Stitt's executive order and scientific
studies linking fluoride to health risks. Urged the Council to halt water fluoridation.
Lachelle Griffin (Agenda Item 9) — Called for ending fluoridation with no substitutions, citing
federal toxicology reports and constitutional concerns.

Jackie Whitley (Agenda Item 9) — Opposed the use of hydrofluorosilicic acid, citing cost,
waste, and public health concerns.

Cody Moseman (Agenda Item 9) — Questioned changes in city limit maps and the
treatment of Brad Purvis's property.

Homer Heffington (Agenda ltem 9)— Urged the Council to prioritize Oklahoma state water
quality standards over federal ones. Praised local diligence.

5. City Council Announcements and Proclamations.

There were no announcement or proclamations.



Authorities, Boards, Commissions and Committees

One opening on the Bartlesville Area History Museum Trust Authority
One Opening on the Bartlesville Library Trust Authority

One opening on the Street and Traffic Committee

Two openings on the White Rose Cemetery Board

Consent Docket

Approval of Minutes

The Regular Meeting Minutes of June 2, 2025.

Approval and/or Ratification of Appointments and Reappointment to Authorities,
Board Commissions, and Committees.

Appointment of Ms. Amanda Hakola to a three-year term on Keep Bartlesville
Beautiful at the recommendation of Councilmember Kirkpatrick.

Appointment of Ms. Shavon Robles to a three-year term on the City Planning
Commission at the recommendation of Councilmember Kirkpatrick.
Appointment of Mr. Wyatt Gerth to fill an unexpired term on the City Planning
Commission at the recommendation of Councilman Kirkpatrick.

Ratification of new BDA officers and a new Trustee- Mr. Chase Allcott, Chairman,
Ms. Tara Gotwalt, Secretary/Treasurer, and Mr. Mark Runnels for a three term, at
the recommendation of Mayor Curd and Vice Mayor Dorsey.

Approval of Resolutions

Authorizing and requiring the marking of the graves of John F. Walters and
George E. Moore and commending Joe Todd for his efforts on behalf of veterans.
Amending the contracts of the City Attorney, City Judge, and City Manager
adjusting their compensation to accommodate the approved cost of living
adjustments and merit increases for Fiscal Year 2025-2026.

Amending the budget of the City of Bartlesville for Fiscal Year 2024-25
appropriating unanticipated revenue for the Health Insurance Fund.

Amending the budget of the City of Bartlesville for Fiscal Year 2025-26
appropriating unbudgeted Fund Balance for the Capital Reserve Fund.

Approval and Ratification of Agreements, Contracts, Engagement Letters, Leases,
MOU’s, Ordinances, and Proposals.

vi.

vii.

viii.

Fire Apparatus Purchase Agreement between the City of Bartlesville and Conrad
Fire Equipment/Pierce OshKosh Corporation for the purchase of a new 2026
custom fire engine in the amount of $858,839.53.

Ordinance and Joinder Agreement to Amend the Employee Defined Contribution
Plan.

Contract with HCC Life Insurance company, budget impact of 12.79% increase
over last year.

Hangar Lease Agreement with Eagle Sky Patrol for Hangar #8, revenue $2400
annually.

Hangar Lease Agreement with Phoenix Rising Aviation, Inc. for Hangar #6,
revenue, revenue $56,160 annually.

Service and Lease Agreement between Tri County Technology Center and the
Bartlesville Police Department providing a satellite office/substation and training
classroom in the amount of $120 annually and provide one school resource officer
annually at no cost to Tri County Technology Center.

Agreement with Pepsi Beverages Company and Adams Golf Course, revenue
based on resale, no negative impact on budget.

Right-of-Way Donation Agreements with Sheltre Farms, LLC., Orlina and Jeffrey
Andrews and Lansdown Family Trust for additional public right-of-way along both
sides of Sunset Boulevard, in the amount of $130,161.00.



Mayor

ix. Sixth Amendment to the tower/ground lease agreement between the City of
Bartlesville and New Cingular Wireless PCS, LLC for a portion of property located
in Washington County named SE Water Tower Bartlesville.

Accept Conveyance of Property

i. Accept conveyance of 15 properties from the Washington County Treasurer's
Office, such properties having not received a minimum reserve bid covering the
amount of City liens on the properties, at the annual Washington County Tax
Resale auction held on June 9, 2025, said City liens to be released on these
properties: 1. 1408 SW Armstrong Ave., 2. 117 NW Cheyenne Ave., 3. 405 NW
Theodore Ave., 4. 115 NW Virginia Ave., 5. 1714 SW Jennings Ave., 6. 812 E. 8"
St., 7. 322 SW Penn Ave., 8. 712 NW Lupa St., 9. 501 SW Morton Ave., 10. 920
SW Maple Ave., 11. 129 NW Santa Fe Ave., 12. 127 NW Santa Fe Ave., 13. 213
NW Margarite Ave., 14. 1724 W. 4" St.. and 15. 513 SW Morton Ave.

Receipt of Report of Findings Regarding an Appeal

i. Receipt and acceptance of report of findings regarding an appeal by Brad D.
Purvis of the Code Enforcement Hearing Examiner's Order of Abatement in
Case No. DS-0325-0378, regarding the property at 116 S. Comanche Ave., legally
described as the South %2 of Lot 5, Block 12, Capitol Hill Addition, Bartlesville,
Washington County, Oklahoma.

Receipt of Bartlesville NEXT Progress Report
i. Bartlesville NEXT Progress Report June 2025

Receipt of ALPR (Flock Cameras) Report
i. ALPR Report for June 2025

Receipt of Financials
i. Interim financials for eleven months ending May 31, 2025.

Receipt of Bids

i. Bid No. 2024-2026-001 for Water and Waste Water Line Materials

ii. Bid No. 2024-2026-002 for Water Treatment Chemicals

iii. Bid No. 2024-2026-003 for Highland Drive, Wilshire Avenue, Waverly Avenue, and
Oakdale Drive Concrete Panel Replacements

iv. Bid No. 2024-2026-005 Construct Box Hangar for the Bartlesville Municipal Airport

Curd provided the consent docket on a PowerPoint slide and referred citizens to the

agenda where every item was listed. He asked the Council if there were any items to be pulled

for disc

Vice M
second

ussion. He pulled ltem 7.c.i.

ayor Dorsey moved to approve the Consent Docket with the exception of Iltem 7.c.i.,
ed by Mr. Kirkpatrick.

Voting Aye:  Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None

Motion:

Passed

Item 7.c.i. Resolution authorizing and requiring the marking of the graves of John F. Walters

and George E. Moore and commending Joe Todd for his efforts on behalf of
veterans.

City Attorney Kane presented the resolution that was brought forward by the local
veteran’s advocate, Joe Todd. There are two World War | veterans that died shortly
after their services and their graves were never marked. The only way to mark
them, per State law, was at the family’s request or with their permission. Since
there is no family to consider, Mr. Todd requested assistance from Mr. Kane in
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order to rectify the situation, therefore the City Council resolution. Mr. Kane and
the Mayor praised Joe Todd for raising the issue and supporting veteran
recognition.

Mayor Curd moved to approve Item 7.c.i., seconded by Mr. Sherrick.

Voting Aye:  Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mayor

Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2024-2026-001 for Water and Waste
Water Line Materials. Presented by Councilmember East.

Mr. East provided the bid recommendation details, and inquired of Water Utilities Director, Mr.
Lauritsen, what the process is on bids that tie. Mr. Lauritsen explained that he alternates between
the two if there are multiple orders within the fiscal year.

Mr. East moved to approve the award of bid to the various vendors as highlighted within the
attached bid tabulation, seconded by Mr. Kirkpatrick.

Voting Aye:  Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2024-2026-002 for Water Treatment
Chemicals. Presented by Councilmember East.

Mr. East provided the bid recommendation details. Fluoride-related concerns were discussed,
including Governor Stitt's executive order pausing state-level recommendation. Staff clarified that
awarding bids does not require purchase, in the event that fluoridation is mandated to end. Council
continued with a robust discussion on the Executive Order that directed the Oklahoma
Department of Health to pause its recommendation for fluoridation and to conduct a 90-day
review. Key points raised:

° Council Concerns: Several councilmembers, including Mr. East and Mr. Kirkpatrick,
expressed concern about potential health impacts of fluoride, especially on children.

o Terminology Clarification: Staff explained the chemical differences between fluorine,
fluoride, and hydrofluorosilicic acid (the compound currently used).

° Ordinance Review: The City's ordinance refers to “fluorination” using one part per million.

Mr. Lauritsen explained that currently, the City doses at 0.7 ppm, a standard
recommended by major health organizations. Also, regarding an ordinance from possibly
1978 inquiry by Mr. Sherrick, Mr. Lauritsen agreed to research when and why the city
shifted from "fluorine" to hydrofluorosilicic acid at that time.

. State Role: City staff emphasized the need to wait for the outcome of the 90-day state
review before making changes to local fluoridation policy.

. Public Safety Systems: Mr. Lauritsen detailed extensive safeguards, including:
) Hourly testing and real-time monitoring

Manual testing every two hours
Isolation tanks and emergency drainage procedures
Air-gapped (offline) computer systems to prevent hacking

O 0O O

Possible next steps discussed were holding a Council workshop to explore alternatives and public
education; updating the City ordinance to reference modern health guidance; and revisiting the
issue once State findings are available in approximately 90 days. Council members praised the
informative discussion and staff's professionalism, particularly Terry Lauritsen, for detailed
responses and transparency regarding chemical safety. All acknowledged the importance of
public engagement and the need for further research before making decisions about fluoridation.
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12,

Mr. East moved to approve the award of bid to the various vendors as highlighted within the
attached bid tabulation, seconded by Vice Mayor Dorsey.

Voting Aye:  Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action to award Bid No. 2024-2026-003 for Highland Drive,
Wilshire Avenue, Waverly Avenue, and Oakdale Drive Concrete Panel Replacement
Project. Presented by Councilmember East.

Mr. East provided the bid recommendation details.

Mr. East moved to approve the award of bid to R & L Construction, LLC, Sapulpa, OK, in the
amount of $847,000, seconded by Vice Mayor Dorsey.

Voting Aye:  Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Unsheltered Homeless Task Force Update. Presented by Task Force Members Ms. Rachel
Showler and Mr. Tom Gorman.

Councilman Kirkpatrick and Chairman of the Unsheltered Homeless Task Force announced that
there will not be an update at this time.

Discuss and take possible action on appeals by Danny L. Blackwood of the Hearing
Examiner’s Order of Abatement for boarding and securing, and demolition and removal of
dilapidated structures at 1032 SW Oak Ave., legally described as Lot 12, Blk 1 McCaleb
Addition, Bartlesville, Washington County, Oklahoma (Code Enforcement Case Number
DS-0325-0384 and -0385). Presented by Larry Curtis, Director of Community Development.

Mr. Curtis reported that the case originated from a complaint on March 20 regarding an unsecured
structure. A City inspection on March 21, 2025 confirmed that the house and storm shelter were
open and accessible; that there were extensive structural issues such as holes in the roof and
floor, wood rot, missing siding, and structural damage; additional hazards such as deteriorating
fence, hazardous sidewalk, and overhanging trees; and no active water service since May 2011,
indicating the property is uninhabitable. Courtesy notices sent on March 25, violation notices sent
on April 15, and a hearing was held on May 14, resulting in: Order 1: property must be boarded
and secured within two days; and Order 2: demolition/removal of structures within 30 days. Mr.
Blackwood appealed the hearing officer's orders five days later, with no remediation plan
provided. The property has a history of code violations and City abatements, most recently for
trash and overgrowth on June 5. Staff recommends denial of appeal due to public safety concerns,
negligence history, and lack of remediation plan or compliance.

The appellate, Mr. Blackwood, cited health issues, including a broken hip and diabetes, hindering
his ability to maintain the property; that he is in the process of selling the property via verbal
agreement; claims of repeated vandalism and trespassing by homeless individuals; asserted that
the property has been re-secured recently, including chaining the cellar; and that due his
construction engineering experience, he feels that the structure is repairable. Mr. Blackwood
confirmed he did not attend the initial hearing, citing mail delays as the reason. He requested
more time to remedy the issues and stated a desire to resolve the matter without demolition.

Discussion covered the longstanding condition of the property, including 14 years with no water
service; ongoing impact on neighboring properties; repeated code enforcement activity over the
years; security concerns, particularly an open storm shelter posing risk to children; and
emphasized that progress must be verifiable and that prior delays warranted strict timelines.



13.

Mr. Kirkpatrick moved to grant a conditional extension as follows: the storm shelter must be
secured within 3 days, verified by staff; the house must be fully boarded and secured within 30
days to City standards; full remediation and code compliance must be completed within 60 days;
and if these requirements are not met, the demolition order will proceed automatically without
further Council action, seconded by Vice Mayor Dorsey.

Voting Aye:  Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Discuss and take possible action on approving the Proposed Green Fee, Cart Fees, and
Annual Pass rates for City of Bartlesville public golf course. Presented by Dee Roadman,
Director, Golf Division.

Mr. Roadman introduced the proposed rate structure for the City of Bartlesville Golf Course, citing
several factors that informed the updates such as the J.J. Keegan Consultant Report (2024)
evaluating the current business model, feedback from the City’'s Golf Steering Committee,
comparative market analysis of public golf courses in the Tulsa area, Ongoing renovations and
improvements to the greens, and the Upgrade to a new fleet of lithium-ion battery-powered golf
carts equipped with GPS. He provided a slide comparing the current rates to the proposed rate
structure (attached to these minutes). The proposed rates are as follows:

Annual Passes:

Individual Pass (7-day): $1,600 / $2,500 with annual cart and range credit
Family Pass: $2,000 / $2,950 with annual cart and range credit

Weekday Pass: $1,400 / $2,200 with cart with annual cart and range credit

Public Daily Rates:

Weekday Green Fee: $30 walking / $47 with cart.

Weekend Green Fee: $35 walking / $52 with cart.

Senior Rate: $25 walking / $39 with cart.

Junior Rate: $10, available weekdays and weekends during non-peak hours.

Nine-Hole Rate: $22 weekday / $25 weekend (walking); $32 weekday / $35 weekend (with cart).
Replay Rate: $20 per person (cart included; space available only).

Fees do not include taxes of 8.9%.

Added Membership Benefits:

Annual passes receive daily range credit of $10.50 individual, $21 family

Annual passes to include 15% discount in the golf shop merchandise (excludes clubs, balls,
grips (already marked down)).

Monthly payment option available (+$6 finance fee per month)

Family annual pass includes both spouses and dependents under the age of 21

Juniors 12 & under play free with paid adult (after twilight w/adult/non-peak times)

Rates reviewed and subject to change yearly.

Mr. Roadman emphasized that the new pricing remains competitive with Tulsa area courses and
reflects the enhanced value provided through improved facilities and equipment.

Mr. Roadman also announced the rebranding and renaming of the course to “Boots Hollow Golf
Club”, in honor of its founder, K.S. “Boots” Adams. The Adams family supports the rebranding
initiative. A new logo is in development and will be unveiled prior to reopening.

Council members expressed appreciation for the comprehensive rate review, praised the
competitive pricing, and noted that rebranding reflects community heritage. There was also
discussion about the value of GPS-enabled carts for course preservation and player experience.
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15.

16.

Mr. Kirkpatrick moved to approve the proposed fees and rates as presented, seconded by Mr.
East.

Voting Aye:  Mr. Kirkpatrick, Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

Presentation of potential capital election timelines for . Cent Sales Tax, General
Obligation Bonds, and Economic Development. Presented by Micah Siemers, P.E., CFM
and Director of Engineering.

Mr. Siemers reviewed the upcoming expiration of capital funding measures and proposed
potential timelines for voter consideration of extensions. The current half-cent sales tax (approved
in 2020) expires June 30, 2026, the current GO bonds expire Fall 2027, and that sales tax and
GO bond extensions both require simple majority voter approval. He added that past durations of
GO bonds are typically 3 to 5 years and sales tax is historically 5 to 7 years. Mr. Siemers provided
three proposed scenarios as follows: Scenario 1: 3-year GO bond $12 M expires 2030/ 5-year
sales tax $17M expires 2031; Scenario 2. 4-year GO bond $16M/ 5-year sales tax $17M
(synchronized expiration in 2031); and Scenario 3: 5-year term for both (GO bond expires 2032
$20M, sales tax expires 2031 $17M). Considerations provided were how synchronized timelines
streamline public understanding and reduces administrative workload, and how extended
timelines (beyond 5 years) present greater inflationary and forecasting risks. Council discussion
favored Scenario 3 for its balance between planning certainty and operational flexibility; and
preferences were expressed for a March 2026 election. Mr. Siemers stated his appreciation of
the discussion and will proceed with planning under this direction.

Discuss and take possible action to adopt Council Action Items that resulted from the
March 24, 2025 Strategic Planning Retreat. Presented by Mike Bailey, City Manager.

Mr. Bailey presented the updated strategic plan based on input from the March 24 council retreat.
Three draft versions were considered- the original compilation by Mr. Bailey, Councilman
Kirkpatrick’s version edited for clarity; and a third final revision incorporating feedback from Mayor
Curd and others. A brief discussion was held regarding the Council’s vision and priorities. It was
agreed that the third version was most acceptable with revisions as follows: Add additional
language, “and improve water quality” to Item 3.7, and on Item 3.8 change to “Promote a culture
that values individual rights, personal liberty, mutual respect, responsibility, and accountability to
our community”.

Vice Mayor Dorsey moved to adopt the strategic planning document with the discussed changes
and authorize staff to finalize formatting and grammatical revisions, seconded by Mr. East.

Voting Aye:  Vice Mayor Dorsey, Mr. Sherrick, Mr. East, Mr. Kirkpatrick, Mayor Curd
Voting Nay: None
Motion: Passed

New Business.
There was no new business.

*Councilman Kirkpatrick inquired if he could ask a follow-up question regarding Item 12. Mayor
Curd stated that he could. He inquired if the action taken by Council would open the Council or
staff up to critique or legal action should the demolition of Mr. Blackwood’s property occur, and
legal recourse is taken. City Attorney Kane stated that he feels it was an acceptable way of
handling the issue. He added that there are requirements, procedures, for how to pursue this kind
of thing and any time that they are departed from, it could allow a plaintiff with creative lawyer
potential for a case, although he feels the Council is on firm ground with their decision. There is
always the option to re-address when or if the time comes for removal of the buildings, if that is
the desire of the Council.
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18.

19.

City Manager and Staff Reports.

Mike reported that recently the City of Bartlesville was awarded the Partners in Progress award
by ACTE, the organization that Tri County Tech (TCT) belongs to. This essentially is the
partnership the City has that that involves public safety training with TCT. TCT supplies the City
with a police substation and the City provides them with a School Resource Officer. They also
have a burn tower there that is used for training firefighters from all over this region. Mr. Bailey
stated that he feels this partnership is very representative not just of Tri County Tech but also
Bartlesville Public Schools, of our universities, of the whole city. All of the community agencies
work incredibly well together so he felt really strange having TCT present the award to him, and
feels strongly it should be awarded to the City Council. He stated his appreciation of Tri County
Tech, and added that perhaps a special City Council meeting could be held in the PD substation
so the Council could see what a first-class training facility it is. He reiterated what a great
partnership the City has with Tri County Tech, ending with how “we are definitely better together”.

City Council Comments and Inquiries.
There were no City Council comments or inquiries.

There being no further business to address, Mayor Curd adjourned the meeting at 7:59

BBVl

James S. Curd, Jr.
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Annual Passes

Proposed Manual of Fees

§
P

CONNECTEOD/

Current Rates

=11ly city of .
f!:lB bartlesville

IVIBRANT

Individual Annual Pass

Family Annual Pass

$900 + tax {excludes cart & range)
$2,100 + tax (w/ annual cart, no range)
$1,100 + tax (excludes cart & range)
$2,600 + tax (w/ annual cart, no range)

Weekday Annual Pass

$1,600 + tax (excludes cart)

$2,500 + tax (w/ annual cart, range credit)
$2,000 + tax (excludes cart)

$2,950 + tax (w/ annual cart, range credit)

$800 + tax (excludes_cart & range)
$2,000 + tax (w/ annual cart, no range)

$1,400 + tax {excludes cart)
$2,200 + tax {w/ annual cart, range credit)

Public Rates

Regular Rate (18 holes)

$21 (W) / $36 (w/ cart) Weekdays
$22 (W) / $37 (w/ cart) Weekends

$30 (W) / $47 (w/cart) Weekdays
$35 (W) / $52 (w/cart) Weekends

Seniors 60+ (Weekdays
Only)

$16 (W) / $31 (w/ cart)

$25 (W) / $39 (w/ cart)

Twilight (times vary)

"Replay (sp_ace availabili_tv_
only)

$16 (W) / $31 (w/ cart) WD & WE

N/A

$25 (W) / $39 (w/ cart) WD & WE

$20 + tax (includes cart fee)

Juniors (13-17)

| $8 Weekdays & Weekends
space availability only/non-peak times

9-holes

$14 (W) / $22 (w/ cart) Weekdays
$14 (W) / $22 (w/ cart) Weekends

e Fees Do Not Include Taxes of 8.9%.

$10 Weekdays & Weekends
space availability only/non-peak times

$22 (W) / $32 (w/ cart) Weekdays
$25 (W) / $35 (w/ cart) Weekends

® Annual Passes receive Daily Range Credit: $10.50 Individual, $21 Family
e Annual Passes to include: 15% discount on Golf Shop merchandise (excludes: clubs, balls, grips
(already marked down)).

e Monthly payment option available (+ $6 finance fee per month).

e Family Annual Pass includes both spouses and dependents under the age of 21.
e Juniors 12 & Under Play Free with paid Adult (after twilight w/ adult / non-peak times).
e Rates reviewed and subject to change yearly.




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - 81D TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION A: PIPE & TUBING

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED

PIPE & SUPPLY TULSA WINWATER UTILITY

Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE Zach Wolfe SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long |580-370-6340 or Brandon Epps

i or 918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 Nicole Gorbert 913_266_02"0';
Tyler Lyles 918-203-0183
479-431-7750
A-1 3/4" PE Pipe C.T.S. 1000 ft NOBID | $ 0.28 NO BID NOBID| $ 0.35
A-2 1" PE Pipe C.T.S. 500 A NOBID | $ 0.45 NO BID NOBID | $ 0.65
A-3 1-1/2" PE Pipe C.T.S 600 ft NOBID | $ 0.90 NO BID NOBID| $ 1.25
A-4 2" PE Pipe C.T.S, 3000 |f NOBID | $ 1.48 NO BID NOBID | $ 2,00
A-5 4" C-900 DR 18 200 fi NOBID | $ 475| % 47219 4731 % 463
A-6 6" C-900 DR 18 200 fl NOBID | $ 970| $ 960 | % 961| % 9.41
A-7 4" SCH 40 PVC 400 ft NOBID | $ 216 | $ 152 | 8% 2,76 NO BID
A-8 6" PVC SDR 26 500 ft NOBID | § 595] % 571 | $ 572 | % 5.85
A-9 8" PVC SDR 26 1000 |ft NOBID | $ 1065 | $ 1034 | $ 1035 | $ 9.95
A-10 10" PVC SDR 26 100 ft NOBID | $ 1750 | $ 16.11| $ 16.12 15.44
_ Poly Wrap (bid per roll _200" per roll)
A-11 Core & Main = 200" UTS = 440" 10 rl NOBID | $ 57.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
A-12 Caution Tape (bid per roll 1,000 per roll) 10 rl NOBID | $ 7.95 NO BID NOBID| $ 15.00
A-13 [Detectable Locator Tape (bid per roll 5 |n NOBID | § 21.50 NO BID NOBID | § 40,00
1,000 per roll)

A-14  |Poly Tape (bid per roll _100" per roll) 5 ri NOBID | $ 5.25 NO BID NOBID| § 11.55
A15 f;lﬁ Solid Wire THHN 500 roll (bid per 12 |d NOBID | § 62.00 NO BID NOBID | § 125.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZSaAc:Vw::IfQTER
. Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY
. Estimated . 580-370-6340
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long or Brandon Epps
g or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183
B-1 4" Mega Lugs (DIP) 8lea NOBID | $ 47.45 27.34 NOBID | $ 29.75
B-2 4" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 4 wedge 8lea NOBID | § 53.25 33.87 NOBID | § 36.00
B-3 6" Mega Lugs (DIP) 30[ea NOBID | § 54,75 31.83 NOBID | § 34,50
B-4 6" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100(ea NOBID | $ 62,49 40.81 NOBID | § 44,00
B-5 |8" Mega Lugs (DIP) 10[ea NOBID | $ 75.15 47.75 NOBID | § 51.00
B-6 !8" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/ 6 wedge 100|ea NOBID | $ 86.50 60.40 NOBID | $ 64,00
B-7 14" Mega Lugs (DIP) w/10 wedge 2lea NOBID | § 199.45 136.73 NOBID | § 145.00
B-8 14" Mega Lugs (PVC) w/10 wedge 2lea NOBID | $ 259.00 193.06 NOBID | § 210.00
B-9 6" MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2leal $ 11165 |8 102.00 103.57 NOBID | § 106.50
B-10 |8"MJ 11 1/4° Bend 2leal $ 151.21 | $ 138.85 140.26 NOBID | $ 144.50
B-11 6" MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2lea| $ 106.55 | $ 97.84 98.38 NOBID | $ 101.50
B-12  |8"MJ 22 1/2° Bend 2lea| $ 166.52 | $ 152.90 154.46 NOBID | § 169.00
B-13  |4" MJ 45° Bend 2lea| $ 740118 68.30 68.25 NOBID | $ 70,50
B-14  [6" MJ 45° Bend 15lea| $ 11739 | $ 107.75 108.89 NOBID | § 112.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID

CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY

TULSA WINWATER
Zach Wolfe

tom # Description Esimated | T roarr | kemio | sosmuaiong | S00s0 | ool
or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 ) 918-266-0209
479-431-7750
B-15 |8"MJ 45° Bend 5leal § 170.98 | $ 157.00 158.62 NOBID | $ 163.50
B-16 6" MJ 90° Bend 6leal § 144.83 | $ 133.60 134.34 NOBID | § 138.00
817 8" MJ 90° Bend 3lea| $ 20863 | $ 191,55 193.53 NOBID | § 199,00
B-18 4" MJ Bolt Pack 24/eal $ 23618 2235 21.89 NOBID | $ 22,60
B-19  [4"MJ Plug 2leal $ 4147 |3 38.45 38.46 NOBID | § 39.50
B-20 [6"MJ Plug 2leal $ 7784 | $ 71.45 72.20 NOBID | $ 74.25
B-21  [8°MJ Plug 2leal $ 114.84 | $ 105.95 106.53 NOBID | § 109.50
8-22 |4x2MJPlug 2leal $ 7656 | $ 69.90 71.02 NOBID | § 73.00
B-23  |8x 6 MJ Reducer 2lea| $ 122.50 | $ 111.55 113.63 NOBID | § 117.00
B-24  [6x6x6 MJ Swivel Tee 8leal $ 23861 | $ 219.00 221.34 NOBID | § 225.00
B-25 [Bx8x6 MJ Swivel Tee 4leal $ 299.22 | § 277,00 281.65 NOBID | § 285.00
B-26 (66 x6 MJ Straight Tee 8leal $ 207.35 | $ 191.00 19234 NOBID | § 198.00
B-27 [8x8x6 MJ Straight Tee 4leal § 257.11 | $ 238,00 238,51 NOBID|$ 245.00
B-28 [8x8x8 MJ Straight Tee 4leal $ 31071 | $ 286.75 288,22 NOBID | § 295.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION B: DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID

CONSOLIDATED

PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS::'\:V\I;:IV::TER

Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-6340 UTILITY SUPPLY

Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long . Brandon Epps

v or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209

Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203:0183

B-29 |4 x2 MJ Tapped Plug 2leal $ 7656 | $§ 70.65 71.02 NOBID | $§ 73.25
B-30 |6 x2 MJ Tapped Plug 4lea| $ 11165 | $ 102.50 103.57 NOBID | $ 106.50
B-31 |Bx2 MJ Tapped Plug 2lea| $ 149.29 | $ 137.75 138.48 NOBID | § 142,50
B-32 4" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) Blea| $ 7847 | $ 72.05 7279 NOBID | § 75.00
B-33 |6" Solid Sleeves (12" Length) 24lea| $ 13143 | $ 120.60 121,91 NOBID | $ 225,00
B-34  |8" Solid Sleeves (12"Length) Blea| $ 21054 | § 193.00 195.30 NOBID | § 201.00
B-35 |10" Solid Sleeves (12" Lenglh) 2lea| $ 252,01 | § 231.40 233.77 NOBID | $ 240.00
B-36 |3/4"x 4" T Bolts 100[ea| $ 319 |8 299 295 NOBID | § 4.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSONDRIED TULSA WINWATER
S LT Zach Wolfe UTILITY
. Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE
. Estimated . 580-370-6340 SUPPLY
Item # Description . 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long
Quantity or 918-586-7100 | 918-445.0005 . Brandon Epps
Nicole Gorbert 9184 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles 203-0183
479-431-7750
C-1 3" Fire Hydrant Meter 3| ea| $ 129182 | $ 1,925.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-2 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve, Mueller 8| ea NOBID | $ 770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
c3 'iéf:o':"e R e Kengnay: 8| ea NOBID | $ 690.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C4 214 Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, Kennedy, 4| ea NOBID | $ 690.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
c-5 6 1/4" Fire Hydrant Repair Kit, U.S. 6| ea NOBID | $ 685.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-6 Fire Hydrant, 3' Bury 3| ea| $ 261269 | $ 2,650.00 NOBID | § 238125 | $ 2,628.77
c-7 Fire Hydrant, 3.5' Bury 2| ea| $ 267634 | $ 2,690.25 NOBID | $ 2439.04 | $ 2,695.42
c-8 Fire Hydrant, 4' Bury 2| ea| $ 273998 | $ 2,775.00 NOBID | § 249681 | $ 2,762.06
c-9 Fire Hydrant, 4.5 Bury 3l eal 3 280363 | $ 2,826.75 NOBID | $ 255460 | $ 2,828.89
Cc-10 Fire Hydrant, 5' Bury 3| ea| $ 286728 | $ 2,890.90 NOBID | § 2,629.11 | $ 2,895.04
Traffic Repair Kits for Mueller Centruian
c-11 022MUA301 3| ea NOBID | § 650.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Large Meter Boxes Complete with Lids
C-12 (Carson 1730-18 HDPE) 15| ea| $ 304.50 | $ 31400 | $ 31241 | § 310.23 NO BID
Small Meter Boxes Compiete with Lids
Cc-13 (Carson 2200-18) 150|ea.| $ 12550 | $ 126.00 | $ 126.16 | $ 126.00 NO BID
Cc-14 Small Meter Boxes (Carson 2200-18) 300| ea| $ 58,50 | $ 55.00 | $ 5541 | % 55.14 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
gg‘fg ;E:JS) TULSA WINWATER
. Troy McCamish | CORE & MAIN | FORTILINE LTI AL
p - Estimated A 580-370-6340 SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantity 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long or Brandon Epps
or 918-586-7100 | 918-445-0005 \: 1o Gorbert 918| 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles 203-0183
479-431-7750 )
C-15  |Small Meter Box Lids 50| ea 7475 | § 7300| $ 7276 | $ 72.40 NO BID
C-1g |17 the lid flange & nut (Nepune) for 200 ea NOBID | § 52.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
attaching AMI antennas
C-17 |5 1/4" x 2 1/4" Valve Box Extension 24| ea 32273 32,00 NO BID NOBID | § 26.00
C-18 |5 1/4" x 4" Valve Box Extension 20| ea 3945 | § 37.35 NO BID NOBID | $ 36.00
Valve Box, Short Adj. 10"-Top 16"-Bottom
C19 |- oMPLETE 36| ea 67.24 | $ 63,05 NO BID NOBID | $ 70.00
Valve Box, Tall Adj. 16"-Top, 24"-Bottom
C20 |compLETE 50| ea 89.65|$ 84.00 NO BID NOBID | § 94,00
C-21  [10" Valve Box Tops 10| ea NOBID | $ 2315 NO BID NOBID | § 27.50
C-22  |16" Valve Box Tops 10| ea NOBID | $ 32.00 NO BID NOBID | $ 41,00
C-23  [16" Valve Box Boltoms 10| ea NOBID | $ 38.50 NO BID NOBID | $ 36.00
C-24  |24" Valve Box Bottoms 10| ea NOBID | $ 44.05 NO BID NOBID | $ 48,50
C-25 |3"RW MJ Gate Valve 3| ea 609.77 | $ 600,00 NOBID | $ 53672 | $ 561.45
C-26  |4" RW MJ Gate Valve 6| ea 681.41 |8 682.00 NOBID | $ 596.36 | $ 653,88
C-27  |6" RW MJ Gate Valve 25| ea 869.52 | § 890.00 NOBID | $ 75084 | $ 848,26
C-28  |8" RW MJ Gate Valve 5| ea. 1,384.95 | § 1,350.00 NOBID | $ 1,208.95 | $ 1,350.16




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION C: VALVES, HYDRANTS, METERS & BOXES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMENE: AWARD TIE BID
QONSALIGws IS5 TULSA WINWATER
PIPE & SUPPLY Zach Wolf UTILITY
Troy McGamish CORE & MAIN | FORTILINE pirlbieitis
. Estimated 580-370-6340 SUPPLY
Item # Description 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long
Quantity ot 918-586-7100 | 918-445.0005 W Brandon Epps
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert 9184 918-266-0209
479-431-7750 20183
C-29 |4" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 1|ea.| $ 650.54 | § 645.00 NOBID | § 776.50 | $ 762.09
C-30 |6" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 10|ea.| § BEO.52 | $ 870.00 NOBID | $ 1,08315| $ 1,118.74
c-31 8" RW Flange x MJ Tapping Valve 5|ea.| § 135874 | $ 1,450.00 NOBID | § 161138 | § 1,690.52
C-32  |Water Sample Stations Eclipse #88 5| ea. NOBID | $ 1,450.00 | $ 121174 | $ 1,212.64 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID

CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY

TULSA WINWATER
Zach Wolfe

or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
s
479-431-7750
Couplings (Stainless Steel Nuts & Bolts)
D-1 1" Bolted Coupling 20|ea NOBID | § 38.45 36.29 NOBID | § 39.50
D-2 1.5" Bolted Coupling 12|es NOBID | § 43.45 41,22 NOBID | $ 45.00
D-3 2"x5" Bolted Coupling #411 24|ea NOBID | $ 46.15 44.50 NOBID | § 48.50
D-4 3" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 3.46-4.21 2|ea NOBID | § 128.45 121.15 NOBID | § 130.00
D-5 4" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 4.20-5.33 6lea NOBID | § 169.65 150.41 NO BID NO BID
D-6 6" Bolted Coupling #461 OD 6.54-7.65 20|ea NOBID | § 219.75 208.74 NOBID | $ 125.00
D-7 8" Bolted Coupling #461 8.54 x 9.90 15jea NOBID | § 263.50 250.77 NOBID | $ 275.00
D-8 10" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 10.65-12.20 4|ea NOBID | § 458.00 441.05 NOBID | $ 480.00
D-9 12" Bolted Coupling #462 OD 12.75 - 14.40 4lea NOBID | $ 54475 517.04 NOBID | $ 550.00
D-10 |3/4" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 36|ea NOBID | $ 19.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
D-11  |1" Galv. Comp Coupling #522 30|ea NOBID | $ 20.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
D-12 |2" Galv, Comp. Coupling #522 24|ea NOBID | $ 39.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID!

CONSOLIDATED

PIPE & SUPPLY TULZSQ":V\II?‘\::::TER

Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-6340 UTILITY SUPPLY

Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long P Brandon Epps
y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183
# 248 Clamps
D-13  [1-1/2" x 3" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 6lea NOBID | § 21.00 20.49 NOBID | § 22.00
D-14 [1-1/2" x 6" Clamp #248 SB OD 1.88-1.90 15|ea NOBID | § 41.00 39.38 NOBID | § 42,00
# 261 Clamps (Single Band)

D-15 |2"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 2.35-2.63 5lea NOBID | § 49.00 47.32 NOBID | § 50.00
D-16 [4" x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.41 5lea NOBID | § 62.00 59.45 NOBID | § 65,00
D-17 [4"x 12" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5lea NOBID | § 95.00 91.24 NOBID | § 99.00
D-18 (4" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 4.74-5.14 5|ea NOBID | $ 110.00 101.34 NOBID | § 110.00
D-19  |[6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2|ea NOBID | § 70.00 68.57 NOBID | § 73.00
D-20 |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 36|ea NOBID | § 7225 69.32 NOBID | $ 75.00
D-21  |6" x 7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 5leal NOBID | $§ 73.65 70.36 NOBID | § 75.00
D-22 6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20/ea NOBID | $ 115.80 111.12 NOBID | $ 120.00
D-23 |6" x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 10lea NOBID | $ 116.35 112.14 NOBID | § 121.00
D-24 |6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.56-6.96 2|ea NOBID | $ 126.45 121.13 NOBID | $ 133.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIRE 8 SUPPLY TULSA WINWATER

Estimated | oV McCamish | CORE & MAIN FORTILINE e UTILITY SUPPLY

Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long Brandon Epps
4 or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 ooor 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 SRR
D-25 6" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 6.84-7.24 20|ea NOBID | $ 127.50 122.34 NOBID|$ 134.00
D-26 |6"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 7.05-7.45 2lea NOBID | § 127.50 123.38 NOBID | § 135.00
D-27 [8"x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2lea NOBID | $ 83.95 82.21 NOBD | $ 88.00
D-28 |8" x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 15|ea NOBID | § 83.95 8274 NOBID | $ 89.00
D29 & x7-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 9.05-9.39 (Part 4lea NOBID | $ 83.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
#90507)
D-30 |8"x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 10jea NOBID | § 130.00 128.98 NOBID | $ 141,00
D-31 |8"x 12-1/2" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10[ea NOBID | § 130.00 132.15 NOBID | $ 142.00
D-32 8" x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.54-8.94 2lea NOBID|$ 154.00 147.83 NOBID | § 162.00
D-33 |8"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 8.99-9.39 10[ea NOBID | § 155.00 148.48 NOBID | § 160.00
D-34 |10"x 15" Clamp #261 OD 11.04-11.44 2lea NOBID | § 198.10 191.68 NOBID | § 210.00
# 262 Clamps (Double Band)

D-35 |6"x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2lea NOBID | § 110.00 108.19 NOBID | § 115.00
D-36 [6" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 6.84-7.64 2lea NOBID | $ 202.00 199.66 NOBID | § 215.00
D-37 8" x 7-1/2" Clamp #262 OD 8.99-9.79 2lea NOBID | $ 125.00 120,86 NOBID | § 130.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION D: COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, TAPPING SLEEVES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

‘TIE BID

CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS:::V‘;CI::?:TER
. Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY
o Estimated . 580-370-6340
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long . Brandon Epps
y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 LIRS
D-38 |8" x 15" Clamp #262 OD B8.99-9.79 2lea NOBID | § 236.00 227.88 NOBID | § 250.00
D-39 |10" x 15" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2lea NOBID | § 290,00 283.34 NOBID | $ 310.00
D-40 |10"x20" Clamp #262 OD 11.10-11.90 2lea NOBID | § 385.00 377.07 NOBID | § 400.00
# 264 Clamps
D-41  |6"x7.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20ea NOBID | $ 101.00 94.55 NOBID | § 104.00
D-42 |6"x12.5"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6,56-6.96 20pa, NOBID | $ 155.00 135.35 NOBID | § 148.00
D-43 |8"x15"x1" CC Clamp #264 OD 6.84-7.24 20jea NOBID | § 170.00 147.55 NOBID | $ 160.00
# 662 Wet Tap Saddles

D-44 |6"x4" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2lea NOBID | $ 358.00 NO BID NOBID | § 365.00
D-45 |6"x6" Wet Tap Saddle Transite Pipe #662 2lea NOBID | $ 385.00 NO BID NOBID | § 393,00
D-46 |6"x6" Wet Tap Saddie CIOD #662 5lea NOBID | $ 386.95 NO BID NOBID | $ 394,00
D-47 |8"x6" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2lea NOBID | $ 455.00 NO BID NOBID|$ 462.00
D-48 |8"x8" Wet Tap Saddle CIOD #662 2lea NOBID | $ 550,00 NO BID NOBID | $ 562.00
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WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION E:

BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS::'\:VW::IQTER
" Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY
~ Estimated . 580-370-6340
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long s Brandon Epps
4 or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Siop
E-1 BA13-232W 100] ea NOBID | $ 4175 % 4194 | § 41311 % 40.67
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-2 BAZ3-332-W 50| ea NOBID | $ 81.00 | $ 8180 | $ 80.56 | § 79.35
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve,
E-3 BA43-232-W 50| ea NOBID | $ 49,00 | $ 4927 | § 48531 % 4776
3/4" Angle Ball Meter Valve
E-4 BA-43-332-W 50| ea NOBID | $ 8375 | % 8413 % 8285 | § 81.63
1" Angle Ball Meter Valve
E-5 BA43444W 50| ea NOBID | § 12145 | $ 12625 | § 12433 | % 122.48
1 1" Angle Key Meter Valve (Female)
E-6 KV13-444W (Stops) 50| ea NOBID | $ 51.30 | $ 5288 | % 5208 | % 51.34
E-7 1 44Anvsle Key Meter Valve (Flare) Kv23- 50 ea NOBID | $ 54.80 | § 5648 | $ 5553 | § 55.03
1" Angle Key Meter Valve
E-8 (Compression) KV43-444W (Stops) 50| ea NOBID | $ 58.36 | § 6037 | $ 5945 | $ 58.60
1 1/2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-9 B11-666W 6| ea NOBID | $ 180.20 | $ 18415 | $ 18707 | $ 178.42
2" Ball Valve Curb Stop
E-10 B11-777-W 6lea| $ 26134 | % 26015 | $ 268.13 | § 264041 9% 259,90
E-1 3/4" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-3 100| ea NOBID | $ 5215 | $ 5362 | $ 52811 % 52.04
E-12 1" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-4 50| ea NOBID | § 68.50 | $ 7052 | § 6945 | % 68.43
E-13 1 1/2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-6 10| ea NOBID | $ 154,00 | $ 158,08 | $ 160.58 | $ 153.36
E-14 2" Ball Corp Stop FB-1000-7 15| ea NOBID | § 25390 | $ 26146 | $ 25746 | $ 253.66




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION E:

BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS:::::V‘II\’;‘:;:TER
Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-6340 UTILITY SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long P Brandon Epps
y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183

E-15 3/4" tnsert, #51 500| ea NOBID | $ 1.56 | § 202 | % 206 |93 1.54
E-16 1" Insert, #52 500| ea NOBID | $ 166 | $ 215 $ 219(% 1.63
E-17 1.5" Insert #54 300| ea NOBID | $ 225 |% 296 | $ 302($% 223
E-18 2" Insert #55 300| ea NOBID | $ 225|% 231 % 235 | % 223
E-19 3/4"x1" A-24 Adapters 50| ea| $ 1346 | § 2680 | $ 1381 8 1404 | $ 26.75
E-20 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-33 75| ea| $ 1704 | $ 17.01| 1748 | $ 1722 | $ 16.96
E-21 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-33 100| ea| $ 1620 | § 16.15 | $ 1662 | $ 16.37 | $ 16.12
E-22 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-33 100| ea| $ 17731 % 1765 | $ 1818 % 1791 % 17.66
E-23 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-33 75| ea| $ 1973 | § 19.75 | $ 2023 | § 1893 | § 19,64
E-24 3/4" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-33 50| eal $ 2300 $ 2325 (% 2358 | § 23241 % 22,88
E-25 1" Pack Joint Coupling  C-14-44 50| eal $ 2312 % 23451 % 2372| $ 2336 § 23.01
E-26 1" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-44 50| ea| $ 1920 | § 1945 | § 1875 | § 19401 % 19.09
E-27 1" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-44 50| ea| $ 2256 | $ 2290 | $ 2315 | § 2280 $ 22,48
E-28 1" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-44 50| ea| $ 3747 | % 3730 | $ 3844 | § 3786 |3 37.30

13




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION E:

BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS;::’\:Vw(‘::[fCTER
Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-6340 UTILITY SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long Brandon Epps
./ or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . or 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431.7750 918-203-0183

E-29 1" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-44 50| ea| $ 2952 | § 2945 |9 3029 | % 2983 | % 29.30
E-30 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-66 12| ea NOBID | $ 6828 | $ 6899 | § 67.94 | § 66.91
E-31 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-66 12| ea NOBID | $ 76.70 | $ 77.46 | $ 76.28 | § 7517
E-32 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-66 12| ea NOBID | $ 5335 | % 5392 | § 53.11| % 52.31
E-33 1 1/2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-66 12| ea NOBID | $ 8708 | $ 8795 % 8935 | % 85.32
E-34 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-14-77 12| ea| $ 80.03 | § 8130 $ 8211 $ 80.86 | $ 79.68
E-35 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-44-77 12| ea| $ 10196 | $ 10355 | § 10461 | $ 103.02 | $ 101.47
E-36 2" Pack Joint Coupling C-84-77 18l ea| § 76.58 | § 7700 | $ 7856 | $ 7773 | $ 76.22
E-37 2" Pack Joint Coupling L-14-77 12| ea| $ 13574 | $ 136.35| § 13917 | $ 1370519 135.01
E-38 2" Pack Joint Coupling L-44-77 12| ea| $ 21280 | $ 213.00 | $ 21832 | § 21498 | $ 211.79
E-39 2" Pack Joint Coupling L-84-77 12| ea| $ 12286 | $ 12350 | § 12605 $ 124131 $ 122.28
E-40 3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Comp Tee T-444-333 12| ea| $ 4776 | § 4760 | $ 4900 $ 4826 | $ 47.53
E-41 1"x1"x1" Comp Tee T-444-444 12| ea| $ 5107 | $ 5155 % 52391 § 51.60 | $ 50.86
E-42 1" x 3/4" Brass Bushing CC Thread 100] ea NOBID | § 18.00 | § 1792 | 17.66 NO BID




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION E:

BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS;I‘:\Iw::’f':TER
: Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY
L Estimated . 580-370-6340
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long . Brandon Epps
v or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 ) 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183

E-43 1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing CC Thread 12| ea NOBID | $ 47.50 4852 | $ 47.79 NO BID
E-44 2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 12| ea NOBID | § 62,15 59.05| $ 58.16 NO BID
£-45 3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea NOBID | $ 475 NO BiD NO BID NO BID
E-46 1"x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea NOBID | $ 7.35 NO BID NO BID NO BiD
E-47 1-1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea NOBID | $ 12,20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
E-48 2" x 3" Brass Nipple 12| ea NOBID | $ 16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BiID
E-49 2" x 6" Brass Nipple 12| ea NOBID | $ 27,00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3/4" Copper Setter
E-50 VB72-12W.44-33 50| ea NOBID | § 121.35 12258 | $ 12452 | $ 118.92

1" Copper Setler
E-51 \VB74-12W-d4-44 50| ea NOBID | § 336.60 24207 | $ 24590 | $ 234.86

1 1/2" Copper Setter
E-52 \VBB76.150-44-66 12| ea NOBID | § 1,113.05 111138 | § 112894 | $ 1,078.20

3 2" Copper Setter

E-53 VBB77-158-44.77 12| ea| $ 1,269.27 | $ 1,305,00 1,302.27 | $ 132285 % 1,263.42
E-54 Service Saddle 2"x1" CC 12| ea NOBID | $ 50.15 48.28 NOBID | $ 52.00
E-55 Service Saddle 4'x3/4" CC 6| ea NOBID | § 48.00 46,40 NOBID | $ 50.00
E-56 Service Saddle 4" x 1" CC 6| ea NOBID | $ 48.00 46.40 NOBID | $ 50.00




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION E: BRASS, COPPER, SERVICE SADDLES

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS:C'\:V\IAI;I(\)I:I::TER
. Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE UTILITY SUPPLY
L Estimated . 580-370-6340
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long . Brandon Epps
Y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 . 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918-203-0183
E-57 Service Saddle 4"x 1-1/2" CC 6| ea NOBID | § 52.00 | § 50.51 NOBID | $ 44.50
E-58 Service Saddle 4" x 2" CC 6| ea NOBID | § 58.00 | $ 55.88 NOBID | § 60.50
E-59 Service Saddle 6"x 3/4" CC 12| ea NOBID | § 5530 | $ 53,30 NOBID | $ 57.50
E-60 Service Saddle 6"x1" CC 50| ea NOBID | § 553018 53.30 NOBID | $ 57.50
E-61 Service Saddle 6"x 1-1/2" CC 6| ea NOBID | $ 60.05| $ 57.89 NOBID | $ 62.50
E-62 Service Saddle 6"x2" CC 6| ea NOBID | $ 6625 | $ 63.88 NOBID | $ 69.00
E-63 Service Saddie 8"x 3/4" CC 6| ea NOBID | $ 67.00 | $ 62.97 NOBID | $ 66.00
E-64 Service Saddle 8"x1" CC 50| ea NOBID | $ 67.00 [ $ 62.98 NOBID | $ 66.00
E-65 Service Saddle 8"x 1-1/2" CC 6| ea NOBID | § 7100 $ 68.16 NOBID | $ 73.00
E-66 Service Saddle 8"'x2"CC 6| ea NOBID | $ 78.00 | $ 74.36 NOBID | $ 80.00




2025-2026-001

WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD

TIE BID

CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY

TULSA WINWATER
Zach Wolfe

cuima | T WCT | COTESMAN || TORTUNE | w7 sueeLy
or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 R 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles %:;I;OC;OJ:)::
479-431-7750
Manhole Frames, Covers & Gaskst
F-1 8" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1687 5lea NOBID | § 476.00 NOBID | $ 40125 $ 327.00
F-2 7" Manhole Frame & Lid #R1797 10|ea NOBID | § 347.30 NOBID | § 29247 | $ 327.00
F-3 5" Manhole Frame & Lid #R300-24A 10lea | $ 34333 | $ 344.55 NOBID | § 34457 | $ 385.00
F-4 Manhole Frame & Lid #280-24 10|ea NOBID | § 345.00 NOBID | $ 34410 | 8% 385.00
F-5 Lamp Hole Box & Lid 10jea | $ 163.02 | $ 185.25 20405 | $ 207.28 | $ 167.00
Sewer Couplings (Hubs) INDIANA SEAL ONLY
F-6 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 25|ea NOBID | § 5.60 549 | 8 692 (% 5.90
F-7 4" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 50|ea NOBID | § 5.60 549 | § 69218 5.90
F-8 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 20|ea NOBID | $ 12.00 1165 | $ 1481 (% 11.80
F-9 6" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 40|ea NOBID | $ 12.00 1165| $ 1481 $ 11.90
F-10 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 30(ea NOBID | $ 18.45 1810 | § 2277 | $ 18.30
F-11 8" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 100|ea NOBID | $ 18.45 1810 | $ 2277 | % 18.30
F-12 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12|ea NOBID | $ 27.75 2717 | % 3419 | % 27.50




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY 0L SN ER
Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-8340 UTILITY SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long or Brandon Epps
y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 R 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 918:203-0183
F-13 10" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay to PVC 24|ea NOBID | $ 2775 | § 2717 | $ 3419 | $ 27.50
F-14 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling PVC to PVC 12|ea NOBID | § 32401 % 3171 8 3990 | $ 32,00
F-15 12" Rubber Sewer Coupling Clay lo PVC 12|ea NOBID | $ 3240 | § 371 8 3990 | § 32.00
Fittings & Tap Saddles
F-16 4" PVC 45" Elbow SCH 40 DWV 100|ea NOBID | $ 9451 % 926 | $ 1279 | § 10.00
F-17 4" PVC 22 1/2* Elbow SCH 40 DWV 24lea NOBID | $ 1470 | 1449 | § 19.99 | $ 11.50
F-18 6" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SOR 26 12|ea NOBID | $ 4650 | $ 411 | § 60.81|8% 48.50
F-19 8" PVC 45° Elbow w/gasket SDR 26 12|ea NOBID | $ 11310 | $ 109.60 | $ 156110 | § 124.00
F-20 6x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20|ea. NOBID | $ 4380 |8 4079 | $ 56.24 | § 46,25
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-21 Bx4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 40|ea. NOBID | § 58.80 | § 5430 | § 7488 | $ 61.50
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch




WATER WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIALS - BID TABULATION
2025-2026-001

SECTION F: MANHOLES, COUPLINGS, FITTINGS

LOW BIDDER - RECOMMEND AWARD TIE BID
CONSOLIDATED
PIPE & SUPPLY TULZS;Z":V\II::\:;QTER
Estimated Troy McCamish CORE & MAIN FORTILINE 580-370-6340 UTILITY SUPPLY
Item # Description Quantit 539-476-4727 Kenzie Joshua Long or Brandon Epps
y or 918-586-7100 918-445-0005 : 918-266-0209
Tyler Lyles Nicole Gorbert
479-431-7750 e LA
F-22 10x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 20|ea. NOBID | $ 8075 | $ 79.00 | $ 10891 | § 89.50
with SS Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-23 12x4 SDR 35 Saddle Tee, Gasket Skirt 12]ea. NOBID | $ 10560 | $ 98.00 | $ 9375 % 111.50
with S8 Straps, Sch 40 SW Branch
F-24 1 1/2" Preformed Flex Plastic - 10|bxs NOBID | § 155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gasket (Ram-Nek)
F-25 Romac Tap Saddle CB 4" 12|ea. NOBID | $ 120.00 NOBID | $ 131.39 NO BID
Outlet Fits 8" to 12" Pipe
F-26 Romac Tap Saddle CB 6" 12|ea NOBID | § 156.16 NOBID | § 175.18 NO BID
Outlet Fits 8" to 12" Pipe
F-27 4" Rubber Test Cap 20|ea. NOBID | $ 305|% 2731 % 338 |% 3.75
F-28 5" Rubber Test Cap 20|ea. NOBID|$ 4451 8 366 | % 453 |$ 4.50
F-29 3" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20|ea. NOBID | $ 10.50 NO BID NO BID NC BID
F-30 4" PVC Pop Up Clean Out Caps 20|ea. NOBID | $ 11.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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City of Bartlesville

Water Treatment Chemical Bid #2025-2026-002

Recommended Bid Award

LEGEND: SHADED AREA - RECOMMEND AWARD
. N y Coagulation Drying Bed o, Sodium Aqueous

CHEMICAL: Chlorine Gas Acid Permanganate Coagulant ACH Aid Pok B P N Carbon

Est. Quantity 60 TON | 50000LBS | 720TON | 12TOTES | 6O00DLGS | 15000LBS | 60000LBS | 450000LBE | GOTON |  4BOODLES |
|Airgas Specialies $278.80
Baker Services, Inc. $278
N $2,779.50 $246 $1,484.00 s2.64 $0.8167 $0.2313 $1.140
Carus LLC $1.020
Chemite Inc. $268 $1.350
ff;mtnde Cemicals US 860 1 $1,736.00
Hawkins Inc. $2,380 $4.99 $1,911.25 $2.38
Jacobi Carbons, Inc. $1.060
Pennco, Inc. $2.780
Polydyne Inc. 2632
Shannon Chemical Corp. $3.77 $0.877
Solenis, LLC 243" 1813
Univer Solutians USA 52.90 $4.96 $2.52 $0.2338
LLC
USALCO, LLC $710 $1,756.42
Water Tech, Inc. 210°
Net Cost Difference from Last Year

$1,056,400.00 Price Last FY
51,191,607 00 Price this FY - willinng the higher unit price for coagulation ald and drying bed polymer _ (if we are able to utlize the Solenis products, this will save $9,750)
$133,507.00 Cost Difference from last FY' 12.61% Percent increase
Notes: 1) Based on previous bench testing and frials between the C and USALCO producls, the G product produced effective results at a dosage approximately

25% lower than that of USALCO, Although the unit price for the Chemlrade product is higher, the overall annual cost would be lower due to the reduced dosage requirements

2) Solenis is a new bidder for the Cily, and while their product appears to meet the sp

itis a product

to staff and we have not conducted any lesting or trials on it. Slaff

recommends awarding the bid to both Solenis and Polydyne, the current vendor for this product. This will allow staff to conduct Irials with the Solenis product to evaluate ils compatibility and
effectiveness before utilizing the product in full scale

3) Solenis is a new bidder for the City, and while their product appears lo meet the

slaff has not

any testing or frials with their product. Staff recommends awarding the bid lo

both Solenis and Water Tech, the current vendor for this product. This will allow slaff to conduct trials with the Solenis product to evaluate its compatibility and effectveness belare ulifiing the
produclin full scale,



